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entry of appearance with the Secretary 
to the Commission, as provided in 
section 201.11 of the Commission’s 
rules, no later than 21 days prior to the 
hearing date specified in this notice. A 
party that filed a notice of appearance 
during the preliminary phase of the 
investigations need not file an 
additional notice of appearance during 
this final phase. The Secretary will 
maintain a public service list containing 
the names and addresses of all persons, 
or their representatives, who are parties 
to the investigation. 

Limited disclosure of business 
proprietary information (BPI) under an 
administrative protective order (APO) 
and BPI service list.—Pursuant to 
section 207.7(a) of the Commission’s 
rules, the Secretary will make BPI 
gathered in the final phase of these 
investigations available to authorized 
applicants under the APO issued in the 
investigations, provided that the 
application is made no later than 21 
days prior to the hearing date specified 
in this notice. Authorized applicants 
must represent interested parties, as 
defined by 19 U.S.C. 1677(9), who are 
parties to the investigations. A party 
granted access to BPI in the preliminary 
phase of the investigations need not 
reapply for such access. A separate 
service list will be maintained by the 
Secretary for those parties authorized to 
receive BPI under the APO. 

Staff report.—The prehearing staff 
report in the final phase of these 
investigations will be placed in the 
nonpublic record on September 4, 2013, 
and a public version will be issued 
thereafter, pursuant to section 207.22 of 
the Commission’s rules. 

Hearing.—The Commission will hold 
a hearing in connection with the final 
phase of these investigations beginning 
at 9:30 a.m. on September 19, 2013, at 
the U.S. International Trade 
Commission Building. Requests to 
appear at the hearing should be filed in 
writing with the Secretary to the 
Commission on or before September 16, 
2013. A nonparty who has testimony 
that may aid the Commission’s 
deliberations may request permission to 
present a short statement at the hearing. 
All parties and nonparties desiring to 
appear at the hearing and make oral 
presentations should attend a 
prehearing conference to be held at 9:30 
a.m. on September 17, 2013, at the U.S. 
International Trade Commission 
Building. Oral testimony and written 
materials to be submitted at the public 
hearing are governed by sections 
201.6(b)(2), 201.13(f), and 207.24 of the 
Commission’s rules. Parties must submit 
any request to present a portion of their 
hearing testimony in camera no later 

than 7 business days prior to the date of 
the hearing. 

Written submissions.—Each party 
who is an interested party shall submit 
a prehearing brief to the Commission. 
Prehearing briefs must conform with the 
provisions of section 207.23 of the 
Commissions rules; the deadline for 
filing is September 11, 2013. Parties 
may also file written testimony in 
connection with their presentation at 
the hearing, as provided in section 
207.24 of the Commissions rules, and 
posthearing briefs, which must conform 
with the provisions of section 207.25 of 
the Commissions rules. The deadline for 
filing posthearing briefs is September 
25, 2013. In addition, any person who 
has not entered an appearance as a party 
to the investigations may submit a 
written statement of information 
pertinent to the subject of the 
investigations, including statements of 
support or opposition to the petition, on 
or before September 25, 2013. On 
October 18, 2013, the Commission will 
make available to parties all information 
on which they have not had an 
opportunity to comment. Parties may 
submit final comments on this 
information on or before October 22, 
2013, but such final comments must not 
contain new factual information and 
must otherwise comply with section 
207.30 of the Commissions rules. All 
written submissions must conform with 
the provisions of section 201.8 of the 
Commissions rules; any submissions 
that contain BPI must also conform with 
the requirements of sections 201.6, 
207.3, and 207.7 of the Commissions 
rules. Please be aware that the 
Commission’s rules with respect to 
electronic filing have been amended. 
The amendments took effect on 
November 7, 2011. See 76 Fed. Reg. 
61937 (Oct. 6, 2011) and the newly 
revised Commission’s Handbook on E- 
Filing, available on the Commission’s 
Web site at http://edis.usitc.gov. 

Additional written submissions to the 
Commission, including requests 
pursuant to section 201.12 of the 
Commissions rules, shall not be 
accepted unless good cause is shown for 
accepting such submissions, or unless 
the submission is pursuant to a specific 
request by a Commissioner or 
Commission staff. 

In accordance with sections 201.16(c) 
and 207.3 of the Commissions rules, 
each document filed by a party to the 
investigations must be served on all 
other parties to the investigations (as 
identified by either the public or BPI 
service list), and a certificate of service 
must be timely filed. The Secretary will 
not accept a document for filing without 
a certificate of service. 

Authority: These investigations are being 
conducted under authority of title VII of the 
Tariff Act of 1930; this notice is published 
pursuant to section 207.21 of the 
Commissions rules. 

Issued: June 13, 2013. 
By order of the Commission. 

Lisa R. Barton, 
Acting Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14525 Filed 6–18–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Antitrust Division 

Notice Pursuant to the National 
Cooperative Research and Production 
Act of 1993—Ford Motor Company and 
General Motors Holdings LLC 
Collaboration 

Notice is hereby given that, on May 
23, 2013, pursuant to Section 6(a) of the 
National Cooperative Research and 
Production Act of 1993, 15 U.S.C. 4301 
et seq. (‘‘the Act’’), Ford Motor 
Company and General Motors Holdings 
LLC Collaboration (‘‘Ford and GM’’) has 
filed written notifications 
simultaneously with the Attorney 
General and the Federal Trade 
Commission disclosing (1) the identities 
of the parties to the venture and (2) the 
nature and objectives of the venture. 
The notifications were filed for the 
purpose of invoking the Act’s provisions 
limiting the recovery of antitrust 
plaintiffs to actual damages under 
specified circumstances. 

Pursuant to Section 6(b) of the Act, 
the identities of the parties to the 
venture are: Ford Motor Company, 
Dearborn, MI; and General Motors 
Holding LLC, Detroit, MI. The general 
area of Ford and GM’s planned activity 
is the research, development, and 
production of fuel efficient automatic 
transmissions. 

Patricia A. Brink, 
Director of Civil Enforcement, Antitrust 
Division. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14605 Filed 6–18–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice 13–066] 

Notice of Intent To Grant Exclusive 
License. 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of Intent to Grant 
Exclusive License. 
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SUMMARY: This notice is issued in 
accordance with 35 U.S.C. 209(e) and 37 
CFR 404.7(a)(1)(i). NASA hereby gives 
notice of its intent to grant an exclusive 
license in the United States to practice 
the invention described and claimed in 
U.S. Patent No. 7,781,492; NASA Case 
No. KSC–12848 entitled ‘‘Foam/Aerogel 
Composite Materials for Thermal and 
Acoustic Insulation and Cryogen 
Storage,’’ to XTherm LP, having its 
principal place of business at 1325 
White Drive, Titusville, FL 32780. The 
patent rights in this invention have been 
assigned to the United States of America 
as represented by the Administrator of 
the National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. The prospective 
exclusive license will comply with the 
terms and conditions of 35 U.S.C. 209 
and 37 CFR 404.7. 

DATES: The prospective exclusive 
license may be granted unless, within 
fifteen (15) days from the date of this 
published notice, NASA receives 
written objections including evidence 
and argument that establish that the 
grant of the license would not be 
consistent with the requirements of 35 
U.S.C. 209 and 37 CFR 404.7. 
Competing applications completed and 
received by NASA within fifteen (15) 
days of the date of this published notice 
will also be treated as objections to the 
grant of the contemplated exclusive 
license. 

Objections submitted in response to 
this notice will not be made available to 
the public for inspection and, to the 
extent permitted by law, will not be 
released under the Freedom of 
Information Act, 5 U.S.C. 552. 

ADDRESSES: Objections relating to the 
prospective license may be submitted to 
Patent Counsel, Office of the Chief 
Counsel, Mail Code CC–A, NASA John 
F. Kennedy Space Center, Kennedy 
Space Center, FL 32899. Telephone: 
321–867–2076; Facsimile: 321–867– 
1817. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Shelley Ford, Patent Attorney, Office of 
the Chief Counsel, Mail Code CC–A, 
NASA John F. Kennedy Space Center, 
Kennedy Space Center, FL 32899. 
Telephone: 321–867–2076; Facsimile: 
321–867–1817. Information about other 
NASA inventions available for licensing 
can be found online at http:// 
technology.nasa.gov/. 

Sumara M. Thompson-King, 
Deputy General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14566 Filed 6–18–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice 13–067] 

Notice of Intent To Grant Exclusive 
License. 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration. 
ACTION: Notice of Intent to Grant 
Exclusive License. 

SUMMARY: This notice is issued in 
accordance with 35 U.S.C. 209(e) and 37 
CFR 404.7(a)(1)(i). NASA hereby gives 
notice of its intent to grant an exclusive 
license in the United States to practice 
the invention described and claimed in 
U.S. Patent No. 6,967,051; NASA Case 
No. KSC–12092 entitled ‘‘Thermal 
Insulation Systems,’’ and U.S. Patent 
Application No. 61/776,639; NASA Case 
No. KSC–13777 entitled ‘‘Layered 
Composite Thermal Insulation System 
for Non-Vacuum Applications,’’ to 
XTherm LP, having its principal place 
of business at 1325 White Drive, 
Titusville, FL 32780. The patent rights 
in this invention have been assigned to 
the United States of America as 
represented by the Administrator of the 
National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration. The prospective 
exclusive license will comply with the 
terms and conditions of 35 U.S.C. 209 
and 37 CFR 404.7. 
DATES: The prospective exclusive 
license may be granted unless, within 
fifteen (15) days from the date of this 
published notice, NASA receives 
written objections including evidence 
and argument that establish that the 
grant of the license would not be 
consistent with the requirements of 35 
U.S.C. 209 and 37 CFR 404.7. 
Competing applications completed and 
received by NASA within fifteen (15) 
days of the date of this published notice 
will also be treated as objections to the 
grant of the contemplated exclusive 
license. 

Objections submitted in response to 
this notice will not be made available to 
the public for inspection and, to the 
extent permitted by law, will not be 
released under the Freedom of 
Information Act, 5 U.S.C. 552. 
ADDRESSES: Objections relating to the 
prospective license may be submitted to 
Patent Counsel, Office of the Chief 
Counsel, Mail Code CC–A, NASA John 
F. Kennedy Space Center, Kennedy 
Space Center, FL 32899. Telephone: 
321–867–2076; Facsimile: 321–867– 
1817. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Shelley Ford, Patent Attorney, Office of 
the Chief Counsel, Mail Code CC–A, 

NASA John F. Kennedy Space Center, 
Kennedy Space Center, FL 32899. 
Telephone: 321–867–2076; Facsimile: 
321–867–1817. Information about other 
NASA inventions available for licensing 
can be found online at http:// 
technology.nasa.gov/. 

Sumara M. Thompson-King, 
Deputy General Counsel. 
[FR Doc. 2013–14565 Filed 6–18–13; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7510–13–P 

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND 
SPACE ADMINISTRATION 

[Notice 13–068] 

Aerospace Safety Advisory Panel; 
Meeting 

AGENCY: National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration (NASA). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, Public 
Law 92–463, as amended, the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administration 
announce a forthcoming meeting of the 
Aerospace Safety Advisory Panel 
(ASAP). 

DATES: Friday, July 12, 2013, 09:00– 
10:00 a.m., Local Time. 
ADDRESSES: NASA’s Marshall Space 
Flight Center, Educator Resource Center, 
U.S. Space & Rocket Center, Room 206, 
One Tranquility Base, Huntsville, AL 
35805 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ms. 
Harmony Myers, Aerospace Safety 
Advisory Panel Executive Director, 
National Aeronautics and Space 
Administration, Washington, DC 20546, 
(202) 358–1857. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Aerospace Safety Advisory Panel will 
hold its Third Quarterly Meeting for 
2013. This discussion is pursuant to 
carrying out its statutory duties for 
which the Panel reviews, identifies, 
evaluates, and advises on those program 
activities, systems, procedures, and 
management activities that can 
contribute to program risk. Priority is 
given to those programs that involve the 
safety of human flight. The agenda will 
include: 

• Explorations Systems Development 
• Commercial Crew Program 
• International Space Station 
• Mars Program Technologies and 

Asteroid Mission Overview 
The meeting will be open to the 

public up to the seating capacity of the 
room. Seating will be on a first-come 
basis. Visitors will be requested to sign 
a visitor’s register. Photographs will 
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