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(Formerly: Roche Biomedical 
Laboratories, Inc.) 

Laboratory Corporation of America 
Holdings, 1904 TW Alexander Drive, 
Research Triangle Park, NC 27709, 
919–572–6900/800–833–3984, 
(Formerly: LabCorp Occupational 
Testing Services, Inc., CompuChem 
Laboratories, Inc.; CompuChem 
Laboratories, Inc., A Subsidiary of 
Roche Biomedical Laboratory; Roche 
CompuChem Laboratories, Inc., A 
Member of the Roche Group) 

Laboratory Corporation of America 
Holdings, 1120 Main Street, 
Southaven, MS 38671, 866–827–8042/ 
800–233–6339, (Formerly: LabCorp 
Occupational Testing Services, Inc.; 
MedExpress/National Laboratory 
Center) 

LabOne, Inc. d/b/a Quest Diagnostics, 
10101 Renner Blvd., Lenexa, KS 
66219, 913–888–3927/800–873–8845, 
(Formerly: Quest Diagnostics 
Incorporated; LabOne, Inc.; Center for 
Laboratory Services, a Division of 
LabOne, Inc.) 

Legacy Laboratory Services Toxicology, 
1225 NE 2nd Ave., Portland, OR 
97232, 503–413–5295/800–950–5295 

MedTox Laboratories, Inc., 402 W. 
County Road D, St. Paul, MN 55112, 
651–636–7466/800–832–3244 

Minneapolis Veterans Affairs Medical 
Center, Forensic Toxicology 
Laboratory, 1 Veterans Drive, 
Minneapolis, MN 55417, 612–725– 
2088. Testing for Veterans Affairs 
(VA) Employees Only 

Pacific Toxicology Laboratories, 9348 
DeSoto Ave., Chatsworth, CA 91311, 
800–328–6942, (Formerly: Centinela 
Hospital Airport Toxicology 
Laboratory) 

Phamatech, Inc., 15175 Innovation 
Drive, San Diego, CA 92128, 888– 
635–5840 

Quest Diagnostics Incorporated, 400 
Egypt Road, Norristown, PA 19403, 
610–631–4600/877–642–2216, 
(Formerly: SmithKline Beecham 
Clinical Laboratories; SmithKline Bio- 
Science Laboratories) 

U.S. Army Forensic Toxicology Drug 
Testing Laboratory, 2490 Wilson St., 
Fort George G. Meade, MD 20755– 
5235, 301–677–7085, Testing for 
Department of Defense (DoD) 
Employees Only 
* The Standards Council of Canada 

(SCC) voted to end its Laboratory 
Accreditation Program for Substance 
Abuse (LAPSA) effective May 12, 1998. 
Laboratories certified through that 
program were accredited to conduct 
forensic urine drug testing as required 
by U.S. Department of Transportation 
(DOT) regulations. As of that date, the 

certification of those accredited 
Canadian laboratories will continue 
under DOT authority. The responsibility 
for conducting quarterly performance 
testing plus periodic on-site inspections 
of those LAPSA-accredited laboratories 
was transferred to the U.S. HHS, with 
the HHS’ NLCP contractor continuing to 
have an active role in the performance 
testing and laboratory inspection 
processes. Other Canadian laboratories 
wishing to be considered for the NLCP 
may apply directly to the NLCP 
contractor just as U.S. laboratories do. 

Upon finding a Canadian laboratory to 
be qualified, HHS will recommend that 
DOT certify the laboratory (Federal 
Register, July 16, 1996) as meeting the 
minimum standards of the Mandatory 
Guidelines published in the Federal 
Register on January 23, 2017 (82 FR 
7920). After receiving DOT certification, 
the laboratory will be included in the 
monthly list of HHS-certified 
laboratories and participate in the NLCP 
certification maintenance program. 

Anastasia Marie Donovan, 
Public Health Advisor, Division of Workplace 
Programs. 
[FR Doc. 2022–14119 Filed 6–30–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4160–20–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Customs and Border Protection 

[1651–0092] 

Application for Withdrawal of Bonded 
Stores for Fishing Vessels and 
Certificate of Use (CBP Form 5125) 

AGENCY: U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection (CBP), Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice and request for 
comments; extension without change of 
an existing collection of information. 

SUMMARY: U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection, Department of Homeland 
Security, will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA). The 
information collection is published in 
the Federal Register to obtain comments 
from the public and affected agencies. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
must be submitted (no later than August 
1, 2022) to be assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and/or 
suggestions regarding the item(s) 
contained in this notice should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 

notice to https://www.reginfo.gov/ 
public/do/PRAMain. Find this 
particular information collection by 
selecting ‘‘Currently under 30-day 
Review—Open for Public Comments’’ or 
by using the search function. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional PRA information 
should be directed to Seth Renkema, 
Chief, Economic Impact Analysis 
Branch, U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection, Office of Trade, Regulations 
and Rulings, 90 K Street NE, 10th Floor, 
Washington, DC 20229–1177, 
Telephone number 202–325–0056 or via 
email CBP_PRA@cbp.dhs.gov. Please 
note that the contact information 
provided here is solely for questions 
regarding this notice. Individuals 
seeking information about other CBP 
programs should contact the CBP 
National Customer Service Center at 
877–227–5511, (TTY) 1–800–877–8339, 
or CBP website at https://www.cbp. 
gov/. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: CBP 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to comment on the 
proposed and/or continuing information 
collections pursuant to the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501 
et seq.). This proposed information 
collection was previously published in 
the Federal Register (87 FR 13303) on 
March 09, 2022, allowing for a 60-day 
comment period. This notice allows for 
an additional 30 days for public 
comments. This process is conducted in 
accordance with 5 CFR 1320.8. Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: (1) whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (2) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
suggestions to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and (4) suggestions to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology, e.g., permitting 
electronic submission of responses. The 
comments that are submitted will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for approval. All comments will become 
a matter of public record. 
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Overview of This Information 
Collection 

Title: Application for Withdrawal of 
Bonded Stores for Fishing Vessels and 
Certificate of Use. 

OMB Number: 1651–0092. 
Form Number: CBP Form 5125. 
Current Actions: Extension without 

change of an existing information 
collection. 

Type of Review: Extension (without 
change). 

Affected Public: Carriers. 
Abstract: CBP Form 5125, Application 

for Withdrawal of Bonded Stores for 
Fishing Vessel and Certificate of Use, is 
used to request the permission of the 
CBP port director for the withdrawal 
and lading of bonded merchandise 
(especially alcoholic beverages) for use 
on board fishing vessels involved in 
international trade. The applicant must 
certify on CBP Form 5125 that supplies 
on board were either consumed, or that 
all unused quantities remain on board 
and are adequately secured for use on 
the next voyage. CBP uses this form to 
collect information such as the name 
and identification number of the vessel, 
ports of departure and destination, and 
information about the crew members. 
The information collected on this form 
is authorized by 19 U.S.C. 1309 and 
1317 and is provided for by 19 CFR 
10.59(e) and 10.65. CBP Form 5125 is 
accessible at: https://www.cbp.gov/ 
newsroom/publications/forms?
title=5125. 

Type of Information Collection: CBP 
Form 5125. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
500. 

Estimated Number of Annual 
Responses per Respondent: 1. 

Estimated Number of Total Annual 
Responses: 500. 

Estimated Time per Response: 20 
minutes (0.33 hours). 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 165. 

Dated: June 28, 2022. 
Seth D. Renkema, 
Branch Chief, Economic Impact Analysis 
Branch, U.S. Customs and Border Protection. 
[FR Doc. 2022–14158 Filed 6–30–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

[Docket Number DHS–2022–0043] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: DHS Hummingbird on 
ServiceNow Platform 

AGENCY: Department of Homeland 
Security (DHS). 

ACTION: 60-Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Homeland 
Security, will submit the following 
Information Collection Request (ICR) to 
the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and clearance in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted until August 30, 2022. 
This process is conducted in accordance 
with 5 CFR 1320.1. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by docket number Docket # 
DHS–2022–0043, at: 

Æ Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Please follow the 
instructions for submitting comments. 

Instructions: All submissions received 
must include the agency name and 
docket number Docket # DHS–2022– 
0043. All comments received will be 
posted without change to http://
www.regulations.gov, including any 
personal information provided. 

Docket: For access to the docket to 
read background documents or 
comments received, go to http://
www.regulations.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Department of Homeland Security 
(DHS) Headquarters (HQ) Hummingbird 
program is a U.S. Government program, 
initiated in July 2021 pursuant to the 
Presidential Memorandum on the 
Designation of the Department of 
Homeland Security as Lead Federal 
Department for Facilitating the Entry of 
Vulnerable Afghans into the United 
States and in support of Operation 
Allies Welcome (OAW). DHS, in 
coordination with the Department of 
State (DOS), is supporting screening, 
processing and resettlement efforts for 
individuals coming from Afghanistan 
who are neither U.S. citizens nor lawful 
permanent residents. This includes 
initial screening and vetting prior to 
entering the U.S., managing 
humanitarian parole, issuing special 
immigrant visas, processing at pre- 
designated U.S. military bases, 
applications for immigration status, 
work authorization, and essential 
coverage, and resettlement assistance. 
The legal authority for this program is 
provided under Section 402, of the 
Homeland Security Act of 2002, as 
revised (Pub. L. 107–296) (6 U.S.C. 202). 

DHS remains committed to building a 
safe, orderly, and humane immigration 
system that upholds our laws and 
values. All information, including PII, 
entered by applicants and parolees into 
the Hummingbird system will be used 
by DHS employees and staff to 

determine an applicant’s eligibility to 
apply for a SIV through OAW, and to 
assist with processing and resettlement 
of parolees. 

Hummingbird allows DHS to track 
applicants through applicable stages of 
case processing at U.S. military bases, 
view case information and applicant 
biodata, update and track completion of 
various processing activities on base, 
and use the searching and filtering 
capabilities to produce reports. 
Therefore, DHS is establishing the 
Hummingbird System. 

The purpose of this effort is to 
provide centralized and standardized 
tracking and reporting for OAW, 
including resettlement progress. 
Afghans who are eligible for SIVs are 
those that took significant risks to 
support U.S. military and civilian 
personnel in Afghanistan, employed by 
or on behalf of the U.S. government or 
coalition forces in Afghanistan, or are a 
family member of someone who did. 

The information, including PII, 
collected and used by the Hummingbird 
application on the ServiceNow platform 
will be able to be shared, disseminated, 
and viewed by the following: 
• DHS Partners: 

Æ United States Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS) 

• Federal Partners: 
Æ Department of State (DOS) 
Æ Health and Human Services 

• International Partners: 
Æ International Organization for 

Migration (IOM) 
The NGOs accessing the system as 

Task Force Users are under DoS IRC’s 
umbrella/management. There are a host 
of individuals with day jobs at different 
organizations who access to 
Hummingbird but their work at safe 
havens in Hummingbird is on behalf of 
IRC.Non-Government Organizations and 
Private Sector Organizations With 
RolemBased Access: 
• International Organization for 

Migration (IOM) 
• Church World Service (CWS) 
• World Relief (WR) 
• International Rescue Committee (IRC) 
• HIAS (formerly Hebrew Immigrant 

Aid Society) 
• United States Conference of Catholic 

Bishops (USCCB) 
• Ethiopian Community Development 

Council (ECDC) 
• Episcopal Migration Ministries 

(DFMS/EMM) 
• U.S. Committee for Refugees and 

Immigrants (USCRI) 
• Lutheran Immigration and Refugee 

Services (LIRS) 
• Community Sponsorship Hub 
• State Afghan Placement and 

Assistance (SAPA) 
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