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instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the e-Filing link.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–368 Filed 2–23–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP04–166–000] 

Trunkline Gas Company, LLC; Notice 
of Proposed Changes in FERC Gas 
Tariff 

February 18, 2004. 
Take notice that on February 12, 2004, 

Trunkline Gas Company, LLC 
(Trunkline) tendered for filing as part of 
its FERC Gas Tariff, Third Revised 
Volume No. 1, the following revised 
tariff sheets to become effective March 
14, 2004:
First Revised Sheet No. 269 
First Revised Sheet No. 270

Trunkline states that this filing is to 
revise the right of first refusal (ROFR) 
provisions in section 11.3 of the General 
Terms and Conditions of Trunkline’s 
tariff to clarify its rights to allow a 
contractual ROFR when a service 
agreement might otherwise not be 
eligible for such rights. 

Trunkline further states that copies of 
this filing are being served on all 
affected customers and applicable state 
regulatory agencies. 

Any person desiring to be heard or to 
protest said filing should file a motion 
to intervene or a protest with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with sections 
385.214 or 385.211 of the Commission’s 
Rules and Regulations. All such motions 
or protests must be filed in accordance 
with section 154.210 of the 
Commission’s Regulations. Protests will 
be considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceedings. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
must file a motion to intervene. This 
filing is available for review at the 
Commission in the Public Reference 
Room or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov using the eLibrary. Enter 
the docket number excluding the last 
three digits in the docket number field 
to access the document. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll-
free at (866) 208–3676, or TTY, contact 

(202) 502–8659. The Commission 
strongly encourages electronic filings. 
See, 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the e-Filing link.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–370 Filed 2–23–04;8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. ER04–350–000] 

XL Trading Partners America LLC; 
Notice of Issuance of Order 

February 17, 2004. 
XL Trading Partners America LLC (XL 

Trading) filed an application for market-
based rate authority, with an 
accompanying tariff. The proposed tariff 
provides for wholesale sales of capacity, 
energy, and ancillary services at market-
based rates. XL Trading also requested 
waiver of various Commission 
regulations. In particular, XL Trading 
requested that the Commission grant 
blanket approval under 18 CFR Part 34 
of all future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability by the XL 
Trading. 

On February 9, 2004, pursuant to 
delegated authority, the Director, 
Division of Tariffs and Market 
Development—South, granted the 
request for blanket approval under Part 
34, subject to the following: 

Any person desiring to be heard or to 
protest the blanket approval of 
issuances of securities or assumptions of 
liability by XL Trading should file a 
motion to intervene or protest with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214). 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing motions to intervene 
or protests, as set forth above, is March 
10, 2004. 

Absent a request to be heard in 
opposition by the deadline above, XL 
Tading is authorized to issue securities 
and assume obligations or liabilities as 
a guarantor, indorser, surety, or 
otherwise in respect of any security of 
another person; provided that such 
issuance or assumption is for some 
lawful object within the corporate 
purposes of XL Trading, compatible 
with the public interest, and is 

reasonably necessary or appropriate for 
such purposes. 

The Commission reserves the right to 
require a further showing that neither 
public nor private interests will be 
adversely affected by continued 
approval of XL Trading’s issuances of 
securities or assumptions of liability. 

Copies of the full text of the Order are 
available from the Commission’s Public 
Reference Branch, 888 First Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. The Order may 
also be viewed on the Commission’s 
Web site at http://www.ferc.gov, using 
the e library (FERRIS) link. Enter the 
docket number excluding the last three 
digits in the docket number filed to 
access the document. Comments, 
protests, and interventions may be filed 
electronically via the internet in lieu of 
paper. See, 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) 
and the instructions on the 
Commission’s Web site under the ‘‘e-
Filing’’ link. The Commission strongly 
encourages electronic filings.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–356 Filed 2–23–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EC04–64–000, et al.] 

Denver City Energy Associates, L.P., et 
al.; Electric Rate and Corporate Filings 

February 13, 2004. 

The following filings have been made 
with the Commission. The filings are 
listed in ascending order within each 
docket classification. 

1. Denver City Energy Associates, L.P. 

[Docket No. EC04–64–000] 

Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 
Denver City Energy Associates, L.P. 
(DCE) filed with the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission an application 
pursuant to section 203 of the Federal 
Power Act for authorization of an 
indirect disposition of jurisdictional 
facilities in connection with the sale by 
United States Power Fund, L.P. to 
UnionBanCal Equities, Inc. DCE states 
that it request confidential treatment of 
a document submitted therewith. 

DCE states that copies of the 
application were served upon the Public 
Utility Commission of Texas and 
Golden Spread Electrical Cooperative, 
Inc. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004.

VerDate jul<14>2003 18:42 Feb 23, 2004 Jkt 203001 PO 00000 Frm 00030 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\24FEN1.SGM 24FEN1



8399Federal Register / Vol. 69, No. 36 / Tuesday, February 24, 2004 / Notices 

2. ALLETE, Inc. 

[Docket No. EL04–81–000] 

Take notice that on February 9, 2004, 
ALLETE, Inc. (ALLETE) tendered for 
filing a Petition for Declaratory Order 
pursuant to rule 207 of the 
Commission’s rules of practice and 
procedure, 18 CFR 385.207, seeking 
Commission ratification that: (i) The 
distribution to ALLETE’s shareholders 
of common stock of its indirect wholly-
owned non-utility subsidiary, ADESA 
Corporation is not prohibited by section 
305(a) of the Federal Power Act; and (ii) 
the manner in which ALLETE proposes 
to account for the distribution is 
acceptable and in accordance with the 
Uniform System of Accounts. 

Comment Date: March 1, 2004. 

3. BlueStar Energy Services, Inc. 

[Docket No. ER04–426–001] 

Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 
BlueStar Energy Services, Inc. (BlueStar) 
tendered for filing an amendment to its 
petition filed January 20, 2004, in 
Docket No. ER04–426–000. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004. 

4. PacifiCorp 

[Docket No. ER04–489–001] 

Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 
PacifiCorp tendered for filing in 
accordance with 18 CFR part 35 of the 
Commission’s rules and regulations an 
amendment to PacifiCorp’s December 
17, 2003, filing submitting proposed 
revisions to PacifiCorp’s market based 
rate tariff designated as FERC Electric 
Tariff, 4th Rev. Volume No. 12. 
PacifiCorp requests waiver of the 
Commission’s prior notice requirements 
so that the revisions may be effective on 
December 17, 2003. 

PacifiCorp states that copies of this 
filing have been supplied to all parties 
designated on the official service list 
compiled by the Secretary in this 
proceeding. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004. 

5. SWEPI LP 

[Docket No. ER04–547–000] 

Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 
SWEPI LP tendered for filing a Notice of 
Cancellation, of its FERC Electric Tariff, 
Original Volume No. 1, which was 
accepted by the Commission on October 
24, 2002, in Docket No. ER02–2558–000. 
SWEPI LP requests waiver of the 60-day 
notice period to allow the cancellation 
of its tariff to become effective 
immediately. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004. 

6. PJM Interconnection, L.L.C. 

[Docket No. ER04–548–000] 
Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 

PJM Interconnection, L.L.C. (PJM) 
submitted revisions to Schedule 9–2 
and Schedule 9–3 of the PJM Open 
Access Transmission Tariff (PJM Tariff) 
regarding the recovery of costs of 
administering Financial Transmission 
Rights and Market Support Services. 
PJM requests waiver of 18 CFR 35.3 to 
permit an effective date of April 1, 2004, 
for the proposed revisions to Schedule 
9–2. PJM requests an effective date of 
May 1, 2004, for the proposed revisions 
to Schedule 9–3. 

PJM states that copies of the filing 
were served on all PJM members and on 
the utility regulatory commissions in 
the PJM region. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004. 

7. Virginia Electric and Power 
Company 

[Docket No. ER04–549–000] 
Take notice that on February 11, 2004, 

Virginia Electric and Power Company, 
doing business as Dominion Virginia 
Power, tendered for filing its Large 
Generator Interconnection Procedures 
and Large Generator Interconnection 
Agreement in compliance with Order 
No. 2003 issued July 24, 2003, in Docket 
No. RM02–1–000 and Order Denying 
Stay and Granting Extension issued 7/
24/03 in Docket Nos. RM02–1–000 and 
001. Dominion Virginia Power requests 
an effective date of February 12, 2004. 

Dominion Virginia Power states that 
copies of the filing were served upon 
customers under Dominion Virginia 
Power’s open access transmission tariff, 
the Virginia State Corporation 
Commission and the North Carolina 
Utilities Commission. 

Comment Date: March 3, 2004. 

8. Aquila, Inc. 

[Docket No. ES04–13–000] 
Take notice that on February 9, 2004, 

Aquila, Inc. (Aquila) submitted an 
application pursuant to section 204 of 
the Federal Power Act to authorize 
Aquila to issue up to and including 
$500 million of secured and unsecured 
notes and other evidences of 
indebtedness. 

Comment Date: March 1, 2004. 

Standard Paragraph 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing should file with the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426, in accordance with rules 211 and 
214 of the Commission’s rules of 
practice and procedure (18 CFR 385.211 
and 385.214). Protests will be 

considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Any person wishing to become a party 
must file a motion to intervene. All such 
motions or protests should be filed on 
or before the comment date, and, to the 
extent applicable, must be served on the 
applicant and on any other person 
designated on the official service list. 
This filing is available for review at the 
Commission or may be viewed on the 
Commission’s Web site at http://
www.ferc.gov, using the ‘‘FERRIS’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
filed to access the document. For 
assistance, call (202) 502–8222 or TTY, 
(202) 502–8659. Protests and 
interventions may be filed electronically 
via the Internet in lieu of paper; see 18 
CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site under the ‘‘e-Filing’’ link. The 
Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filings.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–357 Filed 2–23–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EC04–650–000, et al.] 

GenWest LLC, et al.; Electric Rate and 
Corporate Filings 

February 17, 2004. 
The following filings have been made 

with the Commission. The filings are 
listed in ascending order within each 
docket classification. 

1. GenWest LLC 

[Docket No. EC04–65–000] 
Take notice that on February 13, 2004, 

GenWest LLC (GenWest) tendered for 
filing pursuant to section 203 of the 
Federal Power Act, an application for 
authorization for GenWest to transfer a 
25% undivided ownership interest in its 
Silverhawk Generating Facility to the 
Southern Nevada Water Authority on or 
after commercial operation. 

Comment Date: March 5, 2004. 

2. San Roque Power Corporation 

[Docket No. EG04–33–000] 
Take notice that on February 12, 2004, 

San Roque Power Corporation 
(Applicant), with its principal office at 
6766 Ayala Avenue, 1200 Makati City, 
Republic of the Philippines, filed with 
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