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(FECA), 5 U.S.C. 8101 et seq., the Black 
Lung Benefits Act (BLBA), 30 U.S.C. 901 
et seq., and the Energy Employees 
Occupational Illness Compensation 
Program Act of 2000 (EEOICPA), 42 
U.S.C. 7384 et seq. All three of these 
statutes require that OWCP pay for 
covered medical treatment provided to 
beneficiaries; this medical treatment can 
include medicinal drugs dispensed by 
pharmacies. In order to determine 
whether amounts billed for drugs are 
appropriate, OWCP must receive the 
required data elements, including the 
name of the patient/beneficiary, the 
National Drug Code (NDC) number of 
the drugs prescribed, the quantity 
provided, the prescription number and 
the date the prescription was filled. The 
regulations implementing these statutes 
require the collection of information 
needed to enable OWCP to determine if 
bills for drugs submitted directly by 
pharmacies, or reimbursement requests 
submitted by claimants, should be paid. 
There is no standardized paper form for 
submission of the billing information 
collected in this Information Collection 
Request (ICR). Over the past several 
years, almost all pharmacy bills 
submitted to OWCP have been 
submitted electronically using one of 
the industry-wide standard formats for 
the electronic transmission of billing 
data through nationwide data 
clearinghouses devised by the National 
Council for Prescription Drug Programs 
(NCPDP). None of the electronic billing 
formats have been designed by or 
provided by OWCP; they are billing 
formats commonly accepted by other 
Federal programs and in the private 
health insurance industry for drugs. 
Nonetheless, the three programs (FECA, 
BLBA and EEOICPA) provide 
instructions for the submission of 
necessary pharmacy bill data elements 
in provider manuals distributed or made 
available to all pharmacies enrolled in 
the programs. 

This information collection is subject 
to the PRA. A Federal agency generally 
cannot conduct or sponsor a collection 
of information, and the public is 
generally not required to respond to an 
information collection, unless it is 
approved by the OMB under the PRA 
and displays a currently valid OMB 
Control Number. In addition, 
notwithstanding any other provisions of 
law, no person shall generally be subject 
to penalty for failing to comply with a 
collection of information that does not 
display a valid Control Number. See 5 
CFR 1320.5(a) and 1320.6. 

Interested parties are encouraged to 
provide comments to the contact shown 
in the ADDRESSES section. Comments 
must be written to receive 

consideration, and they will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for OMB approval of the final ICR. In 
order to help ensure appropriate 
consideration, comments should 
mention 1240–0050. 

Submitted comments will also be a 
matter of public record for this ICR and 
posted on the internet, without 
redaction. The DOL encourages 
commenters not to include personally 
identifiable information, confidential 
business data, or other sensitive 
statements/information in any 
comments. 

The DOL is particularly interested in 
comments that: 

• Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

• Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

• Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

• Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Agency: DOL–OWCP. 
Type of Review: Extension. 
Title of Collection: Pharmacy Billing 

Requirements. 
OMB Control Number: 1240–0050. 
Affected Public: Individuals or 

households. 
Estimated Number of Respondents: 

874,414. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Total Estimated Annual Responses: 

874,414. 
Estimated Average Time per 

Response: 1 minute. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 14,481. 
Total Estimated Annual Other Cost 

Burden: $784,103.58. 
Authority: 44 U.S.C. 3506(c)(2)(A). 

Anjanette Suggs, 
Agency Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08224 Filed 4–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4510–CR–P 

NATIONAL CREDIT UNION 
ADMINISTRATION 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; Proof 
of Concept Application for New 
Charter Organizing Groups 

AGENCY: National Credit Union 
Administration (NCUA). 
ACTION: Notice and request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The National Credit Union 
Administration (NCUA), as part of a 
continuing effort to reduce paperwork 
and respondent burden, invites the 
general public and other Federal 
agencies to comment on the following 
extension of a currently approved 
collection, as required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 
DATES: Written comments should be 
received on or before June 17, 2022 to 
be assured consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments on 
the information collection to Dawn 
Wolfgang, National Credit Union 
Administration, 1775 Duke Street, Suite 
6032, Alexandria, Virginia 22314; email 
at PRAComments@NCUA.gov. Given the 
limited in-house staff because of the 
COVID–19 pandemic, email comments 
are preferred. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Address requests for additional 
information to Dawn Wolfgang at the 
address above or telephone 703–548– 
2279. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
OMB Number: 3133–0202. 
Title: Proof of Concept Application 

(POC) for New Charter Organizing 
Groups. 

Type of Review: Extension of a 
currently approved collection. 

Abstract: The Office of Credit Union 
Resources and Expansion (CURE) is 
responsible for the review and approval 
of charter applications submitted by 
organizing groups. CURE has 
implemented a charter modernization 
process to improve the quality of charter 
applications received. This will help 
ensure organizing groups submit a well- 
thought out, well-developed charter 
plan to minimize the back-and-forth 
communication and improve overall 
chartering processing times. CURE 
management implemented the Proof of 
Concept (POC) data collection through 
the CyberGrants system, which 
documents the four most critical 
elements for establishing a new charter. 
This is ‘‘Phase 1’’ of the process. The 
CyberGrants system is accessed online. 

The four areas are usually the greatest 
challenge for organizers to accomplish. 
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When the organizers successfully 
address the four critical elements, 
organizing groups are invited to proceed 
to ‘‘Phase 2’’, submission of most 
remaining charter documents and plans. 

The ‘‘Phase 1’’ data is reviewed by 
NCUA to determine the adequacy of a 
group’s chartering concept and to 
provide guidance as needed. The 
purpose of this information collection is 
to identify the level of understanding an 
organizing group has before they make 
a formal charter application submission 
as prescribed by Appendix B to 12 CFR 
part 701 (12 U.S.C. 1758, 1759). 

Affected Public: Private Sector: Not- 
for-profit institutions. 

Estimated No. of Respondents: 26. 
Estimated No. of Responses per 

Respondent: 1. 
Estimated Total Annual Responses: 

26. 
Estimated Burden Hours per 

Response: 4. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 104. 
Request for Comments: Comments 

submitted in response to this notice will 
be summarized and included in the 
request for Office of Management and 
Budget approval. All comments will 
become a matter of public record. The 
public is invited to submit comments 
concerning: (a) Whether the collection 
of information is necessary for the 
proper execution of the function of the 
agency, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 
(c) ways to enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of the 
information on the respondents, 
including the use of automated 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology. 

By Melane Conyers-Ausbrooks, 
Secretary of the Board, the National 
Credit Union Administration, on April 
12, 2022. 

Dated: April 13, 2022. 
Dawn D. Wolfgang, 
NCUA PRA Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08223 Filed 4–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7535–01–P 

NATIONAL SCIENCE FOUNDATION 

Proposal Review Panel for Physics; 
Notice of Meeting 

In accordance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (Pub. L. 92– 

463, as amended), the National Science 
Foundation (NSF) announces the 
following meeting: 

Name and Committee Code: LIGO 
Annual Site Visit Review of Operations 
for the Division of Physics (1208). 

Date and Time: All times are Pacific 
Daylight Time: 
June 1, 2022; 8:00 a.m.–5:30 p.m. 
June 2, 2022; 8:00 a.m.–11:00 a.m. 
June 2, 2022; 4:30 p.m.–5:30 p.m. 
June 3, 2022; 8:00 a.m.–10:30 a.m. 

Place: LIGO Hanford Observatory, 
127124 N Route 10, Richland, WA 
99354. 

Type of Meeting: Part-Open. 
Contact Person: Mark Coles, Program 

Director, Division of Physics, National 
Science Foundation, 2415 Eisenhower 
Avenue, Room 9219, Alexandria, VA 
22314; Telephone: (703) 292–4432. 

Purpose of Meeting: Site visit to 
provide an evaluation of the progress of 
the projects at the host site for the 
Division of Physics at the National 
Science Foundation. 

Agenda: Agenda (all times Pacific 
Daylight Time [PDT]): 

June 1 (Wednesday) 

8:00 a.m.–8:30 a.m.—Executive Session 
(Closed) 

8:30 a.m.–5:00 p.m.—Presentations by 
LIGO (Open) 

5:00 p.m.–5:30 p.m.—Executive Session 
(Closed) 

June 2 (Thursday) 

8:00 a.m.–8:30 a.m.—Executive Session 
(Closed) 

8:30 a.m.–11:00 a.m.—Presentations and 
discussion (Open) 

4:30 p.m.–5:30 p.m.—Discussion (Open) 

June 3 (Friday) 

8:00 a.m.–10:00 a.m.—Executive 
Session (Closed) 

10:00 a.m.–10:30 a.m.—Closeout 
presentation by review panel (Open) 
Reason for Closing: The work being 

reviewed during closed portions of the 
site visit include information of a 
proprietary or confidential nature, 
including technical information; 
financial data, such as salaries and 
personal information concerning 
individuals associated with the project. 
These matters are exempt under 5 
U.S.C. 552b(c), (4) and (6) of the 
Government in the Sunshine Act. 

Dated: April 13, 2022. 
Crystal Robinson, 
Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2022–08256 Filed 4–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7555–01–P 

POSTAL REGULATORY COMMISSION 

[Docket Nos. MC2022–52 and CP2022–56] 

New Postal Products 

AGENCY: Postal Regulatory Commission. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Commission is noticing a 
recent Postal Service filing for the 
Commission’s consideration concerning 
a negotiated service agreement. This 
notice informs the public of the filing, 
invites public comment, and takes other 
administrative steps. 
DATES: Comments are due: April 20, 
2022. 

ADDRESSES: Submit comments 
electronically via the Commission’s 
Filing Online system at http://
www.prc.gov. Those who cannot submit 
comments electronically should contact 
the person identified in the FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT section by 
telephone for advice on filing 
alternatives. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
David A. Trissell, General Counsel, at 
202–789–6820. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Table of Contents 

I. Introduction 
II. Docketed Proceeding(s) 

I. Introduction 

The Commission gives notice that the 
Postal Service filed request(s) for the 
Commission to consider matters related 
to negotiated service agreement(s). The 
request(s) may propose the addition or 
removal of a negotiated service 
agreement from the market dominant or 
the competitive product list, or the 
modification of an existing product 
currently appearing on the market 
dominant or the competitive product 
list. 

Section II identifies the docket 
number(s) associated with each Postal 
Service request, the title of each Postal 
Service request, the request’s acceptance 
date, and the authority cited by the 
Postal Service for each request. For each 
request, the Commission appoints an 
officer of the Commission to represent 
the interests of the general public in the 
proceeding, pursuant to 39 U.S.C. 505 
(Public Representative). Section II also 
establishes comment deadline(s) 
pertaining to each request. 

The public portions of the Postal 
Service’s request(s) can be accessed via 
the Commission’s website (http://
www.prc.gov). Non-public portions of 
the Postal Service’s request(s), if any, 
can be accessed through compliance 
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