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patents and claims: Claims 1–8, 11–15, 
18–19, 20–21, and 22 of the ’508 patent; 
claims 1–10 and 13–15 of the ’103 
patent; and claims 1–3, 9, 12, 16–18, 21, 
and 30 of the ’659 patent. 

On February 15, 2018, the ALJ issued 
the ID, which finds only MUV in 
violation of section 337, and only as to 
the ’508 and ’103 patents. The ALJ 
recommended that the Commission 
issue a limited exclusion order directed 
to MUV’s infringing products. The ALJ 
also recommended a bond of forty 
percent of entered value during the 
Presidential review period. See 19 
U.S.C. 1337(j)(3). 

On February 27–28, 2018, OUII, DSM, 
MUV, and OFS filed petitions for review 
of the ID, and on March 7–8, 2018, the 
parties filed responses to the petitions. 
On March 19, 2018, the private parties 
filed statements on the public interest. 
The Commission also received 
comments on the public interest from 
members of the public. 

Having examined the record in this 
investigation, including the ID, the 
petitions for review, and the responses 
thereto, the Commission has determined 
to review the ID in part. In particular, 
the Commission has determined to 
review the following: 

(1) Whether respondent OFS imports 
respondent MUV’s accused KS1–043/ 
048 coating. 

(2) Whether claim 30 of ’659 patent is 
invalid for lack of written description. 

(3) Whether claims 1–8, 11, 15, and 
18–19 of the ’508 patent are invalid for 
lack of written description and 
enablement. 

(4) Whether claim 21 of the ’508 
patent and claims 1–10 and 13–15 of the 
’103 patent are invalid for lack of 
written description and enablement. 

(5) Whether the accused products 
infringe the ’508, ’103, and ’659 patents. 

(6) Whether the technical and 
economic prongs of the domestic 
industry requirement have been met for 
the ’508, ’103, and ’659 patents. 

The Commission has determined to 
not review the remainder of the ID. The 
Commission does not request any 
briefing at this time. 

This action is taken under the 
authority of section 337 of the Tariff Act 
of 1930, as amended (19 U.S.C. 1337), 
and in part 210 of the Commission’s 
Rules of Practice and Procedure (19 CFR 
part 210). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: April 16, 2018. 

Katherine Hiner, 
Supervisory Attorney. 
[FR Doc. 2018–08265 Filed 4–19–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Notice of Lodging of Proposed 
Consent Decree 

In accordance with Departmental 
Policy, 28 CFR 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that a proposed Consent Decree in 
United States v. James Bult, Case No. 
1:17–cv–04574, was lodged with the 
United States District Court for the 
Northern District of Illinois, Eastern 
Division on April 10, 2018. 

This proposed Consent Decree 
concerns a complaint filed by the 
United States against Defendant Mr. 
James Bult, pursuant to 33 U.S.C. 
1311(a), 1319(b) and 1319(d), to obtain 
injunctive relief from and impose civil 
penalties against the Defendant for 
violating the Clean Water Act by 
discharging pollutants without a permit 
into waters of the United States. The 
proposed Consent Decree resolves these 
allegations by requiring the Defendant 
to restore the impacted areas, perform 
mitigation, and pay a civil penalty. 

The Department of Justice will accept 
written comments relating to this 
proposed Consent Decree for thirty (30) 
days from the date of publication of this 
Notice. Please address comments to Mr. 
Kurt N. Lindland, Assistant United 
States Attorney for the United States 
Attorney’s Office, Northern District of 
Illinois, and Mr. Scott A. Schachter, 
Assistant Section Chief for the United 
States Department of Justice, 
Environment and Natural Resources 
Division, Environmental Defense 
Section, Post Office Box 7611, 
Washington, DC 20044, and refer to 
United States v. James Bult, DJ #90–5– 
1–1–21133. 

The proposed Consent Decree may be 
examined at the Clerk’s Office, United 
States District Court for the Northern 
District of Illinois, Eastern Division, 219 
South Dearborn Street, Chicago, IL 
60604. In addition, the proposed 
Consent Decree may be examined 
electronically at http://www.justice.gov/ 
enrd/consent-decrees. 

Cherie Rogers, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Defense Section, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division. 
[FR Doc. 2018–08241 Filed 4–19–18; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–15–P 

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for OMB 
Review; Comment Request; Family 
and Medical Leave Act of 1993, as 
Amended 

ACTION: Notice of availability; request 
for comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Labor 
(DOL) is submitting the Wage and Hour 
Division (WHD) sponsored information 
collection request (ICR) titled, ‘‘Family 
and Medical Leave Act of 1993, As 
Amended,’’ to the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for review and 
approval for continued use, without 
change, in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA). Public comments on the ICR are 
invited. 
DATES: The OMB will consider all 
written comments that agency receives 
on or before May 21, 2018. 
ADDRESSES: A copy of this ICR with 
applicable supporting documentation; 
including a description of the likely 
respondents, proposed frequency of 
response, and estimated total burden 
may be obtained free of charge from the 
RegInfo.gov website at http://
www.reginfo.gov/public/do/PRAView
ICR?ref_nbr=201711-1235-001 (this link 
will only become active on the day 
following publication of this notice) or 
by contacting Michel Smyth by 
telephone at 202–693–4129, TTY 202– 
693–8064, (these are not toll-free 
numbers) or by email at DOL_PRA_
PUBLIC@dol.gov. 

Submit comments about this request 
by mail to the Office of Information and 
Regulatory Affairs, Attn: OMB Desk 
Officer for DOL–WHD, Office of 
Management and Budget, Room 10235, 
725 17th Street NW, Washington, DC 
20503; by Fax: 202–395–5806 (this is 
not a toll-free number); or by email: 
OIRA_submission@omb.eop.gov. 
Commenters are encouraged, but not 
required, to send a courtesy copy of any 
comments by mail or courier to the U.S. 
Department of Labor-OASAM, Office of 
the Chief Information Officer, Attn: 
Departmental Information Compliance 
Management Program, Room N1301, 
200 Constitution Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20210; or by email: 
DOL_PRA_PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michel Smyth by telephone at 202–693– 
4129, TTY 202–693–8064, (these are not 
toll-free numbers) or by email at DOL_
PRA_PUBLIC@dol.gov. 
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