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submissions must conform with the 
provisions of § 201.8 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.8); any 
submissions that contain confidential 
business information must also conform 
with the requirements of § 201.6 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.6). Section 201.8 
of the rules require that a signed original 
(or a copy designated as an original) and 
fourteen (14) copies of each document 
be filed. In the event that confidential 
treatment of the document is requested, 
at least four (4) additional copies must 
be filed, in which the confidential 
information must be deleted. Section 
201.6 of the rules require that the cover 
of the document and the individual 
pages be clearly marked as to whether 
they are the ‘‘confidential’’ or 
‘‘nonconfidential’’ version, and that the 
confidential business information be 
clearly identified by means of brackets. 

The Commission’s rules do not 
authorize filing submissions with the 
Secretary by facsimile or electronic 
means, except to the extent permitted by 
§ 201.8 of the Commission’s Rules (1 
CFR 201.8) (see Handbook for Electronic 
Filing Procedures, ftp://ftp.usitc.gov/
pub/reports/
electronic_filing_handbook.pdf). 
Persons with questions regarding 
electronic filing should contact the 
Secretary (202–205–2000 or 
edis@usitc.gov). 

All written submissions, except for 
confidential business information, will 
be made available for inspection by 
interested parties. Accordingly, any 
confidential information received by the 
Commission in these investigations and 
used in preparing the report will not be 
published in a manner that would 
reveal the operations of the firm 
supplying the information. 

The public record for these 
investigations may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at http://edis.usitc.gov. Hearing-
impaired individuals are advised that 
information on this matter can be 
obtained by contacting our TDD 
terminal on (202) 205–1810. Persons 
with mobility impairments who will 
need special assistance in gaining access 
to the Commission should contact the 
Office of the Secretary at 202–205–2000.

List of Subjects 

Tariffs, imports, wool, fabric, and 
suits.

Issued: January 8, 2004.

By order of the Commission. 

Marilyn R. Abbott, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 04–810 Filed 1–13–04; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Drug Enforcement Administration 

Manufacturer of Controlled 
Substances; Notice of Registration 

By Notice dated August 19, 2003, and 
published in the Federal Register on 
September 2, 3003, (68 FR 52224), 
Bristol Myers Squibb Pharma Company, 
1000 Stewart Avenue, Garden City, New 
York 11530, made application by 
renewal to the Drug Enforcement 
Administration for registration as a bulk 
manufacturer of Oxycodone (9143), a 
basic class of controlled substance listed 
in Schedule II. 

The firm plans to manufacture the 
controlled substance to make finished 
products. 

No comments or objections have been 
received. DEA has considered the 
factors in Title 21, United States Code, 
section 823(a) and determined that the 
registration of Bristol Myers Squibb 
Pharma Company to manufacture the 
listed controlled substance is consistent 
with the public interest at this time. 
DEA has investigated Bristol Myers 
Squibb Pharma Company to ensure that 
the company’s registration is consistent 
with the public interest. This 
investigation has included inspection 
and testing of the company’s physical 
security systems, verification of the 
company’s compliance with state and 
local laws, and a review of the 
company’s background and history. 
Therefore, pursuant to 21 U.S.C. 823 
and 28 CFR 0.100 and 0.104, the Deputy 
Assistant Administrator, Office of 
Diversion Control, hereby orders that 
the application submitted by the above 
firm for registration as a bulk 
manufacturer of the basic class of 
controlled substance listed is granted.

Dated: December 8, 2003. 

Laura M. Nagel, 
Deputy Assistant Administrator, Office of 
Diversion Control, Drug Enforcement 
Administration.
[FR Doc. 04–721 Filed 1–13–04; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–09–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Office of Justice Programs 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested

ACTION: 30-Day Notice of Information 
Collection Under Review: Juvenile 
Accountability Incentive Block Grant 
(JAIBG) Program. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Office of Justice Programs (OJP) has 
submitted the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
The proposed information collection is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. This 
proposed information collection was 
previously published in the Federal 
Register Volume 68, Number 129, page 
40296 on July 7, 2003, allowing for a 60 
day comment period. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comment until February 13, 2004. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to The Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20503. 
Additionally, comments may be 
submitted to OMB via facsimile to (202) 
395–5806. Written comments and 
suggestions from the public and affected 
agencies concerning the proposed 
collection of information are 
encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
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