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DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE

Office of the Secretary

Local Redevelopment Authority (LRA)

ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: Pursuant to Section
2905(b)(7)(B)(ii) of the defense Base
Closure and Realignment Act of 1990,
Public Law 101–510, as amended, this
notice provides the point of contact,
address, and telephone number for the
Local Redevelopment Authority (LRA)
that the Department of Defense has
recognized for planning the
redevelopment of the Davis Global
Communications Site, a part of the
closure of McClellan Air Force Base.
Representatives of state and local
governments and homeless providers
interested in the reuse of this
installation should contact the person or
organization listed. The following
information will be published in a
newspaper of general circulation in the
area of the installation.

EFFECTIVE DATE: June 19, 2001.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Patrick J. O’Brien, Office of Deputy
Under Secretary of Defense
(Installations and Environment), Office
of Economic Adjustment, 400 Army
Navy Drive, Suite 200, Arlington, VA
22202 (703) 604–6020.

Installation Name: Davis Global
Communications Site.

LRA Name: Yolo County Board of
Supervisors.

Point of Contact: Honorable Tom
Stallard, Chair.

Address: 625 Court Street, Room 204,
Woodland, CA 95695.

Phone: (530) 666–8193

Dated: August 8, 2001.

L.M. Bynum,
Alternate OSD Federal Register Liaison
Officer, Department of Defense.
[FR Doc. 01–20369 Filed 8–13–01; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 5001–08–M

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE

GENERAL SERVICES
ADMINISTRATION

NATIONAL AERONAUTICS AND
SPACE ADMINISTRATION

[OMB Control No. 9000–0045]

Federal Acquisition Regulation;
Submission for OMB Review; Bid
Guarantees, Performance and Payment
Bonds, and Alternative Payment
Protections

AGENCIES: Department of Defense (DOD),
General Services Administration (GSA),
and National Aeronautics and Space
Administration (NASA).
ACTION: Notice of request for comments
regarding an extension to an existing
OMB clearance (9000–0045).

SUMMARY: Under the provisions of the
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 (44
U.S.C. Chapter 35), the Federal
Acquisition Regulation (FAR)
Secretariat has submitted to the Office
of Management and Budget (OMB) a
request to review and approve an
extension of a currently approved
information collection requirement
concerning bid guarantees, performance
and payment bonds, and alternative
payment protections. A request for
public comments was published at 66
FR 32605, June 15, 2001. No comments
were received.

Public comments are particularly
invited on: Whether this collection of
information is necessary for the proper
performance of functions of the FAR,
and whether it will have practical
utility; whether our estimate of the
public burden of this collection of
information is accurate, and based on
valid assumptions and methodology;
ways to enhance the quality, utility, and
clarity of the information to be
collected; and ways in which we can
minimize the burden of the collection of
information on those who are to
respond, through the use of appropriate
technological collection techniques or
other forms of information technology.
DATES: Submit comments on or before
September 13, 2001.
ADDRESSES: Submit comments regarding
this burden estimate or any other aspect
of this collection of information,
including suggestions for reducing this
burden to: FAR Desk Officer, OMB,
Room 10102, NEOB, Washington, DC
20503, and a copy to the General
Services Administration, FAR
Secretariat (MVP), 1800 F Street, NW.,
Room 4035, Washington, DC 20405.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Beverly Cromer, Acquisition Policy
Division, GSA (202) 208–6750.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION:

A. Purpose

These regulations implement the
statutory requirements of the Miller Act
(40 U.S.C. 270a-270e), which requires
performance and payment bonds for any
construction contract exceeding
$100,000, unless it is impracticable to
require bonds for work performed in a
foreign country, or it is otherwise
authorized by law. In addition, the
regulations implement the note to 40
U.S.C. 270a, entitled ‘‘Alternatives to
Payment Bonds Provided by the Federal
Acquisition Regulation,’’ which requires
alternative payment protection for
construction contracts that exceed
$25,000 but do not exceed $100,000.
Although not required by statute, under
certain circumstances the FAR permits
the Government to require bonds on
other than construction contracts.

B. Annual Reporting Burden

The annual reporting burden is
estimated as follows:

Respondents: 11,304.
Responses Per Respondent: 5.
Total Responses: 56,520.
Hours Per Response: .42.
Total Burden Hours: 23,738.
Obtaining Copies of Proposals:

Requester may obtain a copy of the
proposal from the General Services
Administration, FAR Secretariat (MVP),
1800 F Street, NW., Room 4035,
Washington, DC 20405, telephone (202)
501–4755. Please cite OMB Control No.
9000–0045, Bid, Performance, and
Payment Bonds, in all correspondence.

Dated: August 8, 2001.
Al Matera,
Director, Acquisition Policy Division.
[FR Doc. 01–20303 Filed 8–13–01; 8:45 am]
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