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(telephone or in person). If participating 
by telephone, you will receive calling 
instructions when you RSVP. It is 
encouraged that those participating by 
telephone assemble together as much as 
possible to ensure that there will be a 
sufficient number of open telephone 
lines to accommodate all participants.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E3–00657 Filed 12–29–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Petition for Declaratory Order 
and Soliciting Comments, Motions To 
Intervene, and Protests 

December 19, 2003. 
Take notice that the following 

application has been filed with the 
Commission and is available for public 
inspection: 

a. Application Type: Petition for 
Declaratory Order. 

b. Docket No: DI04–2–000. 
c. Date Filed: December 15, 2003. 
d. Applicant: Appalachian Mountain 

Club. 
e. Name of Project: Zealand Falls Hut 

Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: The Zealand Falls Hut 

Hydroelectric Project is located on 
Whitewall Brook, Grafton County, New 
Hampshire. The project is located on 
Federal land (White Mountain National 
Forest). 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Section 23(b)(1) 
of the Federal Power Act, 16 U.S.C. 
817(b). 

h. Applicant Contact: Dave Herring, 
AMC, P.O. Box 298, Gorham, NH 30581, 
telephone: (603) 466–2721 x204, FAX: 
(603) 466–2822, E-mail: 
dherring@amcinfo.org 

i. FERC Contact: Any questions on 
this notice should be addressed to Diane 
M. Murray (202) 502–8838, or E-mail: 
diane.murray@ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments and/
or motions: January 23, 2004. 

All documents (original and eight 
copies) should be filed with: Magalie R. 
Salas, Secretary, Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, 888 First 
Street, NE., Washington, DC 20426. 
Comments, protests, and interventions 
may be filed electronically via the 
Internet in lieu of paper. Any questions, 
please contact the Secretary’s Office. 
See, 18 CFR 385.2001(a)(1)(iii) and the 
instructions on the Commission’s Web 
site at: http://www.ferc.gov. 

Please include the docket number 
(DI04–2–000) on any protests, 
comments or motions filed. 

k. Description of Project: The existing 
Zealand Falls Hut Hydroelectric Project 
consists of: (1) A dam; (2) 3-inch-
diameter, 1,500-foot-long polyethylene 
pipe; (3) a DC 12V/20 amp car-type 
alternator with a total rated capacity of 
250 W; and (4) appurtenant facilities. 

When a Petition for Declaratory Order 
is filed with the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission, the Federal 
Power Act requires the Commission to 
investigate and determine if the 
interests of interstate or foreign 
commerce would be affected by the 
project. The Commission also 
determines whether or not the project: 
(1) Would be located on a navigable 
waterway; (2) would occupy or affect 
public lands or reservations of the 
United States; (3) would utilize surplus 
water or water power from a 
government dam; or (4) if applicable, 
has involved or would involve any 
construction subsequent to 1935 that 
may have increased or would increase 
the project’s head or generating 
capacity, or have otherwise significantly 
modified the project’s pre-1935 design 
or operation. 

l. Locations of the application: Copies 
of this filing are on file with the 
Commission and are available for public 
inspection. This filing may be viewed 
on the Web at http://www.ferc.gov using 
the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link, select ‘‘Docket#’’ 
and follow the instructions. For 
assistance, please contact FERC Online 
Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or toll-
free at (866) 208–3676, or TTY, contact 
(202) 502–8659. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene—Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214. 
In determining the appropriate action to 
take, the Commission will consider all 
protests or other comments filed, but 
only those who file a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
Commission’s Rules may become a 
party to the proceeding. Any comments, 
protests, or motions to intervene must 
be received on or before the specified 
comment date for the particular 
application. 

o. Filing and Service of Responsive 
Documents—any filings must bear in all 
capital letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTESTS’’, OR ‘‘MOTIONS TO 

INTERVENE’’, as applicable, and the 
Docket Number of the particular 
application to which the filing refers. A 
copy of any motion to intervene must 
also be served upon each representative 
of the applicant specified in the 
particular application. 

p. Agency Comments—Federal, State, 
and local agencies are invited to file 
comments on the described application. 
A copy of the application may be 
obtained by agencies directly from the 
applicant. If an agency does not file 
comments within the time specified for 
filing comments, it will be presumed to 
have no comments. One copy of an 
agency’s comments must also be sent to 
the applicant’s representatives.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E3–00653 Filed 12–29–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Notice of Application Accepted for 
Filing and Soliciting Motions To 
Intervene, Protests, and Comments 

December 19, 2003. 
Take notice that the following 

hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Type of Application: Preliminary 
Permit. 

b. Project No.: 12465–000. 
c. Date filed: August 18, 2003. 
d. Applicant: Glover Wilkins Hydro 

LLC. 
e. Name of Project: Glover Wilkins 

By-Pass Project. 
f. Location: On the Tombigbee 

Waterway, in Monroe County, 
Mississippi, utilizing the U.S. Army 
Corp of Engineers’ Glover Wilkins Dam. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 91(a)–825(r). 

h. Applicant Contact: Mr. Brent 
Smith, Glover Wilkins Hydro LLC., P.O. 
Box 535, Rigby, ID 83442, (208) 745–
0834. 

i. FERC Contact: Robert Bell, (202) 
502–6062. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
protests, and motions to intervene: 60 
days from the issuance date of this 
notice. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all interveners 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person in the official service list 
for the project. Further, if an intervener 
files comments or documents with the 
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