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foreign governments. Typical TSP 
service users are responsible for the 
command and control functions critical 
to management of and response to NS/ 
EP situations, particularly during the 
first 24 to 72 hours following an event. 

Information to request a priority, to 
obtain a sponsor for requesting a 
priority, and for other administrative 
requirements of the program is required 
from any person or organization having 
an NS/EP service for which they wish 
priority restoration from the vendor 
providing the service. Information is 
also required to allow immediate 
installation of a new service to support 
NS/EP requirements. Information is 
required from vendors to allow the ECD 
to track and identify the 
telecommunications services that are 
being provided priority treatment. 

The forms used are the SF314 
(Revalidation for Service Users), SF315 
(TSP Request for Service Users), SF317 
(TSP Action Appeal for Service Users), 
SF318 (TSP Service Confirmation for 
Service Vendors), and the SF319 (TSP 
Service Reconciliation for Service 
Vendors). The SF314 is for users to 
request that their existing TSP codes be 
revalidated for three more years. The 
SF315 is used to request restoration 
and/or provisioning for an 
organization’s critical circuits. The 
SF317 is for organizations to appeal the 
denial of TSP restoration and/or 
provisioning. The SF318 is for service 
vendors to provide circuit ID 
information associated with TSP codes 
they’ve been given by their customers. 
The SF319 is for service vendors to 
provide data to the program office in 
order to reconcile their TSP data with 
the TSP database. Participants request 
TSP priorities via email in order to 
reduce the use of the paper forms. The 
paper forms will also be available for 
download via the TSP home page. 

There have been no changes to the 
information being collected. The burden 
for the SF315 Form has increased due 
to better estimates, and the annual cost 
burden to respondents and annual 
government cost has increased due to 
increased wage rates and compensation 
factors. 

This is a renewal of an information 
collection. 

OMB is particularly interested in 
comments that: 

1. Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

2. Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 

including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

3. Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

4. Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submissions 
of responses. 

Title of Collection: 
Telecommunications Service Priority 
System. 

OMB Control Number: 1670–0005. 
Frequency: Annually. 
Affected Public: State, Local, Tribal, 

and Territorial Governments and Private 
Sector. 

Number of Annualized Respondents: 
38,666. 

Estimated Time per Respondent: 0.64 
hours. 

Total Annualized Burden Hours: 
10,354 hours. 

Total Annualized Respondent 
Opportunity Cost: $503,681. 

Total Annualized Respondent Out-of- 
Pocket Cost: $0. 

Total Annualized Government Cost: 
$377,036. 

Scott Libby, 
Deputy Chief Information Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2019–02568 Filed 2–14–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9110–9P–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services 

[OMB Control Number 1615–NEW] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; New Collection: USCIS Tip 
Form 

AGENCY: U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Homeland 
Security (DHS), U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration (USCIS) invites the general 
public and other Federal agencies to 
comment upon this proposed new 
collection of information. In accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act 
(PRA) of 1995, the information 
collection notice is published in the 
Federal Register to obtain comments 
regarding the nature of the information 
collection, the categories of 

respondents, the estimated burden (i.e. 
the time, effort, and resources used by 
the respondents to respond), the 
estimated cost to the respondent, and 
the actual information collection 
instruments. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until April 
16, 2019. 
ADDRESSES: All submissions received 
must include the OMB Control Number 
1615–NEW in the body of the letter, the 
agency name and Docket ID USCIS– 
2019–0001. To avoid duplicate 
submissions, please use only one of the 
following methods to submit comments: 

(1) Online. Submit comments via the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal website at 
http://www.regulations.gov under e- 
Docket ID number USCIS–2019–0001; 

(2) Mail. Submit written comments to 
DHS, USCIS, Office of Policy and 
Strategy, Chief, Regulatory Coordination 
Division, 20 Massachusetts Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20529–2140. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
USCIS, Office of Policy and Strategy, 
Regulatory Coordination Division, 
Samantha Deshommes, Chief, 20 
Massachusetts Avenue NW, 
Washington, DC 20529–2140, telephone 
number 202–272–8377 (This is not a 
toll-free number. Comments are not 
accepted via telephone message.) Please 
note contact information provided here 
is solely for questions regarding this 
notice. It is not for individual case 
status inquiries. Applicants seeking 
information about the status of their 
individual cases can check Case Status 
Online, available at the USCIS website 
at http://www.uscis.gov, or call the 
USCIS National Customer Service 
Center at 800–375–5283 (TTY 800–767– 
1833). 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments: You may access the 
information collection instrument with 
instructions, or additional information 
by visiting the Federal eRulemaking 
Portal site at: http://
www.regulations.gov and enter USCIS– 
2019–0001 in the search box. Regardless 
of the method used for submitting 
comments or material, all submissions 
will be posted, without change, to the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal at http://
www.regulations.gov, and will include 
any personal information you provide. 
Therefore, submitting this information 
makes it public. You may wish to 
consider limiting the amount of 
personal information that you provide 
in any voluntary submission you make 
to DHS. DHS may withhold information 
provided in comments from public 
viewing that it determines may impact 
the privacy of an individual or is 
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offensive. For additional information, 
please read the Privacy Act notice that 
is available via the link in the footer of 
http://www.regulations.gov. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
should address one or more of the 
following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
New Collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
USCIS Tip Form. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the DHS 
sponsoring the collection: G–1530; 
USCIS. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: Individuals or 
households. The USCIS Tip Form will 
facilitate the collection of information 
from the public regarding credible and 
relevant claims of immigration benefit 
fraud impacting both open 
adjudications as well as previously 
approved benefit requests where the 
benefit remains valid. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond: The estimated total number of 
respondents for the information 
collection G–1530 is 55,000 and the 
estimated hour burden per response is 
.166 hours. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The total estimated annual 
hour burden associated with this 
collection is 9,130 hours. 

(7) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in cost) associated with the 

collection: There is no public burden 
cost associated with this collection. 

Dated: February 11, 2019 
Samantha L. Deshommes, 
Chief, Regulatory Coordination Division, 
Office of Policy and Strategy, U.S. Citizenship 
and Immigration Services, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
[FR Doc. 2019–02381 Filed 2–14–19; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 9111–97–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Citizenship and Immigration 
Services 

[OMB Control Number 1615–0096] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Extension, Without Change, 
of a Currently Approved Collection: 
Genealogy Index Search Request and 
Genealogy Records Request 

AGENCY: U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: 30-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Homeland 
Security (DHS), U.S. Citizenship and 
Immigration Services (USCIS) will be 
submitting the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and clearance in accordance 
with the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995. The purpose of this notice is to 
allow an additional 30 days for public 
comments. 
DATES: The purpose of this notice is to 
allow an additional 30 days for public 
comments. Comments are encouraged 
and will be accepted until March 18, 
2019. 

ADDRESSES: Written comments and/or 
suggestions regarding the item(s) 
contained in this notice, especially 
regarding the estimated public burden 
and associated response time, must be 
directed to the OMB USCIS Desk Officer 
via email at dhsdeskofficer@
omb.eop.gov. All submissions received 
must include the agency name and the 
OMB Control Number 1615–0096 in the 
subject line. 

You may wish to consider limiting the 
amount of personal information that you 
provide in any voluntary submission 
you make. For additional information 
please read the Privacy Act notice that 
is available via the link in the footer of 
http://www.regulations.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
USCIS, Office of Policy and Strategy, 
Regulatory Coordination Division, 
Samantha Deshommes, Chief, 20 

Massachusetts Avenue NW., 
Washington, DC 20529–2140, 
Telephone number (202) 272–8377 
(This is not a toll-free number; 
comments are not accepted via 
telephone message.). Please note contact 
information provided here is solely for 
questions regarding this notice. It is not 
for individual case status inquiries. 
Applicants seeking information about 
the status of their individual cases can 
check Case Status Online, available at 
the USCIS website at http://
www.uscis.gov, or call the USCIS 
National Customer Service Center at 
(800) 375–5283; TTY (800) 767–1833. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Comments 

The information collection notice was 
previously published in the Federal 
Register on November 5, 2018, at 83 FR 
55393, allowing for a 60-day public 
comment period. USCIS did not receive 
any comment(s) in connection with the 
60-day notice. 

You may access the information 
collection instrument with instructions, 
or additional information by visiting the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal site at: 
http://www.regulations.gov and enter 
USCIS–2006–0013 in the search box. 
Written comments and suggestions from 
the public and affected agencies should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection: 

(1) Type of Information Collection 
Request: Extension, Without Change, of 
a Currently Approved Collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: 
Genealogy Index Search Request and 
Genealogy Records Request. 
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