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(3) An environmental report,
satisfactory to RUS;

(4) Depreciation rates, based on
current industry standards, for the
equipment being financed (acceptance
of such rates will be subject to RUS
approval);

(5) A sketch or map showing existing
and proposed service areas;

(6) A description of the current level
of service available;

(7) Information on the owners and
principal employees’ relevant work
experience that would ensure the
success of the project; and

(8) All other required forms for
Federal assistance and compliance with
other applicable Federal statutes.

Review of Grant Applications
All applications for grants must be

delivered to RUS at the address listed
above or postmarked no later than
November 13, 2001 to be considered
eligible for FY 2001 grant funding. RUS
will review each application for
conformance with the provisions of this
Notice. RUS may contact the applicant
for additional information or
clarification. Incomplete applications
will not be considered. Applications
conforming with this Notice will then
be evaluated competitively by a panel of
RUS employees selected by the
Administrator and points awarded as
described in the Scoring Criteria section
below. The applications will be ranked
and grants awarded in rank order until
all grant funds are expended.

Scoring Criteria
Grant awards will be made based on

the following scoring criteria as
determined by RUS:

(1) The need for services and benefits
derived from services (up to 40 points).
This criterion will be used by RUS to
score applications based on the
documentation in support of the need
for services, benefits derived from the
services proposed by the project, and
local community involvement in
planning, implementing, and financial
assistance of the project. RUS will
consider the extent of the applicant’s
documentation explaining the
challenges facing the community; the
applicant’s proposed plan to address
these challenges; how the grant can
help; and why the applicant cannot
complete the project without a grant.

(2) The economic need of the
applicant’s service area as determined
by per capita personal income by
County, as determined by the Bureau of
Economic Analysis, U.S. Department of
Commerce, at www.bea.doc.gov/bea/
regional/reis/ (up to 40 points).
Applicants will be awarded points as

outlined below for service provided in
each county where the per capita
personal income (PCI) is less than 70
percent of the national average per
capita personal income (NAPCI):

(i) PCI is 70 percent or greater of
NAPCI; 0 points;

(ii) PCI is less than 70 percent and
greater than 60 percent of NAPCI; 10
points;

(iii) PCI is less than 60 percent and
greater than 50 percent of NAPCI; 20
points;

(iv) PCI is less than 50 percent and
greater than 40 percent of NAPCI; 30
points;

(v) PCPI is less than 40 percent of
NAPCPI; 40 points;
If an applicant proposes significant
service in more than one county, an
average score will be calculated based
on each counties’ individual scores.

(3) Project services USDA designated
EZ/ECs (Empowerment Zone and
Enterprise Communities) (10 points) or
USDA designated Champion
Communities (5 points).

Dated: August 9, 2001.
Blaine D. Stockton,
Acting Administrator, Rural Utilities Service.
[FR Doc. 01–20560 Filed 8–14–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 3410–15–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Submission for OMB Review;
Comment Request

DOC has submitted to the Office of
Management and Budget (OMB) for
clearance the following proposal for
collection of information under the
provisions of the Paperwork Reduction
Act of 1995, Public Law 104–13.

Bureau: International Trade
Administration.

Title: Information on Articles for
Physically or Mentally Handicapped
Persons Imported Free of Duty.

Agency Form Number: ITA–362P.
OMB Number: 0625–0118.
Type of Request: Revision-Regular

Submission.
Burden: 304 hours.
Number of Respondents: 380.
Avg. Hours Per Response: 4 minutes.
Needs and Uses: Congress, when it

enacted legislation to implement the
Nairobi Protocol to the Florence
Agreement, included a provision for the
Departments of Commerce and Treasury
to collect information on the import of
articles for the handicapped. Form ITA–
362P, Information on Articles for
Physically or Mentally Handicapped
Persons Imported Free of Duty, is the
vehicle by which statistical information

is obtained to assess whether the duty-
free treatment of articles for the
handicapped has had a significant
adverse impact on a domestic industry
(or portion thereof) manufacturing or
producing a like or directly competitive
article. Without the collection of data, it
would be almost impossible for a sound
determination to be made and for the
President to appropriately redress the
situation.

Affected Public: Businesses or other
for-profit, not-for-profit institutions,
state, local or tribal governments,
federal government, individuals or
households.

Frequency: On Occasion.
Respondent’s Obligation: Required to

obtain or retain a benefit, voluntary.
OMB Desk Officer: David Rostker,

(202) 395–3897.
Copies of the above information

collection proposal can be obtained by
calling or writing Madeleine Clayton,
Departmental Paperwork Clearance
Officer, (202) 482–3129, Department of
Commerce, Room 6086, 14th and
Constitution, NW., Washington, DC
20230 or via internet at
MClayton@doc.gov.

Written comments and
recommendations for the proposed
information collection should be sent to
David Rostker, OMB Desk Officer, Room
10202, New Executive Office Building,
Washington, DC 20503 within 30 days
of the publication of this notice in the
Federal Register.

Dated: August 9, 2001.
Madeleine Clayton,
Departmental Paperwork Clearance Officer,
Office of the Chief Information Officer.
[FR Doc. 01–20452 Filed 8–14–01; 8:45 am]
BILLING CODE 3510–DS–P

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE

Submission for OMB Review;
Comment Request

The Department of Commerce (DOC)
has submitted to the Office of
Management and Budget (OMB) for
clearance the following proposal for
collection of information under
provisions of the Paperwork Reduction
Act (44 U.S.C. chapter 35).

Agency: Bureau of Export
Administration (BXA), Commerce.

Title: Foreign Availability Procedures
and Criteria.

Agency Form Number: None.
OMB Approval Number: 0694–0004.
Type of Request: Extension of a

currently approved collection of
information.

Burden: 510 hours.
Average Time Per Response: 105 to

120 hours per response.
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