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interest to be represented by the 
nominee is owned by non-U.S. citizens, 
organizations, or interests and 
demonstrate at the time of nomination 
that this ownership interest does not 
constitute control and will not adversely 
affect his or her ability to serve as an 
advisor on the U.S. agriculture advisory 
committee for trade. 

Dated: June 8, 2023. 
Cikena Reid, 
USDA Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–12649 Filed 6–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3410–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE 

Forest Service 

Virginia Resource Advisory 
Committee; Meeting 

AGENCY: Forest Service, Agriculture 
(USDA). 
ACTION: Notice of meeting. 

SUMMARY: The Virginia Resource 
Advisory Committee (RAC) will hold a 
public meeting according to the details 
shown below. The committee is 
authorized under the Secure Rural 
Schools and Community Self- 
Determination Act (the Act) and 
operates in compliance with the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (FACA). The 
purpose of the committee is to improve 
collaborative relationships and to 
provide advice and recommendations to 
the Forest Service concerning projects 
and funding consistent with Title II of 
the Act, on the George Washington and 
Jefferson National Forest, within its 
counties, consistent with the Federal 
Lands Recreation Enhancement Act. 
DATES: An in-person meeting with 
virtual accommodation if needed will be 
held on July 11, 2023, 12:30 p.m.–3:30 
p.m., Eastern Daylight Time. 

Written and Oral Comments: Anyone 
wishing to provide in-person and/or 
virtual comments must pre-register by 
11:59 p.m. Eastern Daylight Time on 
July 5, 2023. Written public comments 
will be accepted by 11:59 p.m. Eastern 
Daylight Time on July 10, 2023. 
Comments submitted after this date will 
be provided to the Agency, but the 
Committee may not have adequate time 
to consider those comments prior to the 
meeting. 

All RAC meetings are subject to 
cancellation. For status of the meeting 
prior to attendance, please contact the 
person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 
ADDRESSES: This meeting will be held 
in-person and virtually at the George 
Washington and Jefferson National 

Forest Supervisor’s Office located at 
5162 Valleypointe Parkway, Roanoke, 
Virginia 24019. The public may also 
join virtually via teleconference by 
calling 202–650–0123, 125903887#. 
RAC information and meeting details 
can be found at the following website: 
https://www.fs.usda.gov/main/gwj/ 
workingtogether/advisorycommitteesor 
by contacting the person listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT. 

Written Comments: Written comments 
must be sent by email to 
FSM.FS.GWJNF-PA@usda.gov or via 
mail (i.e., postmarked) to Gwen Mason, 
Designated Federal Officer, 5162 
Valleypointe Parkway, Roanoke, 
Virginia 24019. The Forest Service 
strongly prefers comments be submitted 
electronically. 

Oral Comments: Persons or 
organizations wishing to make oral 
comments must pre-register by 11:59 
p.m. Eastern Daylight Time on July 5, 
2023, and speakers can only register for 
one speaking slot. Oral comments must 
be sent by email to FSM.FS.GWJNF-PA@
usda.gov or via mail (i.e., postmarked) 
to Gwen Mason, George Washington and 
Jefferson National Forest, 5162 
Valleypointe Parkway, Roanoke, 
Virginia 24019. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Gwen Mason, Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO), by phone at (540) 265– 
5100 or email at gwendolyn.mason@
usda.gov or Jennifer Hummel, Acting 
RAC Coordinator at (540) 265–5100 or 
email at jennifer.hummel@usda.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
purpose of the meeting is to: 

1. Hear from Title II project 
proponents and discuss Title II project 
proposals; 

2. Make funding recommendations on 
Title II projects; 

3. Approve meeting minutes; and 
4. Schedule the next meeting. 
The agenda will include time for 

individuals to make oral statements of 
three minutes or less. Individuals 
wishing to make an oral statement 
should make a request in writing at least 
three days prior to the meeting date to 
be scheduled on the agenda. Written 
comments may be submitted to the 
Forest Service up to 14 days after the 
meeting date listed under DATES. 

Please contact the person listed under 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT, by 
or before the deadline, for all questions 
related to the meeting. All comments, 
including names and addresses when 
provided, are placed in the record and 
are available for public inspection and 
copying. The public may inspect 
comments received upon request. 

Meeting Accommodations: The 
meeting location is compliant with the 

Americans with Disabilities Act, and the 
USDA provides reasonable 
accommodation to individuals with 
disabilities where appropriate. If you are 
a person requiring reasonable 
accommodation, please make requests 
in advance for sign language 
interpretation, assistive listening 
devices, or other reasonable 
accommodation to the person listed 
under the FOR FURTHER INFORMATION 
CONTACT section or contact USDA’s 
TARGET Center at (202) 720–2600 
(voice and TTY) or USDA through the 
Federal Relay Service at (800) 877–8339. 
Additionally, program information may 
be made available in languages other 
than English. 

USDA programs are prohibited from 
discriminating based on race, color, 
national origin, religion, sex, gender 
identity (including gender expression), 
sexual orientation, disability, age, 
marital status, family/parental status, 
income derived from a public assistance 
program, political beliefs, or reprisal or 
retaliation for prior civil rights activity, 
in any program or activity conducted or 
funded by USDA (not all bases apply to 
all programs). Remedies and complaint 
filing deadlines vary by program or 
incident. 

Equal opportunity practices in 
accordance with USDA’s policies will 
be followed in all appointments to the 
Committee. To ensure that the 
recommendations of the Committee 
have taken in account the needs of the 
diverse groups served by USDA, 
membership shall include to the extent 
possible, individuals with demonstrated 
ability to represent minorities, women, 
and persons with disabilities. USDA is 
an equal opportunity provider, 
employer, and lender. 

Dated: June 7, 2023. 
Cikena Reid, 
USDA Committee Management Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2023–12599 Filed 6–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Generic Clearance for the 
Collection of Qualitative Feedback on 
Agency Service Delivery 

On June 7, 2023, the Department of 
Commerce, published a 30-day public 
comment period notice with FR 
Document Number 2023–12186 (Page 
37200) seeking public comments for an 
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information collection entitled, 
‘‘Generic Clearance for the Collection of 
Qualitative Feedback on Agency Service 
Delivery.’’ This document referenced 
incorrect information in the Needs and 
Uses section, and Commerce hereby 
issues a correction notice as required by 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
additional information concerning this 
correction, contact Sheleen Dumas, the 
Department Paperwork Reduction Act 
Clearance Officer, at (202) 482–3360, 
PRAcomments@doc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Correction 

Need and Uses: Executive Order 
12862 directs Federal agencies to 
provide service to the public that 
matches or exceeds the best service 
available in the private sector. In order 
to work continuously to ensure that the 
Department of Commerce (DOC) 
programs are effective and meet our 
customers’ needs we use a generic 
clearance process to collect qualitative 
feedback on our service delivery. This 
collection of information is necessary to 
enable DOC to garner customer and 
stakeholder feedback in an efficient, 
timely manner, in accordance with our 
commitment to improving service 
delivery. The information collected 
from our customers and stakeholders 
will help ensure that users have an 
effective, efficient, and satisfying 
experience with the programs. This 
feedback will provide insights into 
customer or stakeholder perceptions, 
experiences and expectations, provide 
an early warning of issues with service, 
or focus attention on areas where 
communication, training or changes in 
operations might improve delivery of 
products or services. These collections 
will allow for ongoing, collaborative and 
actionable communications between 
DOC and its customers and 
stakeholders. It will also allow feedback 
to contribute directly to the 
improvement of program management. 

This information collection request 
may be viewed at www.reginfo.gov. 
Follow the instructions to view the 
Department of Commerce collections 
currently under review by OMB. 

We continue to solicit public 
comments to permit the Department/ 
Bureau to: (a) Evaluate whether the 
proposed information collection is 
necessary for the proper functions of the 
Department, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 
(b) Evaluate the accuracy of our estimate 
of the time and cost burden for this 
proposed collection, including the 
validity of the methodology and 

assumptions used; (c) Evaluate ways to 
enhance the quality, utility, and clarity 
of the information to be collected; and 
(d) Minimize the reporting burden on 
those who are to respond, including the 
use of automated collection techniques 
or other forms of information 
technology. 

Comments that you submit in 
response to this notice are a matter of 
public record. We will include or 
summarize each comment in our request 
to OMB to approve this ICR. Before 
including your address, phone number, 
email address, or other personal 
identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment—including your 
personal identifying information—may 
be made publicly available at any time. 
While you may ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

Sheleen Dumas, 
Department PRA Clearance Officer, Office of 
the Under Secretary for Economic Affairs, 
Commerce Department. 
[FR Doc. 2023–12521 Filed 6–12–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–17–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Office of the Secretary 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Eligibility Questionnaire for 
HAVANA Act Payments 

AGENCY: Office of the Secretary, 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of information collection, 
request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Commerce, in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), invites the general public and 
other Federal agencies to comment on 
proposed, and continuing information 
collections, which helps us assess the 
impact of our information collection 
requirements and minimize the public’s 
reporting burden. The purpose of this 
notice is to allow for 60 days of public 
comment preceding submission of the 
collection to OMB. 
DATES: To ensure consideration, 
comments regarding this proposed 
information collection must be received 
on or before August 14, 2023. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments by 
mail to Anna Kelley, 1401 Constitution 

Avenue NW, Rooms 1844–1846, 
Washington, DC 20230 or by email to 
anna.kelley@trade.gov or 
PRAcomments@doc.gov. Please 
reference OMB Control Number 0690– 
0037 in the subject line of your 
comments. Do not submit Confidential 
Business Information or otherwise 
sensitive or protected information. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
specific questions related to collection 
activities should be directed to Charles 
Cutshall, Chief Privacy Officer, 202– 
482–5735, and ccutshall@doc.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 

This is a request for an extension of 
an approved information collection. 

This collection of information is 
needed to obtain information from 
respondents of the Helping American 
Victims Affected by Neurological 
Attacks (HAVANA) Act of 2021, which 
was signed by President Biden in 
October 2021. The Act provides for the 
possibility of one-time lump sum 
payments for those affected by 
Anomalous Health Incidents (AHIs). 

This includes current and former 
Department employees, and dependents 
of current or former employees who, on 
or after January 1, 2016, became injured 
by a qualifying injury to the brain while 
they were an employee of the 
Department. 

II. Method of Collection 

Information on this form will be 
collected electronically, email, mail, fax, 
or interviews. 

III. Data 

OMB Control Number: 0690–0037. 
Form Number(s): CD–350. 
Type of Review: Regular submission, 

Extension of approved information 
collection. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
Federal Government personnel. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
20. 

Estimated Time per Response: 1 hour 
(30 minutes claimant/30 minutes 
physician). 

Estimated Total Annual Burden 
Hours: 20. 

Estimated Total Annual Cost to 
Public: $2,350.35. 

Respondent’s Obligation: Voluntary. 
Legal Authority: HAVANA Act of 

2021 (Pub. L. 117–46). 

IV. Request for Comments 

We are soliciting public comments to 
permit the Department to: (a) Evaluate 
whether the proposed information 
collection is necessary for the proper 
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