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1 170 FERC ¶ 62,007 (2020). 
2 18 CFR 385.2007(a)(2) (2021). 

Power LLC, Middleton Power LLC, 
Devon Power LLC, Connecticut Jet 
Power LLC, Arthur Kill Power LLC, 
Rolling Hills Generating, L.L.C., New 
Covert Generating Company, LLC, 
Lincoln Generating Facility, LLC, Crete 
Energy Venture, LLC. 

Description: Notice of Change in 
Status of Crete Energy Venture, LLC, et 
al. 

Filed Date: 4/29/22. 
Accession Number: 20220429–5710. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/20/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–1818–030; 

ER10–1819–033; ER10–1820–036. 
Applicants: Northern States Power 

Company, a Wisconsin corporation, 
Northern States Power Company, a 
Minnesota corporation, Public Service 
Company of Colorado. 

Description: Notice of Change in 
Status of Public Service Company of 
Colorado, et al. 

Filed Date: 4/29/22. 
Accession Number: 20220429–5706. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/20/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER10–1910–025; 

ER10–1911–025. 
Applicants: Duquesne Power, LLC, 

Duquesne Light Company. 
Description: Notice of Change in 

Status of Duquesne Light Company, et 
al. 

Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5384. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/23/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER17–1794–005. 
Applicants: Innovative Solar 42, LLC. 
Description: Notice of Change in 

Status of Innovative Solar 42, LLC. 
Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5385. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/23/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER22–1423–001. 
Applicants: Appalachian Power 

Company. 
Description: Tariff Amendment: 

OATT—Kentucky Power Removal— 
Errata to be effective 12/31/9998. 

Filed Date: 5/3/22. 
Accession Number: 20220503–5177. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/24/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER22–1786–000. 
Applicants: Public Service Company 

of Colorado. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

2022–05–03 PSCoM–NITSA–463–Amnd 
2 to be effective 7/2/2022. 

Filed Date: 5/3/22. 
Accession Number: 20220503–5073. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/24/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER22–1787–000. 
Applicants: Tri-State Generation and 

Transmission Association, Inc. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: 

Initial Filing of Rate Schedule FERC No. 
342 and Request for Expedited Action to 
be effective 5/31/2022. 

Filed Date: 5/3/22. 
Accession Number: 20220503–5087. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/24/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER22–1788–000. 
Applicants: Deseret Generation & 

Transmission Co-operative, Inc. 
Description: Compliance filing: Order 

No. 676–J First Compliance to be 
effective 12/31/9998. 

Filed Date: 5/3/22. 
Accession Number: 20220503–5096. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/24/22. 
Docket Numbers: ER22–1789–000. 
Applicants: PacifiCorp. 
Description: § 205(d) Rate Filing: Tri- 

State NITSA Rev 11 to be effective 5/1/ 
2022. 

Filed Date: 5/3/22. 
Accession Number: 20220503–5108. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/24/22. 
The filings are accessible in the 

Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/fercgen
search.asp) by querying the docket 
number. 

Any person desiring to intervene or 
protest in any of the above proceedings 
must file in accordance with Rules 211 
and 214 of the Commission’s 
Regulations (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 
Protests may be considered, but 
intervention is necessary to become a 
party to the proceeding. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

Dated: May 3, 2022. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09906 Filed 5–6–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 14980–000] 

Lock+TM Hydro Friends Fund XXVIII, 
LLC; Notice of Surrender of 
Preliminary Permit 

Take notice that Lock+TM Hydro 
Friends Fund XXVIII, LLC, permittee for 
the proposed Nockamixon Dam 
Hydropower Project, has requested that 
its preliminary permit be terminated. 
The permit was issued on January 7, 
2020 and would have expired on 

December 31, 2023.1 The project would 
have been located at the Pennsylvania 
Department of Conservation and Natural 
Resources’ Nockamixon Dam on 
Tohickon Creek in Bucks County, 
Pennsylvania. 

The preliminary permit for Project 
No. 14980 will remain in effect until the 
close of business, June 2, 2022. But, if 
the Commission is closed on this day, 
then the permit remains in effect until 
the close of business on the next day in 
which the Commission is open.2 New 
applications for this site may not be 
submitted until after the permit 
surrender is effective. 

Dated: May 3, 2022. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09898 Filed 5–6–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Project No. 2934–036] 

New York State Electric & Gas 
Corporation; Notice of Application 
Accepted for Filing and Soliciting 
Comments, Motions To Intervene, and 
Protests 

Take notice that the following 
hydroelectric application has been filed 
with the Commission and is available 
for public inspection: 

a. Application Type: Request for 
temporary amendment of Article 402. 

b. Project No.: 2934–036. 
c. Date Filed: April 21, 2022, and 

supplemented April 28, 2022. 
d. Applicant: New York State Electric 

& Gas Corporation. 
e. Name of Project: Upper 

Mechanicville Hydroelectric Project. 
f. Location: The project is located on 

the Hudson River in Saratoga and 
Rensselaer counties, New York. The 
project does not occupy federally owned 
lands. 

g. Filed Pursuant to: Federal Power 
Act, 16 U.S.C. 791a–825r. 

h. Applicant Contact: David W. Dick, 
New York State Electric & Gas 
Corporation, 89 East Avenue, Rochester, 
NY 14649, (585) 315–0705, david_dick@
rge.com. 

i. FERC Contact: Jeremy Jessup, (202) 
502–6779, Jeremy.Jessup@ferc.gov. 

j. Deadline for filing comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests: June 
2, 2022. 
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The Commission strongly encourages 
electronic filing. Please file comments, 
motions to intervene, and protests using 
the Commission’s eFiling system at 
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
efiling.asp. Commenters can submit 
brief comments up to 6,000 characters, 
without prior registration, using the 
eComment system at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
ecomment.asp. You must include your 
name and contact information at the end 
of your comments. For assistance, 
please contact FERC Online Support at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, (866) 
208–3676 (toll free), or (202) 502–8659 
(TTY). In lieu of electronic filing, you 
may submit a paper copy. Submissions 
sent via the U.S. Postal Service must be 
addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street NE, Room 
1A, Washington, DC 20426. 
Submissions sent via any other carrier 
must be addressed to: Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary, Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 12225 Wilkins Avenue, 
Rockville, Maryland 20852. The first 
page of any filing should include the 
docket number P–2934–036. Comments 
emailed to Commission staff are not 
considered part of the Commission 
record. 

The Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure require all intervenors 
filing documents with the Commission 
to serve a copy of that document on 
each person whose name appears on the 
official service list for the project. 
Further, if an intervenor files comments 
or documents with the Commission 
relating to the merits of an issue that 
may affect the responsibilities of a 
particular resource agency, they must 
also serve a copy of the document on 
that resource agency. 

k. Description of Request: The 
applicant proposes to temporarily 
amend Article 402 of the license to 
allow for the drawdown of the 
impoundment elevation. The drawdown 
is necessary for the licensee to replace 
the rubber dam components at the 
project. In particular, the licensee 
requests a temporary amendment of 
Article 402 to maintain the 
impoundment elevation at up to 12 
inches below the spillway crest (65.6 
feet National Geocentric Vertical Datum 
1929) unless otherwise directed by the 
New York State Canal Corporation until 
the completion of the replacement and 
upgrade of the remaining bladders. The 
licensee anticipates the drawdown to 
occur between mid-June to mid-October 
2022. The licensee would continue to 
operate the project in run-of-river mode 
except to satisfy navigation requests and 
provide the seasonal minimum bypass 

flow requirements below the project 
except during periods when the 
impoundment elevation is lower than 
the sill of the sluice gate. 

l. Locations of the Application: This 
filing may be viewed on the 
Commission’s website at http://
www.ferc.gov using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. You may 
also register online at http://
www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ 
esubscription.asp to be notified via 
email of new filings and issuances 
related to this or other pending projects. 
For assistance, call 1–866–208–3676 or 
email FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, for 
TTY, call (202) 502–8659. Agencies may 
obtain copies of the application directly 
from the applicant. 

m. Individuals desiring to be included 
on the Commission’s mailing list should 
so indicate by writing to the Secretary 
of the Commission. 

n. Comments, Protests, or Motions to 
Intervene: Anyone may submit 
comments, a protest, or a motion to 
intervene in accordance with the 
requirements of Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 18 CFR 385.210, .211, .214, 
respectively. In determining the 
appropriate action to take, the 
Commission will consider all protests or 
other comments filed, but only those 
who file a motion to intervene in 
accordance with the Commission’s 
Rules may become a party to the 
proceeding. Any comments, protests, or 
motions to intervene must be received 
on or before the specified comment date 
for the particular application. 

o. Filing and Service of Documents: 
Any filing must (1) bear in all capital 
letters the title ‘‘COMMENTS’’, 
‘‘PROTEST’’, or ‘‘MOTION TO 
INTERVENE’’ as applicable; (2) set forth 
in the heading the name of the applicant 
and the project number of the 
application to which the filing 
responds; (3) furnish the name, address, 
and telephone number of the person 
commenting, protesting or intervening; 
and (4) otherwise comply with the 
requirements of 18 CFR 385.2001 
through 385.2005. All comments, 
motions to intervene, or protests must 
set forth their evidentiary basis. Any 
filing made by an intervenor must be 
accompanied by proof of service on all 
persons listed in the service list 
prepared by the Commission in this 
proceeding, in accordance with 18 CFR 
385.2010. 

Dated: May 3, 2022. 
Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2022–09901 Filed 5–6–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

Combined Notice of Filings 

Take notice that the Commission has 
received the following Natural Gas 
Pipeline Rate and Refund Report filings: 

Filings Instituting Proceedings 
Docket Numbers: RP22–897–000. 
Applicants: Rover Pipeline LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 

Summary of Negotiated Rate Capacity 
Release Agreements on 5–2–22 to be 
effective 5/1/2022. 

Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5103. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/16/22. 
Docket Numbers: RP22–899–000. 
Applicants: DTM Birdsboro Pipeline, 

LLC. 
Description: Compliance filing: Cost 

and Revenue Study Compliance Filing. 
Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5246. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/16/22. 
Docket Numbers: RP22–900–000. 
Applicants: Columbia Gas 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: Cabot 

Oil Name Change to Coterra Energy, Inc. 
Agmt No. 161137–4 to be effective 5/2/ 
2022. 

Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5249. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/16/22. 
Docket Numbers: RP22–901–000. 
Applicants: NEXUS Gas 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 

Negotiated Rate—Vitol 860536 to be 
effective 5/1/2022. 

Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5250. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/16/22. 
Docket Numbers: RP22–902–000. 
Applicants: Millennium Pipeline 

Company, LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: Cabot 

to Coterra Name Change—Agmt 151457 
to be effective 5/2/2022. 

Filed Date: 5/2/22. 
Accession Number: 20220502–5252. 
Comment Date: 5 p.m. ET 5/16/22. 
Docket Numbers: RP22–903–000. 
Applicants: NEXUS Gas 

Transmission, LLC. 
Description: § 4(d) Rate Filing: 

Negotiated Rate—CNX Gas to Spire 
Release to be effective 5/1/2022. 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 17:35 May 06, 2022 Jkt 256001 PO 00000 Frm 00072 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\09MYN1.SGM 09MYN1kh
am

m
on

d 
on

 D
S

K
JM

1Z
7X

2P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 N
O

T
IC

E
S

http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/esubscription.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/esubscription.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/esubscription.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ecomment.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ecomment.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/ecomment.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.asp
http://www.ferc.gov/docs-filing/efiling.asp
mailto:FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov
mailto:FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov
http://www.ferc.gov

		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-04-27T02:52:24-0400
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




