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consultation with the Secretary of State, 
the Secretary of Homeland Security, and 
the Attorney General: 

(i) To be owned, controlled, or 
directed by, or to have acted or 
purported to act for or on behalf of, 
directly or indirectly, any person whose 
property and interests in property are 
blocked pursuant to paragraphs (a)(1) 
through (a)(4) of this section; 

(ii) To own or control, directly or 
indirectly, any person whose property 
and interests in property are blocked 
pursuant to paragraphs (a)(1) through 
(a)(4) of this section; 

(iii) To have materially assisted, 
sponsored, or provided financial, 
material, or technological support for, or 
goods or services to or in support of, an 
act of terrorism as defined in § 594.311, 
or any person whose property and 
interest in property are blocked 
pursuant to paragraphs (a)(1) through 
(a)(4) of this section; 

(iv) To have participated in training 
related to terrorism provided by any 
person whose property and interests in 
property are blocked pursuant to 
paragraphs (a)(1) through (a)(4) of this 
section; 

(v) To be a leader or official of an 
entity whose property and interests in 
property are blocked pursuant to: 

(A) A determination by the Secretary 
of the Treasury pursuant to paragraph 
(a)(3) of this section; or 

(B) Paragraph (a)(4) of this section; or 
(vi) To have attempted or conspired to 

engage in any of the activities described 
in paragraphs (a)(3)(i) through (a)(3)(v) 
of this section; 

(4) Persons whose property and 
interests in property were blocked 
pursuant to E.O. 12947, as amended, on 
or after January 23, 1995, and remained 
blocked immediately prior to 12:01 a.m. 
eastern daylight time on September 24, 
2001; 
* * * * * 

Subpart C—Definitions 

■ 3. Revise § 594.302 to read as follows: 

§ 594.302 Effective Date 
The term effective date refers to the 

effective date of the applicable 
prohibitions and directives contained in 
this part as follows: 

(a)(1) With respect to a person whose 
property and interests in property are 
blocked pursuant to § 594.201(a)(1) and 
who appeared on the Annex to E.O. 
13224 as issued on September 23, 2001, 
12:01 a.m. eastern daylight time, 
September 24, 2001; 

(2) With respect to a person whose 
property and interests in property are 
blocked pursuant to § 594.201(a)(1) and 

who was added to the Annex to E.O. 
13224 after September 23, 2001, the date 
the person was added to the Annex to 
E.O. 13224, as amended; 

(b) With respect to a person whose 
property or interests in property are 
blocked pursuant to § 594.201(a)(2) 
through (a)(11), the earlier of the date of 
actual or constructive notice that such 
person’s property and interests in 
property are blocked pursuant to one or 
more of these sections. 

(c) For the purposes of this section, 
constructive notice is the date that a 
notice of the blocking of the relevant 
person’s property and interests in 
property is published in the Federal 
Register. 

§ 594.316 [Removed and Reserved] 

■ 4. Remove and reserve § 594.316. 

§ 594.317 [Amended] 

■ 5. Amend § 594.317 by removing 
‘‘§ 594.201(a)(4)(i) of’’. 

§ 594.802 [Amended] 

■ 6. In § 594.802, add ’’ Presidential 
Memorandum of January 15, 2019: 
Delegation of Functions and Authorities 
Under the Hizballah International 
Financing Prevention Act of 2015, as 
Amended, and the Hizballah 
International Financing Prevention 
Amendments Act of 2018, and 
Presidential Memorandum of May 24, 
2019: Delegation of Functions and 
Authorities Under the Sanctioning the 
Use of Civilians as Defenseless Shields 
Act,’’ after ‘‘(Pub. L. 115–44),’’. 

Andrea M. Gacki, 
Director, Office of Foreign Assets Control. 
Brian E. Nelson, 
Under Secretary, Office of Terrorism and 
Financial Intelligence, Department of the 
Treasury. 
[FR Doc. 2022–13969 Filed 6–30–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4810–AL–P 

DEPARTMENT OF DEFENSE 

Department of the Air Force 

32 CFR Part 842 

Administrative Claims 

CFR Correction 

This rule is being published by the 
Office of the Federal Register to correct 
an editorial or technical error that 
appeared in the most recent annual 
revision of the Code of Federal 
Regulations. 
■ In Title 32 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations, Parts 800 to End, revised as 

of July 1, 2021, in § 842.55, reinstate 
paragraph (r) to read as follows: 

§ 842.55 Claims not payable 

* * * * * 
(r) Is one for which a foreign 

government is responsible under SOFA, 
treaty, or other agreement. However, 
AFLOA/JACC may authorize payment of 
a claim where the foreign government 
refuses to recognize its legal 
responsibilities and the claimant has no 
other means of compensation. 
* * * * * 
[FR Doc. 2022–14301 Filed 6–30–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 0099–10–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Coast Guard 

33 CFR Part 165 

[Docket Number USCG–2022–0372] 

RIN 1625–AA00 

Safety Zone; Parade, Willamette River, 
Portland, OR 

AGENCY: Coast Guard, DHS. 
ACTION: Temporary final rule. 

SUMMARY: The Coast Guard is 
establishing a temporary safety zone for 
certain waters of the Willamette River. 
This action is necessary to provide for 
the safety of participants and the 
maritime public during a float parade on 
the Willamette River in Portland, 
Oregon on July 10, 2022. This regulation 
prohibits non-participant persons and 
vessels from being in the safety zone 
unless authorized by the Captain of the 
Port Columbia River or a designated 
representative. 

DATES: This rule is effective from 10:30 
a.m. to 6:30 p.m. on July 10, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: To view documents 
mentioned in this preamble as being 
available in the docket, go to https://
www.regulations.gov, type USCG–2022– 
0372 in the search box and click 
‘‘Search.’’ Next, in the Document Type 
column, select ‘‘Supporting & Related 
Material.’’ 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have questions on this rule, call or 
email LT Sean Murphy, Waterways 
Management Division, Marine Safety 
Unit Portland, U.S. Coast Guard; 
telephone 503–240–9319, email D13- 
SMB-MSUPortlandWWM@uscg.mil. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
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