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including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
New Collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: Semi-
annual Progress Report for the Safe 
Havens: Supervised Visitation and Safe 
Exchange Grant Program. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: None. U.S. 
Department of Justice, Office on 
Violence Against Women. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: The affected public 
includes the 33 grantees from the Safe 
Havens: Supervised Visitation and Safe 
Exchange Grant Program who are States, 
Indian tribal governments, and units of 
local government. The Safe Havens 
Program provides an opportunity for 
communities to support the supervised 
visitation and safe exchange of children, 
by and between parents, in situations 
involving domestic violence, child 
abuse, sexual assault, or stalking. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that it will 
take the 33 respondents (grantees from 
the Safe Havens: Supervised Visitation 
and Safe Exchange Grant Program) 
approximately one hour to complete a 
semi-annual progress report. The Semi-
annual Progress Report is divided into 
sections that pertain to the different 
types of activities that grantees may 
engage in with grant funds. Grantees 
must complete only those sections that 
are relevant to their activities. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The total annual hour burden 
to complete the Semi-annual Progress 
Report is 66 hours. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Brenda E. Dyer, Department 
Deputy Clearance Officer, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Justice Management 
Division, Department of Justice, Patrick 

Henry Building, Suite 1600, 601 D 
Street NW., Washington, D.C. 20530.

Dated: August 22, 2003. 
Brenda E. Dyer, 
Department Deputy Clearance Officer, 
Department of Justice.
[FR Doc. 03–21994 Filed 8–27–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–18–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Office on Violence Against Women; 
Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested

ACTION: 60-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Semi-Annual 
Progress Report for the Grants to State 
Sexual Assault and Domestic Violence 
Coalitions Program. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ) 
Office on Violence Against Women has 
submitted the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
The proposed information collection is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. Comments 
are encouraged and will be accepted for 
‘‘sixty days’’ until October 27, 2003. 
This process is conducted in accordance 
with 5 CFR 1320.10. 

If you have comments especially on 
the estimated public burden or 
associated response time, suggestions, 
or need a copy of the proposed 
information collection instrument with 
instructions or additional information, 
please contact Cynthia J. Schwimer, 
Comptroller (202) 307–0623, Office of 
Justice Programs, U.S. Department of 
Justice, 810 Seventh Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20531. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 
information are encouraged. Your 
comments should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
New collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: Semi-
annual Progress Report for Grants to 
State Sexual Assault and Domestic 
Violence Coalitions Program. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: None. U.S. 
Department of Justice, Office on 
Violence Against Women. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: The affected public 
includes the 88 grantees from the Grants 
to State Sexual Assault and Domestic 
Violence Coalitions Program. The 
Grants to State Sexual Assault and 
Domestic Violence Coalitions Program 
is intended to provide federal financial 
assistance to state coalitions to support 
the coordination of state victim services 
activities, and collaboration and 
coordination with federal, state, and 
local entities engaged in violence 
against women activities. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that it will 
take the 88 respondents (grantees from 
the Grants to State Sexual Assault and 
Domestic Violence Coalitions Program) 
approximately one hour to complete a 
semi-annual progress report. The Semi-
annual Progress Report is divided into 
sections that pertain to the different 
types of activities that grantees may 
engage in with grant funds. Grantees 
must complete only those sections that 
are relevant to their activities. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: The estimated total annual 
hour burden to complete the Semi-
annual Progress Report is 176 hours. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Brenda E. Dyer, Department 
Deputy Clearance Officer, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Justice Management 
Division, Department of Justice, Patrick 
Henry Building, Suite 1600, 601 D 
Street, NW., Washington, DC 20530.
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Dated: August 22, 2003. 
Brenda E. Dyer, 
Department Deputy Clearance Officer, 
Department of Justice.
[FR Doc. 03–22011 Filed 8–27–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–18–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Federal Bureau of Investigation 

Meeting of the Compact Council for the 
National Crime Prevention and Privacy 
Compact

AGENCY: Federal Bureau of 
Investigation, DOJ.
ACTION: Meeting notice.

SUMMARY: The purpose of this notice is 
to announce a meeting of the Compact 
Council created by the National Crime 
Prevention and Privacy Compact Act of 
1998 (Compact). Thus far, the federal 
government and 19 states are parties to 
the Compact which governs the 
exchange of criminal history records for 
licensing, employment, and similar 
purposes. The Compact also provides a 
legal framework for the establishment of 
a cooperative federal-state system to 
exchange such records. 

The United States Attorney General 
appointed 15 persons from federal and 
state agencies to serve on the Compact 
Council. The Council will prescribe 
system rules and procedures for the 
effective and proper operation of the 
Interstate Identification Index system. 

Matters for discussion are expected to 
include: 

(1) Noncriminal Justice Outscourcing 
Initiatives and the Development of a 
Security and Management Control 
Outsourcing Standard; and 

(2) Searching Federal Civil 
Fingerprint Records on Applicants in 
Positions of Trust; and 

(3) Critique on the Draft Compliance 
Sanctions Rule; and 

(4) FBI National Fingerprint File 
Qualification Requirements and Audit 
Criteria. 

The meeting will be open to the 
public on a first-come, first-seated basis. 
Any member of the public wishing to 
file a written statement with the 
Compact Council or wishing to address 
this session of the Compact Council 
should notify Mr. Todd C. Commodore 
at (304) 625–2803, at least 24 hours 
prior to the start of the session. The 
notification should contain the 
requestor’s name and corporate 
designation, consumer affiliation, or 
government designation, along with a 
short statement describing the topic to 
be addressed, and the time needed for 
the presentation. Requestors will 

ordinarily be allowed up to 15 minutes 
to present a topic.
DATES: The Compact Council will meet 
in open session from 9 a.m. until 5 p.m., 
on October 2–3, 2003.
ADDRESSES: The meeting will take place 
at the Radisson Hotel Old Town 
Alexandria, 901 North Fairfax Street, 
Alexandria, Virginia, telephone (703) 
683–6000.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Inquiries may be addressed to Mr. Todd 
C. Commodore, FBI Compact Officer, 
Compact Council Office, Module C3, 
1000 Custer Hollow Road, Clarksburg, 
West Virginia 26306–0148, telephone 
(304) 625–2803, facsimile (304) 625–
5388.

Dated: August 15, 2003. 
Monte C. Strait, 
Section Chief, Programs Development 
Section, Criminal Justice Information Services 
Division, Federal Bureau of Investigation.
[FR Doc. 03–22036 Filed 8–27–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–02–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Office of Justice Programs 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comments Requested

ACTION: 60-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Semi-annual 
Progress Report for the Grants to Reduce 
Violent Crimes Against Women on 
Campus Program. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Office on Violence Against Women has 
submitted the following information 
collection request to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
review and approval in accordance with 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 
The proposed information collection is 
published to obtain comments from the 
public and affected agencies. Comments 
are encouraged and will be accepted for 
‘‘sixty days’’ until October 27, 2003. 
This process is conducted in accordance 
with 5 CFR 1320.10. 

If you have comments especially on 
the estimated public burden or 
associated response time, suggestions, 
or need a copy of the proposed 
information collection instrument with 
instructions or additional information, 
please contact Cynthia J. Schwimer, 
Comptroller, (202) 307–0623, Office of 
Justice Programs, U.S. Department of 
Justice, 810 Seventh Street, NW., 
Washington, DC 20531. 

Written comments and suggestions 
from the public and affected agencies 
concerning the proposed collection of 

information are encouraged. Your 
comments should address one or more 
of the following four points: 

(1) Evaluate whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

(2) Evaluate the accuracy of the 
agencies estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

(3) Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

(4) Minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on those who 
are to respond, including through the 
use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology, 
e.g., permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of Information Collection: 
Revision of a Currently Approved 
Collection. 

(2) Title of the Form/Collection: Semi-
annual Progress Report for Grants to 
Reduce Violent Crimes Against Women 
on Campus Program. 

(3) Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department of Justice sponsoring the 
collection: Form Number: OMB Number 
1121–0258. The U.S. Department of 
Justice, Office on Violence Against 
Women is sponsoring the collection. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Primary: The affected public 
includes the 100 grantees (institutions 
of higher education) from the Grants to 
Reduce Violent Crimes Against Women 
on Campus Program. Campus Program 
grants may be used to enhance victim 
services and develop programs to 
prevent violent crimes against women 
on campuses. The Campus Program also 
enables institutions of higher education 
to develop and strengthen effective 
security and investigation strategies to 
combat violent crimes against women 
on campuses, including domestic 
violence, dating violence, sexual 
assault, and stalking. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that it will 
take the 100 respondents (grantees from 
the Grants to Reduce Violent Crimes 
Against Women on Campus Program—
institutions of higher education) 
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