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Public comment is invited from 
interested parties. Submissions shall be 
addressed to the Board’s Executive 
Secretary at the following address: 
Office of the Executive Secretary, 
Foreign–Trade Zones Board, Room 
1115, U.S. Department of Commerce, 
1401 Constitution Avenue, NW, 
Washington, DC 20230. The closing 
period for their receipt is November 29, 
2006. 

A copy of the application will be 
available for public inspection at the 
Office of the Foreign–Trade Zones 
Board’s Executive Secretary at the 
address listed above. 

Dated: October 20, 2006. 
Pierre V. Duy, 
Acting Executive Secretary 
[FR Doc. E6–18179 Filed 10–27–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–DS–S 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Bureau of Industry and Security 

Materials Processing Equipment 
Technical Advisory Committee; Notice 
of Open Meeting 

The Materials Processing Equipment 
Technical Advisory Committee 
(MPETAC) will meet on November 16, 
2006 at 9 a.m. in Room 3884 of the 
Herbert C. Hoover Building, 14th Street 
between Pennsylvania and Constitution 
Avenues, NW., Washington, DC. The 
Committee advises the Office of the 
Assistant Secretary for Export 
Administration with respect to technical 
questions that affect the level of export 
controls applicable to materials 
processing equipment and related 
technology. 

Agenda 

1. Opening Remarks and 
Introductions. 

2. Presentation of Papers and 
Comments by the Public. 

3. Presentation from the Office of 
Technology Evaluation. 

4. Report on Wassenaar Experts 
Meeting. 

5. Discussion of MPETAC 2007 
Proposal. 

6. MPETAC Future Activities. 
7. Report on Proposed Changes to the 

Export Administration Regulation. 
8. Other Business. 
The meeting will be open to the 

public and a limited number of seats 
will be available. Reservations are not 
accepted. To the extent that time 
permits, members of the public may 
present oral statements to the 
Committee. Written statements may be 
submitted at any time before or after the 

meeting. However, to facilitate 
distribution of public presentation 
materials to Committee members, the 
Committee suggests that presenters 
forward the public presentation 
materials two weeks prior to Yvette 
Springer at Yspringer@bis.doc.gov. 

For more information, please contact 
Ms. Springer at 202–482–2813. 

Dated: October 24, 2006. 
Yvette Springer, 
Committee Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 06–8956 Filed 10–27–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–JT–M 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
ADMINISTRATION 

(A–570–848) 

Freshwater Crawfish Tail Meat From 
the People’s Republic of China: 
Initiation of Antidumping Duty New 
Shipper Reviews 

AGENCY: Import Administration, 
International Trade Administration, 
Department of Commerce. 
SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of 
Commerce (‘‘the Department’’) has 
received timely requests to conduct new 
shipper reviews of the antidumping 
duty order on freshwater crawfish tail 
meat from the People’s Republic of 
China (‘‘PRC’’). In accordance with 19 
CFR 351.214(d), we are initiating new 
shipper reviews for Anhui Tongxin 
Aquatic Product & Food Co., Ltd. 
(‘‘Anhui Tongxin’’), Huoshan New 
Three–Gold Food Trade Co. Ltd. 
(‘‘Huoshan NTGF’’), Jingdezhen Garay 
Foods Co., Ltd. (‘‘Jingdezhen Garay’’), 
and Shanghai Now Again International 
Trading Co., Ltd. (‘‘Shanghai Now 
Again’’). 
EFFECTIVE DATE: October 30, 2006. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Michael Quigley or Erin Begnal, Office 
9, Import Administration, International 
Trade Administration, U.S. Department 
of Commerce, 14th Street and 
Constitution Avenue, NW, Washington, 
DC 20230; telephone: (202) 482–4047 or 
(202) 482–1442, respectively. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 
The Department received timely 

requests from Anhui Tongxin 
(September 27, 2006), Huoshan NTGF 
(August 30, 2006), Jingdezhen Garay 
(September 20, 2006), and Shanghai 
Now Again (September 20, 2006), 
pursuant to section 751(a)(2)(B) of the 
Tariff Act of 1930, as amended (‘‘the 
Act’’), and 19 CFR 351.214(c), for new 

shipper reviews of the antidumping 
duty order on freshwater crawfish tail 
meat from the PRC. See Notice of 
Amendment to Final Determination of 
Sales at Less than Fair Value and 
Antidumping Duty Order: Freshwater 
Crawfish Tail Meat from the People’s 
Republic of China, 62 FR 48218 
(September 15, 1997). 

Pursuant to 19 CFR 351.214(b)(2)(i) 
and 19 CFR 351.214(b)(2)(iii)(A), in 
their requests for review, Anhui 
Tongxin, Huoshan NTGF, Jingdezhen 
Garay, and Shanghai Now Again 
certified that they did not export the 
subject merchandise to the United 
States during the period of investigation 
(‘‘POI’’) and that since the initiation of 
the investigation they have never been 
affiliated with any company which 
exported subject merchandise to the 
United States during the POI. Pursuant 
to 19 CFR 351.214(b)(2)(iii)(B), Huoshan 
NTGF, Jingdezhen Garay, and Shanghai 
Now Again further certified that their 
export activities are not controlled by 
the central government of the PRC. 

Pursuant to 19 CFR 
351.214(b)(2)(ii)(B), Rudong Smooth 
Food Co., Ltd. (‘‘Rudong Smooth’’), the 
producer of the subject merchandise for 
Shanghai Now Again during the period 
of review (‘‘POR’’), certified that it did 
not export or produce for export to the 
United States during the POI, and has 
never been affiliated with any exporter 
or producer who exported the subject 
merchandise to the United States during 
the POI. Rudong Smooth further 
certified that its export activities are not 
controlled by the central government of 
the PRC. 

In accordance with 19 CFR 
351.214(b)(2)(iv), Anhui Tongxin, 
Huoshan NTGF, Jingdezhen Garay, and 
Shanghai Now Again, respectively, 
submitted documentation establishing 
the following: (1) the date on which 
they first shipped subject merchandise 
for export to the United States and the 
date on which the subject merchandise 
was first entered, or withdrawn from 
warehouse, for consumption; (2) the 
volume of their first shipment; and (3) 
the date of their first sale to an 
unaffiliated customer in the United 
States. 

In addition, the Department 
conducted customs database queries to 
confirm that Anhui Tongxin’s, Huoshan 
NTGF’s, Jingdezhen Garay’s, and 
Shanghai Now Again’s shipments of 
subject merchandise had entered the 
United States for consumption and had 
been suspended for antidumping duties. 

Initiation of Reviews 
In accordance with section 

751(a)(2)(B) of the Act, and 19 CFR 
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