
37621 Federal Register / Vol. 80, No. 126 / Wednesday, July 1, 2015 / Notices 

FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE 
CORPORATION 

Notice to All Interested Parties of the 
Termination of the Receivership of 
10304, The First National Bank of 
Barnesville, Barnesville, GA 

Notice is hereby given that the Federal 
Deposit Insurance Corporation (‘‘FDIC’’) 
as Receiver for The First National Bank 
of Barnesville, Barnesville, GA (‘‘the 
Receiver’’) intends to terminate its 
receivership for said institution. The 
FDIC was appointed receiver of The 
First National Bank of Barnesville on 
October 22, 2010. The liquidation of the 
receivership assets has been completed. 
To the extent permitted by available 
funds and in accordance with law, the 
Receiver will be making a final dividend 
payment to proven creditors. 

Based upon the foregoing, the 
Receiver has determined that the 
continued existence of the receivership 
will serve no useful purpose. 
Consequently, notice is given that the 
receivership shall be terminated, to be 
effective no sooner than thirty days after 
the date of this Notice. If any person 
wishes to comment concerning the 
termination of the receivership, such 
comment must be made in writing and 
sent within thirty days of the date of 
this Notice to: Federal Deposit 
Insurance Corporation, Division of 
Resolutions and Receiverships, 
Attention: Receivership Oversight 
Department 32.1, 1601 Bryan Street, 
Dallas, TX 75201. 

No comments concerning the 
termination of this receivership will be 
considered which are not sent within 
this time frame. 

Dated: June 26, 2015. 
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation. 
Robert E. Feldman, 
Executive Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2015–16161 Filed 6–30–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6714–01–P 

FEDERAL RESERVE SYSTEM 

Formations of, Acquisitions by, and 
Mergers of Bank Holding Companies 

The companies listed in this notice 
have applied to the Board for approval, 
pursuant to the Bank Holding Company 

Act of 1956 (12 U.S.C. 1841 et seq.) 
(BHC Act), Regulation Y (12 CFR part 
225), and all other applicable statutes 
and regulations to become a bank 
holding company and/or to acquire the 
assets or the ownership of, control of, or 
the power to vote shares of a bank or 
bank holding company and all of the 
banks and nonbanking companies 
owned by the bank holding company, 
including the companies listed below. 

The applications listed below, as well 
as other related filings required by the 
Board, are available for immediate 
inspection at the Federal Reserve Bank 
indicated. The applications will also be 
available for inspection at the offices of 
the Board of Governors. Interested 
persons may express their views in 
writing on the standards enumerated in 
the BHC Act (12 U.S.C. 1842(c)). If the 
proposal also involves the acquisition of 
a nonbanking company, the review also 
includes whether the acquisition of the 
nonbanking company complies with the 
standards in section 4 of the BHC Act 
(12 U.S.C. 1843). Unless otherwise 
noted, nonbanking activities will be 
conducted throughout the United States. 

Unless otherwise noted, comments 
regarding each of these applications 
must be received at the Reserve Bank 
indicated or the offices of the Board of 
Governors not later than July 27, 2015. 

A. Federal Reserve Bank of Atlanta 
(Chapelle Davis, Assistant Vice 
President) 1000 Peachtree Street NE., 
Atlanta, Georgia 30309: 

1. Atlantic Capital Bancshares, Inc., 
Atlanta, Georgia; to merge with First 
Security Group, Inc., and thereby 
acquire FSGBank, NA, both in 
Chattanooga, Tennessee. 

In connection with this applicantion, 
Atlantic Capital Bancshares’ parent 
companies BankCap Equity Fund, LLC; 
BankCap Partners GP L.P.; BankCap 
Partners Fund I, L.P.; and BCP Fund I 
Southeast Holdings, LLC, all in Dallas, 
Texas, will indirectly acquire First 
Security Group, Inc., and FSGBank, NA, 
both in Chattanooga, Tennessee. 

Board of Governors of the Federal Reserve 
System, June 26, 2015. 
Margaret McCloskey Shanks, 
Deputy Secretary of the Board. 
[FR Doc. 2015–16157 Filed 6–30–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6210–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Administration for Children and 
Families 

Proposed Information Collection 
Activity; Comment Request 

Title: Goal-Oriented Adult Learning in 
Self-Sufficiency Study. 

OMB No.: New Collection. 
Description: The Administration for 

Children and Families (ACF) is 
proposing a data collection activity as 
part of the Goal-Oriented Adult 
Learning in Self-Sufficiency (GOALS) 
study. The purpose of the GOALS 
project is to address the nexus between 
the growing knowledge base in the 
psychological sciences and long- 
standing approaches to self-sufficiency 
programs targeted to adults and young 
adults. The project will explore the 
programmatic implications of existing 
research on psychological processes 
associated with goal-directed behaviors, 
including socio-emotional regulation 
and cognitive skills, executive 
functioning, and related areas. The 
project will synthesize current research 
on these topics; address how insights 
gained from research can be used to 
promote economic advancement among 
low-income populations, identify 
promising strategies, or strengthen 
underlying skills in these areas; and 
inform measurement of changes and 
developments in skill acquisition. 

The proposed information collection 
activity consists of exploratory calls 
with program directors and 
administrators, semi-structured 
interviews with key program staff and 
community partner organization staff, 
and focus group discussions with 
program participants. ACF seeks to gain 
an in-depth, systematic understanding 
of program administration and 
implementation, service delivery and 
operation, outputs and outcomes, and 
identify promising practices and other 
areas for further study. 

Respondents: Key program directors 
and administrators, program staff and 
community partner organization staff, 
and program participants at selected 
program sites. 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES 

Instrument 
Total Number 
of Respond-

ents 

Annual Num-
ber of Re-
spondents 

Number of Re-
sponses per 
Respondent 

Average Bur-
den Hours per 

Response 

Annual Burden 
Hours 

Exploratory telephone call semi-structured interview—pro-
gram directors and administrators ................................... 24 12 1 1 12 

VerDate Sep<11>2014 18:30 Jun 30, 2015 Jkt 235001 PO 00000 Frm 00042 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\01JYN1.SGM 01JYN1tk
el

le
y 

on
 D

S
K

3S
P

T
V

N
1P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 N

O
T

IC
E

S



37622 Federal Register / Vol. 80, No. 126 / Wednesday, July 1, 2015 / Notices 

ANNUAL BURDEN ESTIMATES—Continued 

Instrument 
Total Number 
of Respond-

ents 

Annual Num-
ber of Re-
spondents 

Number of Re-
sponses per 
Respondent 

Average Bur-
den Hours per 

Response 

Annual Burden 
Hours 

Site visit semi-structured interview—program staff and 
community partner organization staff ............................... 180 90 1 1.25 113 

Site visit group discussion—program participants ............... 84 42 1 1.25 53 

Estimated Total Annual Burden Hours ......................... ........................ ........................ ........................ ........................ 178 

In compliance with the requirements 
of Section 3506(c)(2)(A) of the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, the 
Administration for Children and 
Families is soliciting public comment 
on the specific aspects of the 
information collection described above. 
Copies of the proposed collection of 
information can be obtained and 
comments may be forwarded by writing 
to the Administration for Children and 
Families, Office of Planning, Research 
and Evaluation, 370 L’Enfant 
Promenade SW., Washington, DC 20447, 
Attn: OPRE Reports Clearance Officer. 
Email address: OPREinfocollection@
acf.hhs.gov. All requests should be 
identified by the title of the information 
collection. 

The Department specifically requests 
comments on (a) whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information shall have 
practical utility; (b) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information; (c) 
the quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Consideration will be given to 
comments and suggestions submitted 
within 60 days of this publication. 

Karl Koerper, 
Reports Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2015–16073 Filed 6–30–15; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4184–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND 
HUMAN SERVICES 

Food and Drug Administration 

[Docket No. FDA–2011–N–0742] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission for Office of 
Management and Budget Review; 
Comment Request; Registration of 
Producers of Drugs and Listing of 
Drugs in Commercial Distribution 

AGENCY: Food and Drug Administration, 
HHS. 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Food and Drug 
Administration (FDA) is announcing 
that a proposed collection of 
information has been submitted to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and clearance under 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 

DATES: Fax written comments on the 
collection of information by July 31, 
2015. 

ADDRESSES: To ensure that comments on 
the information collection are received, 
OMB recommends that written 
comments be faxed to the Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
OMB, Attn: FDA Desk Officer, FAX: 
202–395–7285, or emailed to oira_
submission@omb.eop.gov. All 
comments should be identified with the 
OMB control number 0910–0045. Also 
include the FDA docket number found 
in brackets in the heading of this 
document. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: FDA 
PRA Staff, Office of Operations, Food 
and Drug Administration, 8455 
Colesville Rd., COLE–14526, Silver 
Spring, MD 20993–0002, PRAStaff@
fda.hhs.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
compliance with 44 U.S.C. 3507, FDA 
has submitted the following proposed 
collection of information to OMB for 
review and clearance. 

Registration of Producers of Drugs and 
Listing of Drugs in Commercial 
Distribution—21 CFR Part 207 

OMB Control Number 0910–0045— 
Extension 

Requirements for drug establishment 
registration and drug listing are set forth 
in section 510 of the Federal Food, 
Drug, and Cosmetic Act (the FD&C Act) 
(21 U.S.C. 360), section 351 of the 
Public Health Service Act (42 U.S.C. 
262), and part 207 (21 CFR part 207). 
Fundamental to FDA’s mission to 
protect the public health is the 
collection of this information, which is 
used for important activities such as 
postmarket surveillance for serious 
adverse drug reactions, inspection of 
drug manufacturing and processing 
facilities, and monitoring of drug 
products imported into the United 
States. Comprehensive, accurate, and up 
to date information is critical to 
conducting these activities with 
efficiency and effectiveness. 

Under section 510 of the FD&C Act, 
FDA is authorized to establish a system 
for registration of producers of drugs 
and for listing of drugs in commercial 
distribution. To implement section 510 
of the FD&C Act, FDA issued part 207. 
Under current § 207.20, manufacturers, 
repackers, and relabelers that engage in 
the manufacture, preparation, 
propagation, compounding, or 
processing of human or veterinary drugs 
and biological products, including bulk 
drug substances and bulk drug 
substances for prescription 
compounding, and drug premixes as 
well as finished dosage forms, whether 
prescription or over-the-counter, are 
required to register their establishment. 
In addition, manufacturers, repackers, 
and relabelers are required to submit a 
listing of every drug or biological 
product in commercial distribution. 
Owners or operators of establishments 
that distribute under their own label or 
trade name a drug product 
manufactured by a registered 
establishment are not required either to 
register or list. However, distributors 
may elect to submit drug listing 
information in lieu of the registered 
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