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perform its functions; (b) whether the 
burden estimates are accurate; (c) 
whether there are ways to minimize the 
burden, including through the use of 
automated techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and (d) whether 
there are ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information. 

Summary of Information Collection 

Title of Collection: Reports to SBA 
Provisions of 13 CFR 120.464. 

Description of Respondents: Small 
Business Lending Companies (SBLCs) 
and Non-federally regulated lenders 
(NFRLs). 

Total Estimated Annual Responses: 
594. 

Total Estimated Annual Hour Burden: 
7,110. 

Curtis Rich, 
Management Analyst. 
[FR Doc. 2017–24604 Filed 11–13–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8025–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF STATE 

[Public Notice 10196] 

Review of the Designation as a Foreign 
Terrorist Organization of Islamic 
Resistance Movement (Hamas and 
Other Aliases) 

Based upon a review of the 
Administrative Record assembled 
pursuant to Section 219(a)(4)(C) of the 
Immigration and Nationality Act, as 
amended (8 U.S.C. 1189(a)(4)(C)) 
(‘‘INA’’), and in consultation with the 
Attorney General and the Secretary of 
the Treasury, I conclude that the 
circumstances that were the basis for the 
designation of the aforementioned 
organization as a Foreign Terrorist 
Organization have not changed in such 
a manner as to warrant revocation of the 
designation and that the national 
security of the United States does not 
warrant a revocation of the designation. 
Therefore, I hereby determine that the 
designation of the aforementioned 
organization as a Foreign Terrorist 
Organization, pursuant to Section 219 of 
the INA (8 U.S.C. 1189), shall be 
maintained. 

This determination shall be published 
in the Federal Register. 

Rex W. Tillerson, 
Secretary of State. 
[FR Doc. 2017–24598 Filed 11–13–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4710–AD–P 

SURFACE TRANSPORTATION BOARD 

Release of Waybill Data 

AGENCY: Surface Transportation Board. 
ACTION: Notice; correction. 

SUMMARY: The Surface Transportation 
Board (STB) published a document in 
the Federal Register on October 30, 
2017, concerning a request from 
Thompson Hine LLP, on behalf of itself, 
Economists, and L.E. Peabody & 
Associates (WB17–44—10/20/17) for 
permission to use certain unmasked 
data from the Board’s 2006–2016 
Carload Waybill Samples. STB is 
correcting the deadline objections to the 
request are due. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Alexander Dusenberry, (202) 245–0319. 

Correction 

In the Federal Register of October 30, 
2017, in FR 2017–23454, on page 50220, 
in the second column, in the first full 
paragraph correct the first sentence to 
read as follows: 

The waybill sample contains 
confidential railroad and shipper data; 
therefore, if any parties object to these 
requests, they should file their 
objections with the Director of the 
Board’s Office of Economics by 
November 22, 2017. 

Jeffrey Herzig, 
Clearance Clerk. 
[FR Doc. 2017–24627 Filed 11–13–17; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4915–01–P 

OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES 
TRADE REPRESENTATIVE 

[Docket Number USTR–2017–0020] 

Additional Information About 
Participating in the Process 
Concerning the Administration’s 
Action Following a Determination of 
Import Injury With Regard to Certain 
Crystalline Silicon Photovoltaic Cells 

AGENCY: Office of the United States 
Trade Representative. 
ACTION: Additional information about 
participation; request for comments and 
notice of public hearing. 

SUMMARY: In a Federal Register notice 
dated October 25, 2017 (82 FR 49469), 
the Office of the United States Trade 
Representative (USTR), on behalf of the 
Trade Policy Staff Committee (TPSC), 
announced a process to allow interested 
parties to submit views and evidence on 
the appropriateness of safeguard 
measures recommended by the United 
States International Trade Commission 

(ITC) concerning certain the import of 
crystalline silicon photovoltaic (CSPV) 
cells. This notice provides additional 
information on the TPSC process. 

DATES: November 20, 2017 at midnight 
EST: Deadline for submission of written 
comments and requests to testify at the 
public hearing. 

November 29, 2017 at midnight EST: 
Deadline for submission of written 
responses to the initial round of 
comments. 

December 6, 2017 at 9:30 a.m. EST: 
The TPSC will hold a public hearing in 
Rooms 1 and 2, 1724 F Street NW., 
Washington DC. 

ADDRESSES: USTR strongly prefers 
electronic submissions made through 
the Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the 
instructions for submitting comments in 
section III of the Federal Register notice 
of October 25, 2017 (82 FR 49469). The 
docket number is USTR–2017–0020. For 
alternatives to on-line submissions, 
please contact Yvonne Jamison, Trade 
Policy Staff Committee at (202) 395– 
9666. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Victor Mroczka, Office of WTO and 
Multilateral Affairs, at Victor_S_
Mroczka@ustr.eop.gov or (202) 395– 
9450, or Dax Terrill, Office of the 
General Counsel, at Dax.Terrill@
ustr.eop.gov or (202) 395–4739. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
response to inquiries from interested 
parties, USTR is providing the following 
clarifying information about the 
procedures for participation in the TPSC 
process. Please review the Federal 
Register notice of October 25, 2017 (82 
FR 49469) for more complete 
information. The clarifications are: 

• You should include a summary of 
no more than two pages that identifies 
the key points with your written 
comment. 

• The deadline to submit both written 
comments and requests to testify at the 
hearing is November 20, 2017 at 
midnight EST. A request to testify must 
include your comments. 

• The TPSC will not accept written 
testimony at the hearing. You must 
include any materials you intend to use 
during your testimony with the written 
comments you submitted. 

Edward Gresser, 
Chair of the Trade Policy Staff Committee, 
Office of the United States Trade 
Representative. 
[FR Doc. 2017–24596 Filed 11–13–17; 8:45 am] 
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