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how to prevent or reduce the burden of 
Alzheimer’s disease and related 
dementias (ADRD) on people with the 
disease and their caregivers. During the 
meeting on January 22, 2024, the 
Advisory Council will hear updates 
from the field on implementation of 
disease-modifying therapies for 
Alzheimer’s disease and outstanding 
research questions. A panel will present 
on the latest research on diagnosis and 
development of treatments for other 
populations and causes of dementia. 
DATES: The meeting will be January 22, 
2024 from 9:30 p.m. to 4:30 p.m. EST. 
ADDRESSES: The meeting will be a 
hybrid of in-person and virtual. The 
meeting will be held in Room 800 of the 
Hubert H. Humphrey Building, 200 
Independence Avenue SW, Washington, 
DC 20201. It will also stream live at 
www.hhs.gov/live. 

Comments: Time is allocated on the 
agenda to hear public comments from 
4:00 p.m. to 4:30 p.m. The time for oral 
comments will be limited to two (2) 
minutes per individual. In order to 
provide a public comment, please 
register by emailing your name to 
napa@hhs.gov by Wednesday, January 
17. Registered commenters will receive 
both a dial-in number and a link to join 
the meeting virtually; individuals will 
have the choice to either join virtually 
via the link, or to call in only by using 
the dial-in number. Note: There may be 
a 30–45 second delay in the livestream 
video presentation of the conference. 
For this reason, if you have pre- 
registered to submit a public comment, 
it is important to connect to the meeting 
by 3:45 p.m. to ensure that you do not 
miss your name and allotted time when 
called. If you miss your name and 
allotted time to speak, you may not be 
able to make your public comment. 
Public commenters will not be admitted 
to the virtual meeting before 3:30 p.m. 
but are encouraged to watch the meeting 
at www.hhs.gov/live. Should you have 
questions during the session, please 
email napa@hhs.gov and someone will 
respond to your message as quickly as 
possible. 

In order to ensure accuracy, please 
submit a written copy of oral comments 
for the record by emailing napa@
hhs.gov by Tuesday, January 23, 2024. 
These comments will be shared on the 
website and reflected in the meeting 
minutes. 

In lieu of oral comments, formal 
written comments may be submitted for 
the record by Tuesday, January 23, 2024 
to Helen Lamont, Ph.D., OASPE, 200 
Independence Avenue SW, Room 424E, 
Washington, DC 20201. Comments may 
also be sent to napa@hhs.gov. Those 

submitting written comments should 
identify themselves and any relevant 
organizational affiliations. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Helen Lamont, 202–260–6075, 
helen.lamont@hhs.gov. Note: The 
meeting will be available to the public 
live at www.hhs.gov/live. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Notice of 
these meetings is given under the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (5 
U.S.C. App. 2, section 10(a)(1) and 
(a)(2)). Topics of the Meeting: 
subcommittee recommendations, NIA 
bypass budget, FDA drug coverage 
decisions, and CDC Health Brain 
Initiative. 

Procedure and Agenda: The meeting 
will be webcast at www.hhs.gov/live and 
video recordings will be added to the 
National Alzheimer’s Project Act 
website when available after the 
meeting. This meeting is open to the 
public. Please allow 30 minutes to go 
through security and walk to the 
meeting room. Participants joining in 
person should note that seating may be 
limited. Those wishing to attend the 
meeting in person must send an email 
to napa@hhs.gov and put ‘‘January 22 
Meeting Attendance’’ in the subject line 
by Wednesday, January 17 so that their 
names may be put on a list of expected 
attendees and forwarded to the security 
officers at the Department of Health and 
Human Services. Any interested 
member of the public who is a non-U.S. 
citizen should include this information 
at the time of registration to ensure that 
the appropriate security procedure to 
gain entry to the building is carried out. 
Although the meeting is open to the 
public, procedures governing security 
and the entrance to Federal buildings 
may change without notice. If you wish 
to make a public comment, you must 
note that within your email. 

Authority: 42 U.S.C. 11225; Section 
2(e)(3) of the National Alzheimer’s 
Project Act. The panel is governed by 
provisions of Public Law 92–463, as 
amended (5 U.S.C. Appendix 2), which 
sets forth standards for the formation 
and use of advisory committees. 

Dated: December 22, 2023. 

Miranda Lynch-Smith, 
Deputy Assistant Secretary for Human 
Services Policy, Performing the Delegable 
Duties of the Assistant Secretary for Planning 
and Evaluation. 
[FR Doc. 2023–29020 Filed 1–4–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4150–05–P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

U.S. Customs and Border Protection 

[OMB Control Number 1651–0074] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Extension; Prior Disclosure 

AGENCY: U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection (CBP), Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Department of Homeland 
Security, U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection (CBP) will be submitting the 
following information collection request 
to the Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (PRA). The 
information collection is published in 
the Federal Register to obtain comments 
from the public and affected agencies. 
DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
must be submitted (no later than March 
5, 2024) to be assured of consideration. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and/or 
suggestions regarding the item(s) 
contained in this notice must include 
the OMB Control Number 1651–0074 in 
the subject line and the agency name. 
Please use the following method to 
submit comments: 

Email. Submit comments to: CBP_
PRA@cbp.dhs.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional PRA information 
should be directed to Seth Renkema, 
Chief, Economic Impact Analysis 
Branch, U.S. Customs and Border 
Protection, Office of Trade, Regulations 
and Rulings, 90 K Street NE, 10th Floor, 
Washington, DC 20229–1177, 
Telephone number 202–325–0056 or via 
email CBP_PRA@cbp.dhs.gov. Please 
note that the contact information 
provided here is solely for questions 
regarding this notice. Individuals 
seeking information about other CBP 
programs should contact the CBP 
National Customer Service Center at 
877–227–5511, (TTY) 1–800–877–8339, 
or CBP website at https://www.cbp. 
gov/. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: CBP 
invites the general public and other 
Federal agencies to comment on the 
proposed and/or continuing information 
collections pursuant to the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 (44 U.S.C. 3501 
et seq.). This process is conducted in 
accordance with 5 CFR 1320.8. Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies should 
address one or more of the following 
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four points: (1) whether the proposed 
collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; (2) the accuracy of the 
agency’s estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; (3) 
suggestions to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information to 
be collected; and (4) suggestions to 
minimize the burden of the collection of 
information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms of 
information technology, e.g., permitting 
electronic submission of responses. The 
comments that are submitted will be 
summarized and included in the request 
for approval. All comments will become 
a matter of public record. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

Title: Prior Disclosure. 
OMB Number: 1651–0076. 
Form Number: N/A. 
Current Actions: CBP proposes to 

extend the expiration date of this 
information collection with a decrease 
in annual burden hours. 

Type of Review: Extension (w/ 
change). 

Affected Public: Businesses. 
Abstract: The Prior Disclosure 

program establishes a method for a 
potential violator to disclose to CBP that 
they have committed an error or a 
violation with respect to the legal 
requirements of entering merchandise 
into the United States, such as 
underpaid tariffs or duties, or 
misclassified merchandise, or regarding 
the payment or credit of any drawback 
claim. The procedure for making a prior 
disclosure is set forth in 19 CFR 162.74. 
This provision requires that respondents 
submit information about the 
merchandise involved, a specification of 
the false statements or omissions, and 
what the true and accurate information 
should be. A valid prior disclosure will 
entitle the disclosing party to the 
reduced penalties pursuant to 19 U.S.C. 
1592(c)(4) or 19 U.S.C. 1593a(c)(3). 

The respondents to this information 
collection are members of the trade 
community who are familiar with CBP 
regulations. 

The information is to be used by CBP 
officers to verify and validate the 
commission of a violation of 19 U.S.C. 
1592 or 19 U.S.C. 1593a by the 
disclosing party. A valid prior 
disclosure will entitle the disclosing 

party to reduced penalties pursuant to 
19 U.S.C. 1592(c)(4) or 19 U.S.C. 
1593a(c)(3). A prior disclosure may be 
submitted orally or in writing to CBP. In 
the case of an oral disclosure, the 
disclosing party shall confirm the 
disclosure in writing within 10 days of 
the date of the oral disclosure. A written 
prior disclosure must be addressed to 
the Commissioner of Customs, have 
conspicuously printed on the face of the 
envelope the words ‘‘prior disclosure,’’ 
and be presented to a Customs officer at 
the Customs port of entry or a Center of 
the disclosed violation. 

Type of Information Collection: 
Estimated Number of Respondents: 

762. 
Estimated Number of Annual 

Responses per Respondent: 1. 
Estimated Number of Total Annual 

Responses: 762. 
Estimated Time per Response: 3 

hours. 
Estimated Total Annual Burden 

Hours: 2,286. 
Dated: January 2, 2024. 

Seth D. Renkema, 
Branch Chief, Economic Impact Analysis 
Branch, U.S. Customs and Border Protection. 
[FR Doc. 2024–00025 Filed 1–4–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND 
SECURITY 

Federal Emergency Management 
Agency 

[Docket ID FEMA–2024–0002] 

Changes in Flood Hazard 
Determinations 

AGENCY: Federal Emergency 
Management Agency, Department of 
Homeland Security. 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: New or modified Base (1- 
percent annual chance) Flood 
Elevations (BFEs), base flood depths, 
Special Flood Hazard Area (SFHA) 
boundaries or zone designations, and/or 
regulatory floodways (hereinafter 
referred to as flood hazard 
determinations) as shown on the 
indicated Letter of Map Revision 
(LOMR) for each of the communities 
listed in the table below are finalized. 
Each LOMR revises the Flood Insurance 
Rate Maps (FIRMs), and in some cases 
the Flood Insurance Study (FIS) reports, 
currently in effect for the listed 
communities. 
DATES: Each LOMR was finalized as in 
the table below. 
ADDRESSES: Each LOMR is available for 
inspection at both the respective 

Community Map Repository address 
listed in the table below and online 
through the FEMA Map Service Center 
at https://msc.fema.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Rick 
Sacbibit, Chief, Engineering Services 
Branch, Federal Insurance and 
Mitigation Administration, FEMA, 400 
C Street SW, Washington, DC 20472, 
(202) 646–7659, or (email) 
patrick.sacbibit@fema.dhs.gov; or visit 
the FEMA Mapping and Insurance 
eXchange (FMIX) online at https://
www.floodmaps.fema.gov/fhm/fmx_
main.html. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Federal Emergency Management Agency 
(FEMA) makes the final flood hazard 
determinations as shown in the LOMRs 
for each community listed in the table 
below. Notice of these modified flood 
hazard determinations has been 
published in newspapers of local 
circulation and 90 days have elapsed 
since that publication. The Deputy 
Associate Administrator for Insurance 
and Mitigation has resolved any appeals 
resulting from this notification. 

The modified flood hazard 
determinations are made pursuant to 
section 206 of the Flood Disaster 
Protection Act of 1973, 42 U.S.C. 4105, 
and are in accordance with the National 
Flood Insurance Act of 1968, 42 U.S.C. 
4001 et seq., and with 44 CFR part 65. 
The currently effective community 
number is shown and must be used for 
all new policies and renewals. 

The new or modified flood hazard 
information is the basis for the 
floodplain management measures that 
the community is required either to 
adopt or to show evidence of being 
already in effect in order to remain 
qualified for participation in the 
National Flood Insurance Program 
(NFIP). 

This new or modified flood hazard 
information, together with the 
floodplain management criteria required 
by 44 CFR 60.3, are the minimum that 
are required. They should not be 
construed to mean that the community 
must change any existing ordinances 
that are more stringent in their 
floodplain management requirements. 
The community may at any time enact 
stricter requirements of its own or 
pursuant to policies established by other 
Federal, State, or regional entities. 

This new or modified flood hazard 
determinations are used to meet the 
floodplain management requirements of 
the NFIP. The changes in flood hazard 
determinations are in accordance with 
44 CFR 65.4. 

Interested lessees and owners of real 
property are encouraged to review the 
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