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(Respondents), alleging that the 
Respondents’ Revised Self-Supply BP 
imposes unjust, unreasonable, unduly 
discriminatory and preferential terms 
and conditions on Bonneville’s self- 
supply of Operating Reserves, as more 
fully explained in the complaint. 

The Complainants certifies that copies 
of the complaint were served on the 
contacts for the Respondents as listed 
on the Commission’s list of Corporate 
Officials. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. The Respondents’ answer 
and all interventions, or protests must 
be filed on or before the comment date. 
The Respondents’ answer, motions to 
intervene, and protests must be served 
on the Complainants’. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

In addition to publishing the full text 
of this document in the Federal 
Register, The Commission provides all 
interested persons an opportunity to 
view and/or print the contents of this 
document via the internet through the 
Commission’s Home Page (http://
www.ferc.gov) using the ‘‘eLibrary’’ link. 
Enter the docket number excluding the 
last three digits in the docket number 
field to access the document. At this 
time, the Commission has suspended 
access to Commission’s Public 
Reference Room, due to the 
proclamation declaring a National 
Emergency concerning the Novel 
Coronavirus Disease (COVID–19), issued 
by the President on March 13, 2020. For 
assistance, contact FERC at 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov or call 
toll-free, (886) 208–3676 or TYY, (202) 
502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
Time on April 15, 2020. 

Dated: March 27, 2020. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–06885 Filed 4–1–20; 8:45 am] 
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Ocean State BTM, LLC; Supplemental 
Notice That Initial Market-Based Rate 
Filing Includes Request for Blanket 
Section 204 Authorization 

This is a supplemental notice in the 
above-referenced proceeding of Ocean 
State BTM, LLC’s application for 
market-based rate authority, with an 
accompanying rate tariff, noting that 
such application includes a request for 
blanket authorization, under 18 CFR 
part 34, of future issuances of securities 
and assumptions of liability. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest should file with the Federal 
Energy Regulatory Commission, 888 
First Street NE, Washington, DC 20426, 
in accordance with Rules 211 and 214 
of the Commission’s Rules of Practice 
and Procedure 

(18 CFR 385.211 and 385.214). 
Anyone filing a motion to intervene or 
protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. 

Notice is hereby given that the 
deadline for filing protests with regard 
to the applicant’s request for blanket 
authorization, under 18 CFR part 34, of 
future issuances of securities and 
assumptions of liability, is April 16, 
2020. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper, using the 
FERC Online links at http://
www.ferc.gov. To facilitate electronic 
service, persons with internet access 
who will eFile a document and/or be 
listed as a contact for an intervenor 
must create and validate an 
eRegistration account using the 
eRegistration link. Select the eFiling 
link to log on and submit the 
intervention or protests. 

Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 5 copies 
of the intervention or protest to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street NE, Washington, DC 
20426. 

The filings in the above-referenced 
proceeding are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system by 
clicking on the appropriate link in the 
above list. They are also available for 

electronic review in the Commission’s 
Public Reference Room in Washington, 
DC. There is an eSubscription link on 
the website that enables subscribers to 
receive email notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please email 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov. or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Dated: March 27, 2020. 
Nathaniel J. Davis, Sr., 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2020–06880 Filed 4–1–20; 8:45 am] 
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Northwest Pipeline LLC; Notice of 
Extension of Time Request 

Take notice that on March 12, 2020, 
Northwest Pipeline LLC (Northwest) 
requested that the Federal Energy 
Regulatory Commission (Commission) 
grant an extension of time, until April 
11, 2022, to construct and place into 
service the facilities for its Kalama 
Lateral Project authorized on April 11, 
2016. The Kalama Lateral Project would 
enable Northwest to provide service to 
the proposed methanol facility of 
Northwest Innovation Works Kalama 
LLC (NWIW). 

Northwest was initially required to 
construct the facilities and place them 
into service by April 11, 2018. On April 
11, 2018, the Office of Energy Projects, 
by delegated order, extended the 
deadline through April 11, 2019. On 
April 10, 2019 the Office of Energy 
Projects, by delegated order, extended 
the deadline through April 11, 2020. 
Northwest now requests a two-year 
extension of this deadline through April 
11, 2022. Northwest states that the basis 
for the previous extensions of time, as 
well as this one, are based upon 
permitting issues encountered by the 
NWIW methanol plant. 

This notice establishes a 15-calendar 
day intervention and comment period 
deadline. Any person wishing to 
comment on the extension motion may 
do so. No reply comments or answers 
will be considered. If you wish to obtain 
legal status by becoming a party to the 
proceedings for this request, you 
should, on or before the comment date 
stated below, file a motion to intervene 
in accordance with the requirements of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
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