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should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–3417 Filed 12–1–04; 8:45 am] 
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[Docket No. RP05–15–001] 

El Paso Natural Gas Company; Notice 
of Compliance Filing 

November 19, 2004. 
Take notice that on November 17, 

2004, El Paso Natural Gas Company (El 
Paso) tendered for filing a compliance 
filing pursuant to the Commission’s 
order issued November 3, 2004, at 
Docket No. RP05–15–000. 

El Paso states that Sub 1st Rev 
Twenty-First Rev Sheet No. 1 and 
Second Revised Sheet No. 2 are filed to 
list the transportation service 
agreements that contain the permissible 
non-conforming provisions identified in 
the Commission’s order issued 
November 3, 2004. The tariff sheets are 
to become effective November 3, 2004. 

El Paso states that copies of its filing 
have been sent to all parties of record 
and affected state commissions. 

Any person desiring to protest this 
filing must file in accordance with Rule 
211 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 
385.211). Protests to this filing will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Such protests must be filed in 
accordance with the provisions of 
Section 154.210 of the Commission’s 
regulations (18 CFR 154.210). Anyone 
filing a protest must serve a copy of that 

document on all the parties to the 
proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests in lieu 
of paper using the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at 
http://www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to 
file electronically should submit an 
original and 14 copies of the protest to 
the Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission, 888 First Street, NE., 
Washington, DC 20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–3435 Filed 12–1–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. PR05–3–000] 

Enogex Inc.; Notice of Petition for Rate 
Approval 

November 19, 2004. 
Take notice that on November 15, 

2004, Enogex Inc. (Enogex) tendered for 
filing a revised fuel factor of 0.47% for 
its Enogex System for the calendar year 
2005, as calculated pursuant to the 
formulas in Enogex’s Statement of 
Operating Conditions. This fuel factor 
represents a slight increase from the 
0.45% interim fuel factor filed in Docket 
No. PR04–15–000. Enogex seeks an 
effective date of January 1, 2005. 

Enogex states that it is serving notice 
of the filing and the revised fuel 
percentage on all current shippers. 

Pursuant to section 284.123(b)(2)(ii), 
if the Commission does not act within 
150 days of the date of this filing, the 
rates will be deemed to be fair and 
equitable and not in excess of an 
amount which interstate pipelines 
would be permitted to charge for similar 
transportation service. The Commission 
may, prior to the expiration of the 150 
day period, extend the time for action or 
institute a proceeding to afford parties 
an opportunity for written comments 

and for the oral presentation of views, 
data, and arguments. 

Any person desiring to participate in 
this rate filing must file in accordance 
with Rules 211 and 214 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, on 
or before the date as indicated below. 
Anyone filing an intervention or protest 
must serve a copy of that document on 
the Applicant. Anyone filing an 
intervention or protest on or before the 
intervention or protest date need not 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Intervention and Protest Date: 5 p.m. 
eastern time on December 10, 2004.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–3434 Filed 12–1–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP05–81–000] 

Florida Gas Transmission Company; 
Notice of Proposed Changes in FERC 
Gas Tariff 

November 24, 2004. 
Take notice that on November 19, 

2004, Florida Gas Transmission 
Company (FGT) tendered for filing to 
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become part of its FERC Gas Tariff, 
Third Revised Volume No. 1, the 
following tariff sheets, effective 
December 1, 2004:

Sixty-Eighth Revised Sheet No. 8A 
Sixtieth Revised Sheet No. 8A.01
Sixtieth Revised Sheet No. 8A.02
Twentieth Revised Sheet No. 8A.04
Sixty-Third Revised Sheet No. 8B 
Fifty-Sixth Revised Sheet No. 8B.01
Twelfth Revised Sheet No. 8B.02

FGT states that the tariff sheets listed 
above are being filed pursuant to section 
27.A.2.b of the General Terms and 
Conditions of FGT’s Tariff, which 
provides for flex adjustments to the Base 
FRCP. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of Section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 

(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–3424 Filed 12–1–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP05–76–000] 

Gulf South Pipeline Company, LP; 
Notice of Proposed Changes in FERC 
Gas Tariff 

November 24, 2004. 
Take notice that on November 18, 

2004, Gulf South Pipeline Company, LP 
(Gulf South) tendered for filing as part 
of its FERC Gas Tariff, Sixth Revised 
Volume No. 1, the following tariff 
sheets, to become effective December 
18, 2004:
Eighth Revised Sheet No. 20
Fifth Revised Sheet No. 21
Fifth Revised Sheet No. 22
Fifth Revised Sheet No. 23

Gulf South is proposing to eliminate 
the rate it charges for fuel for volumes 
that are both received and delivered on 
specific pipeline Indices in the Lake 
Charles, Louisiana area. 

Gulf South states that copies of this 
filing have been served upon Gulf 
South’s customers, state commissions 
and other interested parties. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211 and 
385.214). Protests will be considered by 
the Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed in accordance 
with the provisions of Section 154.210 
of the Commission’s regulations (18 CFR 
154.210). Anyone filing an intervention 
or protest must serve a copy of that 
document on the Applicant. Anyone 
filing an intervention or protest on or 
before the intervention or protest date 
need not serve motions to intervene or 
protests on persons other than the 
Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 

should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659.

Magalie R. Salas, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. E4–3419 Filed 12–1–04; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RP04–136–006] 

Iroquois Gas Transmission System, 
L.P.; Notice of Compliance Filing 

November 24, 2004. 
Take notice that on November 19, 

2004, Iroquois Gas Transmission 
System, L.P. (Iroquois) tendered for 
filing as part of its FERC Gas Tariff, First 
Revised Volume No. 1, First Revised 
Sheet No. 4C, to be effective on 
December 1, 2004. 

Iroquois states that copies of its filing 
were served on all jurisdictional 
customers and interested state 
regulatory agencies and all parties to the 
proceeding. 

Any person desiring to protest this 
filing must file in accordance with Rule 
211 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure (18 CFR 
385.211). Protests to this filing will be 
considered by the Commission in 
determining the appropriate action to be 
taken, but will not serve to make 
protestants parties to the proceeding. 
Such protests must be filed in 
accordance with the provisions of 
Section 154.210 of the Commission’s 
regulations (18 CFR 154.210). Anyone 
filing a protest must serve a copy of that 
document on all the parties to the 
proceeding. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests in lieu 
of paper using the ‘‘eFiling’’ link at 
http://www.ferc.gov. Persons unable to 
file electronically should submit an 
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