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procedural guidelines, or may be
purchased from the reporting company.

Disabled persons should contact the
Acting Secretary of the NAO no later
than March 17, 2000 if special
accommodations are needed.

II. Written Statements or Brief and
Requests To Present Oral Testimony

Written statements or briefs shall
provide a description of the information
to be presented or position taken and
shall be legibly typed or printed.
Requests to present oral testimony shall
include the name, address, and
telephone number of the witness, the
organization represented, if any, and
any other information pertinent to the
request. Five copies of a statement or
brief and a single copy of a request to
present oral testimony shall be
submitted to the NAO at the time of
filing.

No request to present oral testimony
will be considered unless accompanied
by a written statement or brief. A
request to present oral testimony may be
denied if the written statement or brief
suggests that the information sought to
be provided is unrelated to the review
of the submission or for other
appropriate reasons. The NAO will
notify each requester of the disposition
of the request to present oral testimony.

In presenting testimony, the witness
should summarize the written statement
or brief, may supplement the written
statement or brief with relevant
information, and should be prepared to
answer questions from the Secretary of
the NAO or the Secretary’s designee.
Oral testimony will ordinarily be
limited to a ten minute presentation, not
including the time for questions.
Persons desiring more than ten minutes
for their presentation should so state in
the request, setting out reasons why
additional time is necessary.

The requirements relating to the
submission of written statements or
briefs and requests to present oral
testimony may be waived by the
Secretary of the NAO for reasons of
equity and public interest.

Signed at Washington, DC on February 11,
2000.

Lewis Karesh,
Acting Secretary, U.S. National
Administrative Office.
[FR Doc. 00–4340 Filed 2–23–00; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 4510–28–P

NATIONAL INDIAN GAMING
COMMISSION

Fee Rates

AGENCY: National Indian Gaming
Commission.

ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given,
pursuant to 25 CFR 514.1(a)(3), that the
National Indian Gaming Commission
has adopted preliminarily annual fee
rates of 0.00% for tier 1 and 0.09%
(.0009) for tier 2 for calendar year 2000.
These rates shall apply to all assessable
gross revenues from each gaming
operation under the jurisdiction of the
Commission.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Bobby Gordon, National Indian Gaming
Commission, 1441 L Street, NW, Suite
9100, Washington, DC 20005; telephone
202/632–7003; fax 202/632–7066 (these
are not toll-free numbers).

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The
Indian Gaming Regulatory Act
established the National Indian Gaming
Commission which is charged with,
among other things, regulating gaming
on Indian lands.

The regulations of the Commission
(25 CFR part 514), as amended, provide
for a system of fee assessment and
payment that is self-administered by
gaming operations. Pursuant to those
regulations, the Commission is required
to adopt and communicate assessment
rates; the gaming operations are
required to apply those rates to their
revenues, compute the fees to be paid,
report the revenues, and remit the fees
to the Commission on a quarterly basis.

The regulations of the Commission
and the preliminary annual rate being
adopted today are effective for calendar
year 2000. Therefore, all gaming
operations within the jurisdiction of the
Commission are required to self-
administer the provisions of these
regulations and report and pay any fees
that are due to the Commission by
March 31, 2000.

Barry Brandon,
Chief of Staff, National Indian gaming
Commission.
[FR Doc. 00–4364 Filed 2–23–00; 8:45 am]

BILLING CODE 7565–01–M

NUCLEAR REGULATORY
COMMISSION

[Docket No. 50–201]

Decommissioning Criteria for the West
Valley Demonstration Project (M–32),
and the West Valley Site Revised
Comment Period on Draft Policy
Statement

AGENCY: Nuclear Regulatory
Commission.

ACTION: Notice of revised comment
period.

SUMMARY: On December 3, 1999, the
U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission
(NRC) published in the Federal Register
a draft Policy Statement on the criteria
to be used for decommissioning the
West Valley Demonstration Project and
West Valley Site. The NRC requested
that comments on the draft Policy
Statement be submitted by February 1,
2000. A public meeting to discuss the
draft policy statement for the
decommissioning criteria for West
Valley with interested members of the
public was held in West Valley, New
York, on January 5, 2000. As a result of
comments from the public the NRC is
reopening the comment period until
April 1, 2000. Comments received after
this date will be considered if it is
practical to do so, but NRC will only be
able to assure consideration of
comments received on or before this
date.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT:
Questions with respect to this action
should be referred to Jack D. Parrott,
Project Scientist, Decommissioning
Branch, Division of Waste Management,
Office of Nuclear Material Safety and
Safeguards, Mail Stop T–8F37, U.S.
Nuclear Regulatory Commission,
Washington, DC 20555–0001.
Telephone: (301) 415–6700; e-mail:
jdp1@nrc.gov.

Dated at Rockville, Maryland, this 14th day
of February 2000.
For the U.S. Nuclear Regulatory Commission.

Larry W. Camper,
Chief, Decommissioning Branch, Division of
Waste Management, Office of Nuclear
Material Safety and Safeguards.
[FR Doc. 00–4354 Filed 2–23–00; 8:45 am]
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