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available via https://www.facadatabase.
gov/FACA/FACAPublicViewCommittee
Details?id=a10t0000001gzlZAAQ under 
the Commission on Civil Rights, Illinois 
Advisory Committee link. Persons 
interested in the work of this Committee 
are directed to the Commission’s 
website, http://www.usccr.gov, or may 
contact the Chicago Office at the above 
email or phone number. 

Agenda 

I. Welcome and Roll Call 
II. Discussion of draft report on Fair 

Housing in Illinois 
III. Public Comment 
IV. Adjournment 

Dated: September 4, 2020. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19974 Filed 9–9–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Agenda and Notice of Public Meeting 
of the Colorado Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission), and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that a meeting of the Colorado 
Advisory Committee to the Commission 
will convene by conference call on 
Tuesday, September 22, 2020 at 12:30 
p.m. The purpose of the meeting is to 
review an advisory memorandum 
regarding infant and maternal mortality. 
DATES: Tuesday, September 22, 2020 at 
12:30 p.m. (MDT). 

Public Call-In Information: 1–800– 
353–6461; Conference ID: 3778939. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Barbara Delaviez, ero@usccr.gov or by 
phone at 202–539–8246. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Interested 
members of the public may listen to the 
discussion by calling the following toll- 
free conference call number: 1–800– 
353–6461; Conference ID: 3778939. 

Please be advised that, before being 
placed into the conference call, the 
conference call operator will ask callers 
to provide their names, their 
organizational affiliations (if any), and 
email addresses (so that callers may be 
notified of future meetings). Callers can 
expect to incur charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, and the 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 

line connections to the toll-free 
telephone number provided. 

Persons with hearing impairments 
may also follow the discussion by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 1– 
800–877–8339 and providing the 
operator with the toll-free conference 
call number: 1–800–353–6461; 
Conference ID: 3778939. 

Members of the public are invited to 
make statements during the open 
comment period of the meeting or email 
written comments. Written comments 
may be emailed to Barbara Delaviez at 
ero@usccr.gov approximately 30 days 
after each scheduled meeting. Persons 
who desire additional information may 
also contact Barbara Delaviez at (202) 
539–8246. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing as they become available 
at this FACA Link; click the ‘‘Meeting 
Details’’ and ‘‘Documents’’ links. 
Persons interested in the work of this 
advisory committee are advised to go to 
the Commission’s website, 
www.usccr.gov, or to contact Evelyn 
Bohor at the above phone number or 
email address. 

Agenda 

Tuesday, September 22, 2020 at 12:30 
p.m. (MDT) 

I. Roll Call 
II. Review Advisory Memorandum 

Regarding Infant and Maternal 
Mortality 

III. Next Steps 
IV. Other Business 
V. Open Comment 
VI. Adjournment 

Dated: September 4, 2020. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19975 Filed 9–9–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

COMMISSION ON CIVIL RIGHTS 

Notice of Public Meeting of the 
Massachusetts Advisory Committee 

AGENCY: Commission on Civil Rights. 
ACTION: Announcement of meeting. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given, 
pursuant to the provisions of the rules 
and regulations of the U.S. Commission 
on Civil Rights (Commission) and the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act 
(FACA) that a meeting of the 
Massachusetts Advisory Committee to 
the Commission will convene by 
conference call on Thursday, September 
24, 2020 at 12:30 p.m. (EDT). The 
purpose of the meeting is to continue its 

work on water accessibility in 
Massachusetts. 
DATES: Thursday, September 24, 2020 at 
12:30 p.m. (EDT). 
ADDRESSES: 

Public Call-In Information: 1–800– 
353–6461; conference ID: 7139515. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Evelyn Bohor at ero@usccr.gov or by 
phone at 202–376–7533. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Interested 
members of the public may listen to the 
discussion by calling the following toll- 
free conference call-in numbers: 1–800– 
353–6461; conference ID: 7139515. 
Please be advised that before placing 
them into the conference call, the 
conference call operator will ask callers 
to provide their names, their 
organizational affiliations (if any), and 
email addresses (so that callers may be 
notified of future meetings). Callers can 
expect to incur charges for calls they 
initiate over wireless lines, and the 
Commission will not refund any 
incurred charges. Callers will incur no 
charge for calls they initiate over land- 
line connections to the toll-free 
conference call-in number. 

Persons with hearing impairments 
may also follow the discussion by first 
calling the Federal Relay Service at 1– 
800–877–8339 and providing the 
operator with the toll-free conference 
call-in numbers: 1–800–353–6461; 
conference ID: 7139515. 

Members of the public are invited to 
make statements during the open 
comment period of the meeting or 
submit written comments. The 
comments must be received in the 
regional office approximately 30 days 
after each scheduled meeting. Written 
comments may be emailed to Evelyn 
Bohor at ero@usccr.gov. Persons who 
desire additional information may 
contact the Eastern Regional Office at 
(202) 376–7533. 

Records and documents discussed 
during the meeting will be available for 
public viewing as they become available 
at this FACA link, click the ‘‘Meeting 
Details’’ and ‘‘Documents’’ links. 
Records generated from this meeting 
may also be inspected and reproduced 
at the Eastern Regional Office, as they 
become available, both before and after 
the meetings. Persons interested in the 
work of this advisory committee are 
advised to go to the Commission’s 
website, www.usccr.gov, or to contact 
the Eastern Regional Office at the above 
phone numbers, email or street address. 

Agenda 

Thursday, September 24, 2020 at 12:30 
p.m. (EDT) 
1. Welcome and Open 
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2. Web Briefing on Water Project 
3. Open Comment 
4. Next Steps 
5. Adjourn 

Dated: September 4, 2020. 
David Mussatt, 
Supervisory Chief, Regional Programs Unit. 
[FR Doc. 2020–19976 Filed 9–9–20; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Census Bureau 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Annual Survey of 
Manufactures 

AGENCY: Census Bureau, Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice of information collection, 
request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The Department of 
Commerce, in accordance with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) of 
1995, invites the general public and 
other Federal agencies to comment on 
proposed, and continuing information 
collections, which helps us assess the 
impact of our information collection 
requirements and minimize the public’s 
reporting burden. The purpose of this 
notice is to allow for 60 days of public 
comment on the proposed revision of 
the Annual Survey of Manufactures, 
prior to the submission of the 
information collection request (ICR) to 
OMB for approval. 
DATES: To ensure consideration, 
comments regarding this proposed 
information collection must be received 
on or before November 9, 2020. 
ADDRESSES: Interested persons are 
invited to submit written comments by 
email to Thomas.J.Smith@census.gov. 
Please reference Annual Survey of 
Manufactures in the subject line of your 
comments. You may also submit 
comments, identified by Docket Number 
USBC–2020–0024, to the Federal e- 
Rulemaking Portal: http://
www.regulations.gov. All comments 
received are part of the public record. 
No comments will be posted to http:// 
www.regulations.gov for public viewing 
until after the comment period has 
closed. Comments will generally be 
posted without change. All Personally 
Identifiable Information (for example, 
name and address) voluntarily 
submitted by the commenter may be 
publicly accessible. Do not submit 
Confidential Business Information or 
otherwise sensitive or protected 

information. You may submit 
attachments to electronic comments in 
Microsoft Word, Excel, or Adobe PDF 
file formats. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
specific questions related to collection 
activities should be directed to Marlo 
Thornton, Assistant Division Chief, 
Manufacturing, Mining, and 
Construction Sectors, Economy-Wide 
Statistics Division, U.S. Census Bureau, 
(301) 763–7170, or email 
Marlo.N.Thornton@Census.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Abstract 

The Census Bureau has conducted the 
Annual Survey of Manufactures (ASM) 
since 1949 to provide key measures of 
manufacturing activity during 
intercensal periods. In economic census 
years ending in ‘‘2’’ and ‘‘7’’, we do not 
conduct the ASM. ASM estimates are 
key inputs for multiple federal 
statistical programs, including the 
Bureau of Economic Analysis’ National 
Income and Product Accounts. The 
ASM furnishes up-to-date estimates of 
employment and payroll, hours and 
wages of production workers, value 
added by manufacture, cost of materials, 
value of shipments by the North 
American Product Classification System 
(NAPCS) product codes, inventories, 
and expenditures for both plant 
equipment and structures. The survey 
provides data at the two-through six- 
digit North American Industry 
Classification System (NAICS) levels. It 
also provides geographic data by state at 
a more aggregated industry level. 

ASM estimates are key inputs for 
multiple federal statistical programs. 
Federal agencies use the annual survey’s 
input and output data as benchmarks for 
their statistical programs, including the 
Federal Reserve Board’s Index of 
Industrial Production and BEA’s 
National Income and Product Accounts. 
The data also provide the Department of 
Energy with primary information on the 
use of energy by the manufacturing 
sector to produce manufactured 
products. These data also are used as 
benchmark data for the Manufacturing 
Energy Consumption Survey, which is 
conducted for the Department of Energy 
by the Census Bureau. Within the 
Census Bureau, the ASM data are used 
to benchmark and reconcile monthly 
and quarterly data on manufacturing 
production and inventories. The ASM is 
the only source of complete 
establishment statistics for the programs 
mentioned above. The survey also 
provides valuable information to private 
companies, research organizations, and 

trade associations. Industry makes 
extensive use of the annual figures on 
product class shipments at the U.S. 
level in market analyses, product 
planning, and investment planning. 
State development/planning agencies 
rely on the survey as a major source of 
comprehensive economic data for 
policymaking, planning, and 
administration. The Census Bureau 
plans to request a revision of a currently 
approved collection. We plan to make 
the following changes: 

MA–10000—Multiple Establishment 
Companies and MA–10000—Single 
Establishment Companies: 

A. Content related to the Coronavirus 
Pandemic: 

1. Item 28—Special Inquiry: 
Add a question asking respondents to 

provide the number of days their 
location was closed due to the 
coronavirus pandemic. This question 
will assist with measuring the impact on 
plant operations due to the Coronavirus 
Pandemic. 

The primary objective of adding this 
and other questions related to the 
Coronavirus Pandemic described below 
is to measure the impact of the 
Coronavirus Pandemic on the 
manufacturing sector and 
manufacturing establishments, and meet 
the needs of the data user community. 
As we continue in these unprecedented 
times, the Coronavirus Pandemic 
content may shift, change or evolve and 
require further modifications on the 
ASM. 

2. Item 5 and Item 28—Special 
Inquiry: 

Add a statement to Item 5 to specify/ 
clarify that donated products should be 
included in the value. 

Add a question asking respondents if 
they donated products and the 
associated value of the donated 
products (breakout of Item 5, line A). 
Attempt to gather information on the 
value of shipments related to donated 
products by industry. 

3. Item 7: 
Add questions asking respondents to 

provide the payroll for production 
workers at the establishment by quarter. 
Collecting payroll information by range 
of months, rather than a point in time 
will reflect variability. 

4. Item 22: 
Add the following NAPCS to 

electronic instrument for all 
respondents: 

a. 2017900000—Manufacturing of 
nonelectric breathing devices (including 
N95 and other respirators), incubators, 
inhalators, and resuscitators, and other 
surgical and medical apparatus and 
instruments, excluding anesthetic 
apparatus and parts. 
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