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Accession Number: 20231208–5139. 
Comment Date: 5 pm ET 12/20/23. 
Any person desiring to protest in any 

the above proceedings must file in 
accordance with Rule 211 of the 
Commission’s Regulations (18 CFR 
385.211) on or before 5:00 p.m. Eastern 
time on the specified comment date. 

The filings are accessible in the 
Commission’s eLibrary system (https://
elibrary.ferc.gov/idmws/search/
fercgensearch.asp) by querying the 
docket number. 

eFiling is encouraged. More detailed 
information relating to filing 
requirements, interventions, protests, 
service, and qualifying facilities filings 
can be found at: http://www.ferc.gov/ 
docs-filing/efiling/filing-req.pdf. For 
other information, call (866) 208–3676 
(toll free). For TTY, call (202) 502–8659. 

The Commission’s Office of Public 
Participation (OPP) supports meaningful 
public engagement and participation in 
Commission proceedings. OPP can help 
members of the public, including 
landowners, environmental justice 
communities, Tribal members and 
others, access publicly available 
information and navigate Commission 
processes. For public inquiries and 
assistance with making filings such as 
interventions, comments, or requests for 
rehearing, the public is encouraged to 
contact OPP at (202) 502–6595 or OPP@
ferc.gov. 

Dated: December 11, 2023. 
Debbie-Anne A. Reese, 
Deputy Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27579 Filed 12–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL–11465–01–R5] 

Clean Air Act Operating Permit 
Program; Order on Petition for 
Objection to State Operating Permit for 
Chicago Department of Aviation, Cook 
County, Illinois 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice of final order on petition. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) Administrator signed an 
order dated September 29, 2023, 
denying a petition dated January 5, 
2023, submitted by an anonymous 
petitioner identified as C23D32 (the 
Petitioner). The petition requested that 
EPA object to a Clean Air Act (CAA) 
title V operating permit issued by the 
Illinois Environmental Protection 
Agency (IEPA) to the Chicago 

Department of Aviation located in Cook 
County, Illinois. 
ADDRESSES: The final order, the petition, 
and other supporting information are 
available for public inspection during 
normal business hours at the following 
address: Environmental Protection 
Agency, Region 5, Air and Radiation 
Division, 77 West Jackson Boulevard, 
Chicago, Illinois 60604. This facility is 
open from 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m., 
Monday through Friday, excluding 
Federal holidays and facility closures 
due to COVID–19. We recommend that 
you contact the individual listed in the 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT 
section before visiting the Region 5 
office. Additionally, the final order and 
petitions are available electronically at: 
https://www.epa.gov/title-v-operating- 
permits/title-v-petition-database. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Dan 
Wolski, Air Permits Section, Air 
Programs Branch (AR–18J), 
Environmental Protection Agency, 
Region 5, 77 West Jackson Boulevard, 
Chicago, Illinois 60604, (312) 886–0557, 
wolski.daniel@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: EPA 
received a petition from C23D32 dated 
January 5, 2023, requesting that EPA 
object to the issuance of operating 
permit no. 95110002, issued by IEPA to 
Chicago Department of Aviation in Cook 
County, Illinois. On September 29, 
2023, the EPA Administrator issued an 
order denying the petition. The order 
explains the basis for EPA’s decision. 

Sections 307(b) and 505(b)(2) of the 
CAA provide that a petitioner may 
request judicial review of those portions 
of an order that deny issues in a 
petition. Any petition for review shall 
be filed in the United States Court of 
Appeals for the appropriate circuit no 
later than February 13, 2024. 

Authority: 42 U.S.C. 7401 et seq. 
Dated: December 11, 2023. 

Debra Shore, 
Regional Administrator, Region 5. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27553 Filed 12–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPPT–2023–0265; FRL–11109– 
02–OCSPP] 

Tris(2-chloroethyl) Phosphate (TCEP); 
Draft Risk Evaluation Under the Toxic 
Substances Control Act (TSCA); Letter 
Peer Review; Notice of Availability, 
Public Meeting and Request for 
Comment 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 

ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: The Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA) is announcing the 
availability of and soliciting public 
comment on the document titled: ‘‘2023 
Draft Risk Evaluation for Tris(2- 
chloroethyl) Phosphate (TCEP)’’ and 
related draft charge questions. EPA will 
be submitting the Draft Risk Evaluation 
and public comments to peer reviewers 
who will consider the approach and 
methodologies utilized. The letter peer 
review will include review of the 
analysis of physical-chemical 
properties, the fate of TCEP in the 
environment, releases of TCEP to the 
environment, environmental hazard and 
risk characterization for terrestrial and 
aquatic species, and human health 
hazard and risk characterization for 
workers, consumers, and the general 
population. The letter peer review is 
expected to begin on March 13, 2024, 
and end on April 12, 2024. A 
preparatory virtual public meeting will 
be held on March 5, 2024, for reviewers 
and the public to comment on and ask 
questions regarding the scope and 
clarity of the draft charge questions. 
Feedback from the letter peer review 
will be considered in the development 
of the final TCEP risk evaluation. 
DATES: 

Virtual Public Meeting: March 5, 
2024, 1–4 p.m. EST. To receive the 
webcast meeting link and audio 
teleconference information before the 
meeting, you must register by 5 p.m. 
EST on March 1, 2024. 

Special Accommodations: To allow 
EPA time to process your request for 
special accommodations, please submit 
the request by February 23, 2024. 

Written Comments: Comments must 
be received on or before February 13, 
2024. 

ADDRESSES: Submit written comments 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPPT–2023–0265, 
through https://www.regulations.gov. 
Follow the online instructions for 
submitting comments. Do not submit 
electronically any information you 
consider to be Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Additional information on commenting 
or visiting the docket, along with more 
information about dockets generally, is 
available at https://www.epa.gov/ 
dockets. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: The 
Peer Review Leader (PRL), Alaa Kamel, 
Ph.D., Mission Support Division, Office 
of Program Support, Office of Chemical 
Safety and Pollution Prevention, 
Environmental Protection Agency; 
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telephone number: (202) 564–5336 or 
call the main office number: (202) 564– 
8450; email address: kamel.alaa@
epa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Executive Summary 

A. What action is the Agency taking? 

EPA is announcing the availability of 
and soliciting public comment on the 
document titled: ‘‘2023 Draft Risk 
Evaluation for Tris(2-chloroethyl) 
Phosphate (TCEP)’’. A letter peer review 
is expected to begin on March 13, 2024, 
and end on April 12, 2024, to review the 
approach and methodologies utilized in 
this document. A preparatory virtual 
public meeting will be held on March 5, 
2024, for reviewers and the public to 
comment on and ask questions 
regarding the scope and clarity of the 
draft charge questions. 

B. What is the Agency’s authority for 
taking this action? 

Section 6(b) of the Toxic Substances 
Control Act (TSCA) (15 U.S.C. 2605(b)), 
requires that EPA conduct risk 
evaluations on existing chemical 
substances and identifies the minimum 
components EPA must include in all 
chemical substance risk evaluations. 
The risk evaluation must not consider 
costs or other non-risk factors (15 U.S.C. 
2605(b)(4)(F)(iii)). The specific risk 
evaluation process is set out in 40 CFR 
part 702 and summarized on EPA’s 
website at https://www.epa.gov/ 
assessing-and-managing-chemicals- 
under-tsca/risk-evaluations-existing- 
chemicals-under-tsca. 

C. Does this action apply to me? 

This action is directed to the public 
in general. This action may, however, be 
of interest to those involved in the 
manufacture, processing, distribution, 
and disposal of chemical substances and 
mixtures, and/or those interested in the 
assessment of risks involving chemical 
substances regulated under TSCA. Since 
other entities may also be interested, the 
Agency has not attempted to describe all 
the specific entities that may be affected 
by this action. 

D. What should I consider as I submit 
my comments to EPA? 

1. Submitting Confidential Business 
Information (CBI). 

Do not submit CBI or other sensitive 
information to EPA through https://
www.regulations.gov or email. If you’d 
like to include information in your 
comment that you consider to be CBI or 
otherwise protected, please contact the 
PRL listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT to obtain special 

instructions before submitting that 
information. 

2. Tips for preparing comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see Tips for Effective 
Comments at https://www.epa.gov/ 
dockets. 

II. Request for Comment 
EPA is seeking public comment on 

both the draft risk evaluation and the 
draft charge questions for the letter peer 
review. Both documents are available in 
EPA Docket ID No. EPA–HQ–OPPT– 
2023–0265 at https://
www.regulations.gov and may also be 
accessed through EPA’s website at 
https://www.epa.gov/tsca-peer-review. 
As additional background materials 
become available, EPA will include 
those additional background documents 
(e.g., reviewers participating in this 
letter peer review) in the docket and on 
the website. 

III. Preparatory Meeting 
EPA will publish instructions on how 

to register for the virtual public meeting 
that will be held on March 5, 2024, from 
1–4 p.m. EST. After registering, you will 
receive the webcast meeting link and 
audio teleconference information for 
this public meeting. You may register 
and participate as a listen-only attendee 
at any time up to the end of the meeting 
on March 5, 2024. Requests to make 
brief (up to five minutes) oral comments 
during the preparatory meeting can be 
submitted when registering and will be 
accepted until Friday, March 1, 2024. 

IV. Letter Peer Review 

A. What is the purpose of this Letter 
Peer Review? 

The focus of this Letter Peer Review 
is on the approach and methodologies 
utilized in the ‘‘2023 Draft Risk 
Evaluation for Tris(2-chloroethyl) 
Phosphate (TCEP).’’ Feedback from this 
review will be considered in the 
development of the final TCEP risk 
evaluation. 

B. Why did EPA develop these 
documents? 

TCEP is a High-Priority substance 
undergoing the TSCA risk evaluation 
process. TCEP has been primarily used 
in paint and coating manufacturing, and 
in polymers used in aerospace 
equipment and products. In the past it 
has also been used in commercial and 
consumer products, including fabric 
and textile products, foam seating, and 
construction materials. TCEP may also 
be imported in articles intended for 
consumer use. 

In August 2020, EPA published a final 
scope document for 20 High-Priority 

substances, including TCEP, outlining 
the hazards, exposures, conditions of 
use, and the potentially exposed or 
susceptible subpopulations the Agency 
expects to consider in its risk 
evaluation. 

EPA is submitting the ‘‘2023 Draft 
Risk Evaluation for Tris(2-chloroethyl) 
Phosphate (TCEP)’’ and associated 
supporting documents for Letter Peer 
Review. The Letter Peer Review will 
include review of the analysis of 
physical chemical properties, the fate of 
TCEP in the environment, releases of 
TCEP to the environment, 
environmental hazard and risk 
characterization for terrestrial and 
aquatic species, and human health 
hazard and risk characterization for 
workers, consumers, and the general 
population. Specifically, EPA is seeking 
comment on the following issues: 

• The list of considerations EPA used 
to arrive at the human health hazard 
confidence levels and the specific 
confidence levels chosen for individual 
human health hazard outcomes 
(neurotoxicity, reproductive/ 
developmental effects, kidney effects, 
and cancer) in the TCEP risk evaluation. 

• Whether the approach used to 
estimate anaerobic degradation in the 
absence of data is appropriate for 
assessing anaerobic degradation in 
sediment. 

• Use of the model, Web-based 
Interspecies Correlation Estimation 
(Web-ICE), to predict acute toxicity 
hazard values for aquatic species not 
represented in the available studies. 

This is the first time EPA has used 
Web-ICE in a TSCA risk evaluation. 
These predictions were used with 
available empirical data to create a 
Species Sensitivity Distribution (SSD). 
The SSD was used to calculate a 
hazardous concentration for 5% of 
species (HC05). EPA is also using a data- 
driven way of accounting for 
uncertainty for environmental hazard 
and is soliciting comment on its 
characterization of this uncertainty, 
specifically its use of the lower bound 
of the 95% confidence interval of the 
hazardous HC05. 

• Human health hazard benchmark 
dose modeling of animal toxicity data 
for TCEP. 

• The list of considerations EPA used 
to arrive at the human health hazard 
confidence levels and the specific 
confidence levels chosen for individual 
human health hazard outcomes 
(neurotoxicity, reproductive/ 
developmental effects, kidney effects, 
and cancer) to quantitatively evaluate 
risk from TCEP. 

• Use of several approaches for 
estimating exposures to humans and 
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environmental receptors: (1) The use of 
Verner 2008 Multi-compartment model, 
which was used to assess TCEP 
exposure to infants through human milk 
for the first time in a TSCA risk 
evaluation; (2) the use of Verner 2008 
Multi-compartment model and 
associated uncertainties in extrapolating 
from the inhalation to oral routes of 
exposure; (3) the use of the American 
Meteorological Society/Environmental 
Protection Agency Regulatory Model 
(AERMOD) to estimate air deposition of 
TCEP. EPA has used AERMOD in 
previous TSCA risk evaluations; 
however, its use in estimating air 
deposition is novel for TSCA risk 
evaluations. 

• Approach for modeling drinking 
water contamination from wells near 
municipal solid waste landfills, which 
is a new approach for TSCA risk 
evaluations. 

C. How can I access the documents 
submitted for review? 

The ‘‘2023 Draft Risk Evaluation for 
Tris(2-chloroethyl) Phosphate (TCEP)’’ 
and all background documents, related 
supporting materials, and draft charge 
questions are available at https://
www.regulations.gov in Docket ID No. 
EPA–HQ–OPPT–2023–0265 and 
through the TSCA Scientific Peer 
Review Committees website at https://
www.epa.gov/tsca-peer-review. In 
addition, as additional background 
materials become available (e.g., 
reviewers participating in the letter peer 
review), EPA will include those 
additional background documents in the 
docket and through the website. 

Authority: 15 U.S.C. 2601 et seq. 
Dated: December 12, 2023. 

Michal Freedhoff, 
Assistant Administrator, Office of Chemical 
Safety and Pollution Prevention. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27600 Filed 12–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[FRL OP–OFA–101] 

Environmental Impact Statements; 
Notice of Availability 

Responsible Agency: Office of Federal 
Activities, General Information 202– 
564–5632 or https://www.epa.gov/nepa. 
Weekly receipt of Environmental Impact 

Statements (EIS) 
Filed December 4, 2023 10 a.m. EST 

Through December 11, 2023 10 a.m. 
EST 

Pursuant to 40 CFR 1506.9. 

Notice: Section 309(a) of the Clean Air 
Act requires that EPA make public its 
comments on EISs issued by other 
Federal agencies. EPA’s comment letters 
on EISs are available at: https://
cdxapps.epa.gov/cdx-enepa-II/public/ 
action/eis/search. 
EIS No. 20230175, Draft, Caltrans, CA, 

Last Chance Grade Permanent 
Restoration Project, Comment Period 
Ends: 02/13/2024, Contact: Steve 
Croteau 707–572–7149. 

EIS No. 20230176, Draft, USACE, FL, 
Comprehensive Everglades 
Restoration Plan Western Everglades 
Restoration Project Draft Integrated 
Project Implementation Report and 
Environmental Impact Statement, 
Comment Period Ends: 01/29/2024, 
Contact: Melissa Nasuti 904–251– 
9597. 

EIS No. 20230177, Draft, BLM, AK, 
ANCSA 17(d)(1) Withdrawals, 
Comment Period Ends: 02/14/2024, 
Contact: Racheal Jones 907–290–0307. 

EIS No. 20230178, Final, BOEM, NY, 
Sunrise Wind Project, Review Period 
Ends: 01/16/2024, Contact: Genevieve 
Brune 703–787–1553. 
Dated: December 12, 2023. 

Julie Smith, 
Acting Director, NEPA Compliance Division, 
Office of Federal Activities. 
[FR Doc. 2023–27642 Filed 12–14–23; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 6560–50–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2023–0067; FRL–10578–11– 
OCSPP] 

Pesticide Product Registration; 
Receipt of Applications for New Uses 
November 2023 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Notice. 

SUMMARY: EPA has received applications 
to register new uses for pesticide 
products containing currently registered 
active ingredients. Pursuant to the 
Federal Insecticide, Fungicide, and 
Rodenticide Act (FIFRA), EPA is hereby 
providing notice of receipt and 
opportunity to comment on these 
applications. 

DATES: Comments must be received on 
or before January 16, 2024. 
ADDRESSES: Submit your comments, 
identified by docket identification (ID) 
number EPA–HQ–OPP–2023–0067, 
through the Federal eRulemaking Portal 
at https://www.regulations.gov. Follow 
the online instructions for submitting 
comments. Do not submit electronically 

any information you consider to be 
Confidential Business Information (CBI) 
or other information whose disclosure is 
restricted by statute. Additional 
instructions on commenting and visiting 
the docket, along with more information 
about dockets generally, is available at 
https://www.epa.gov/dockets. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Charles Smith, Registration Division 
(RD) (7505T), main telephone number: 
(202) 566–2427, email address: 
RDFRNotices@epa.gov. The mailing 
address for each contact person is Office 
of Pesticide Programs, Environmental 
Protection Agency, 1200 Pennsylvania 
Ave. NW, Washington, DC 20460–0001. 
As part of the mailing address, include 
the contact person’s name, division, and 
mail code. The division to contact is 
listed at the end of each application 
summary. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this action apply to me? 
You may be potentially affected by 

this action if you are an agricultural 
producer, food manufacturer, or 
pesticide manufacturer. The following 
list of North American Industrial 
Classification System (NAICS) codes is 
not intended to be exhaustive, but rather 
provides a guide to help readers 
determine whether this document 
applies to them. Potentially affected 
entities may include: 

• Crop production (NAICS code 111). 
• Animal production (NAICS code 

112). 
• Food manufacturing (NAICS code 

311). 

B. What should I consider as I prepare 
my comments for EPA? 

1. Submitting CBI. Do not submit this 
information to EPA through 
regulations.gov or email. Clearly mark 
the part or all of the information that 
you claim to be CBI. For CBI 
information in a disk or CD–ROM that 
you mail to EPA, mark the outside of the 
disk or CD–ROM as CBI and then 
identify electronically within the disk or 
CD–ROM the specific information that 
is claimed as CBI. In addition to one 
complete version of the comment that 
includes information claimed as CBI, a 
copy of the comment that does not 
contain the information claimed as CBI 
must be submitted for inclusion in the 
public docket. Information so marked 
will not be disclosed except in 
accordance with procedures set forth in 
40 CFR part 2. 

2. Tips for preparing your comments. 
When preparing and submitting your 
comments, see the commenting tips at 
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