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officer of the contributor, and subject to 
verification by the Commission or the 
administrator at the discretion of the 
Commission. Contributors’ statements 
in the worksheet shall be subject to the 
provisions of section 220 of the 
Communications Act of 1934, as 
amended. The fund administrator may 
bill contributors a separate assessment 
for reasonable administrative expenses 
and interest resulting from improper 
filing or overdue contributions. The 
Chief of the Consumer & Governmental 
Affairs Bureau may waive, reduce, 
modify or eliminate contributor 
reporting requirements that prove 
unnecessary and require additional 
reporting requirements that the Bureau 
deems necessary to the sound and 
efficient administration of the TRS 
Fund.
* * * * *

(I) Information filed with the 
administrator. The administrator shall 
keep all data obtained from contributors 
and TRS providers confidential and 
shall not disclose such data in 
company-specific form unless directed 
to do so by the Commission. Subject to 
any restrictions imposed by the Chief of 
the Consumer & Governmental Affairs 
Bureau, the TRS Fund administrator 
may share data obtained from carriers 
with the administrators of the universal 
support mechanisms (See 47 CFR 
54.701 of this chapter), the North 
American Numbering Plan 
administration cost recovery (See 47 
CFR 52.16 of this chapter), and the long-
term local number portability cost 
recovery (See 47 CFR 52.32 of this 
chapter). The TRS Fund administrator 
shall keep confidential all data obtained 
from other administrators. The 
administrator shall not use such data 
except for purposes of administering the 
TRS Fund, calculating the regulatory 
fees of interstate common carriers, and 
aggregating such fee payments for 
submission to the Commission. The 
Commission shall have access to all data 
reported to the administrator, and 
authority to audit TRS providers. 
Contributors may make requests for 
Commission nondisclosure of company-
specific revenue information under 
§ 0.459 of this chapter by so indicating 
on the Telecommunications Reporting 
Worksheet at the time that the subject 
data are submitted. The Commission 
shall make all decisions regarding 
nondisclosure of company-specific 
information.
* * * * *
� 4. Section 64.605 is amended by 
revising paragraph (a) to read as follows:

§ 64.605 State certification. 

(a) State documentation. Any state, 
through its office of the governor or 
other delegated executive office 
empowered to provide TRS, desiring to 
establish a state program under this 
section shall submit, not later than 
October 1, 1992, documentation to the 
Commission addressed to the Federal 
Communications Commission, Chief, 
Consumer & Governmental Affairs 
Bureau, TRS Certification Program, 
Washington, DC 20554, and captioned 
‘‘TRS State Certification Application.’’ 
All documentation shall be submitted in 
narrative form, shall clearly describe the 
state program for implementing 
intrastate TRS, and the procedures and 
remedies for enforcing any requirements 
imposed by the state program. The 
Commission shall give public notice of 
states filing for certification including 
notification in the Federal Register.
* * * * *
[FR Doc. 04–19955 Filed 8–31–04; 8:45 am] 
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47 CFR Part 73 

[ET Docket No. 01–75; FCC 02–298] 

Broadcast Auxiliary Service Rules

AGENCY: Federal Communications 
Commission.
ACTION: Correcting amendment.

SUMMARY: On November 13, 2002, the 
Commission released a Report and 
Order in the matter of Broadcast 
Auxiliary Service Rules. This document 
contains corrections to the final 
regulations that appeared in the Federal 
Register of March 17, 2003 (68 FR 
12744). A ‘‘correcting amendment’’ also 
appeared in the Federal Register of July 
22, 2004 (69 FR 43772).
DATES: Effective September 1, 2004.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Ted 
Ryder, Office of Engineering and 
Technology, (202) 418–2803.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Background 

The final regulations that are the 
subject of this correction relate to 
Broadcast Auxiliary Service Rules under 
§ 73.3598 of the rules. 

Need for Correction 

As published, the final regulations 
contain an error, which requires 
immediate correction.

List of Subjects in 47 CFR Part 73 

Communications equipment, Radio, 
Reporting and recordkeeping 
requirements, Television.
� Accordingly, 47 CFR part 73 is 
corrected by making the following 
correcting amendment:

PART 73—RADIO BROADCAST 
SERVICES

� 1. The authority citation for part 73 
continues to read as follows:

Authority: 47 U.S.C. 154, 303, 334, and 
336.

� 2. Section 73.3598 is amended by 
revising paragraph (a) to read as follows:

§ 73.3598 Period of construction. 
(a) Each original construction permit 

for the construction of a new TV, AM, 
FM or International Broadcast; low 
power TV; TV translator; TV booster; 
FM translator; or FM booster station, or 
to make changes in such existing 
stations, shall specify a period of three 
years from the date of issuance of the 
original construction permit within 
which construction shall be completed 
and application for license filed. Each 
original construction permit for the 
construction of a new LPFM station 
shall specify a period of eighteen 
months from the date of issuance of the 
construction permit within which 
construction shall be completed and 
application for license filed.
* * * * *
Federal Communications Commission. 
Marlene H. Dortch, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 04–19894 Filed 8–31–04; 8:45 am] 
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49 CFR Part 171 

[Docket No. RSPA–00–7762 (HM–206C)] 

RIN 2137–AD29 

Hazardous Materials: Availability of 
Information for Hazardous Materials 
Transported by Aircraft

AGENCY: Research and Special Programs 
Administration (RSPA), Department of 
Transportation (DOT).
ACTION: Interim Final Rule; extension of 
compliance date. 

SUMMARY: This interim final rule 
extends the compliance date of the 
notification and record retention 
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