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(2) Operating a vessel above a flat 
wake speed in the Garden Key and Bird 
Key Harbor areas. 

(g) What restrictions apply to 
discharging materials in park waters? 

(1) Discharging or depositing 
materials or substances of any kind 
within the boundaries of the park is 
prohibited, except for the following: 

(i) Research Natural Area: cooling 
water or engine exhaust. 

(ii) Park Waters Outside the Research 
Natural Area: 

(A) Fish, fish parts, chumming 
materials, or bait used or produced 
incidental to and while conducting 
recreational fishing activities in the 
park; 

(B) Water generated by routine vessel 
operations (e.g., deck wash down and 
graywater from sinks, consisting of only 
water and food particles; 

(C) Vessel cooling water, engine 
exhaust, or bilge water not 
contaminated by oil or other substances. 

(2) The Superintendent may impose 
further restrictions as necessary to 
protect park resources, visitors, or 
employees. The Superintendent will 
notify the public of these requirements 
through one or more of the methods 
listed in § 1.7 of this chapter. 

(h) What are the permit requirements 
in the park? 

(1) A permit, issued by the 
Superintendent, is required for all non- 
commercial vessels for which occupants 
are engaged in recreational activities, 
including all activities in the RNA. 
Permitted recreational activities include 
but are not limited to use of mooring 
buoys, snorkeling, diving, wildlife 
viewing, and photography. 

(2) A permit, issued by the 
Superintendent, is required for a person, 
group, institution, or organization 
conducting research activities in the 
park. 

(3) Vessels transiting the park without 
interruption shall not require a permit. 

(i) How are corals and other 
underwater natural features protected in 
the park? 

(1) Taking, possessing, removing, 
damaging, touching, handling, 
harvesting, disturbing, standing on, or 
otherwise injuring coral, coral 
formation, seagrass or other living or 
dead organisms, including marine 
invertebrates, live rock, and shells, is 
prohibited. 

(2) Vessel operators are prohibited 
from allowing their vessel to strike, 
injure, or damage coral, seagrass, or any 
other immobile organism attached to the 
seabed. 

(3) Vessel operators are prohibited 
from allowing an anchor, chain, rope or 
other mooring device to be cast, 

dragged, or placed so as to strike, break, 
abrade, or otherwise cause damage to 
coral formations, sea grass, or 
submerged cultural resources. 

(j) What restrictions apply on or near 
shipwrecks? 

(1) No person may destroy, molest, 
remove, deface, displace, or tamper with 
wrecked or abandoned vessels of any 
type or condition, or any cargo 
pertaining thereto. 

(2) Surveying, inventorying, 
dismantling, or recovering any wreck or 
cargo within the boundaries of the park 
is prohibited unless permitted in 
writing by the Superintendent. 

(k) How are aircraft operations 
restricted? 

(1) Landing an aircraft in Dry Tortugas 
National Park may occur only in 
accordance with a permit issued by the 
Superintendent under § 1.6 of this 
chapter. 

(2) When landing is authorized by 
permit, the following requirements also 
apply: 

(i) Aircraft may be landed on the 
waters within a radius of 1 mile of 
Garden Key, but a landing or takeoff 
may not be made within 500 feet of 
Garden Key, or within 500 feet of any 
closed area. 

(ii) Operation of aircraft is subject to 
§ 2.17 of this chapter, except that 
seaplanes may be taxied closer than 500 
feet to the Garden Dock while en route 
to or from the designated ramp, north of 
the dock. 

(iii) Seaplanes may be moored or 
brought up on land only on the 
designated beach, north of the Garden 
Key dock. 

Dated: October 2, 2006. 
David M. Verhey, 
Acting Assistant Secretary for Fish and 
Wildlife and Parks. 
[FR Doc. E6–21646 Filed 12–19–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4312–78–P 

NATIONAL ARCHIVES AND RECORDS 
ADMINISTRATION 

36 CFR Part 1280 

[NARA–06–0005] 

RIN 3095–AB55 

Use of NARA Facilities 

AGENCY: National Archives and Records 
Administration (NARA). 
ACTION: Final rule. 

SUMMARY: This final rule revises 
NARA’s policy on the inspection of 
personal property in the possession of a 
contractor, employee, student intern, 
visitor, volunteer or other person on 

NARA properties. Because NARA’s 
current regulations apply specifically 
only to visitors on NARA property, the 
final rule clarifies that all persons 
arriving on, working at, visiting, or 
departing from NARA property are 
subject to the inspection of their 
personal property. The final rule also 
amends NARA’s current regulations to 
include additional properties under 
NARA control. This rule will affect 
members of the public, members of 
Federal agencies, NARA employees, 
NARA contract-employees and NARA 
volunteers. 

DATES: Effective Date: Effective January 
19, 2007. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Jeffrey Landou at 301–837–1899 or fax 
number 301–837–0293. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
proposed rule was published in the 
September 26, 2006, Federal Register 
(71 FR 56919) for a 60-day comment 
period. Notification of user groups 
occurred following publication of the 
proposed rule. NARA received no 
comments on the proposed rule and 
therefore is issuing the final rule with 
no changes. 

This final rule is not a significant 
regulatory action for the purposes of 
Executive Order 12866 and has not been 
reviewed by the Office of Management 
and Budget. As required by the 
Regulatory Flexibility Act, I certify that 
this rule will not have a significant 
impact on a substantial number of small 
entities because the final rule affects 
NARA contractors, employees, student 
interns, visitors, volunteers and other 
persons on NARA controlled property. 
This regulation does not have any 
federalism implications. This rule is not 
a major rule as defined in 5 U.S.C. 
Chapter 8, Congressional Review of 
Agency Rulemaking. 

List of Subjects in 36 CFR Part 1280 

Archives and records. 

� For the reasons set forth in the 
preamble, NARA amends part 1280 of 
title 36, Code of Federal Regulations as 
follows: 

PART 1280—USE OF NARA 
FACILITIES 

� 1. The authority citation for part 1280 
continues to read as follows: 

Authority: 44 U.S.C. 2104(a). 

� 2. Revise the heading for part 1280 to 
read as set forth above: 
� 3. Amend § 1280.2 to add paragraphs 
(d), (e), and (f) to read as follows: 
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§ 1280.2 What property is under the 
control of the Archivist of the United 
States? 

* * * * * 
(d) The National Archives Southwest 

Region. The National Archives 
Southeast Region in Morrow, Georgia as 
specified in 36 CFR 1253.7 (e). 

(e) The Federal Records Centers. The 
Federal Records Centers in Ellenwood, 
Georgia, and Riverside, California, as 
specified in 36 CFR 1253.6 (d) and (l), 
respectively. 

(f) Additional Facilities. As other 
properties come under the control of the 
Archivist of the United States, they will 
be listed in these regulations as soon as 
practicable. 

§§ 1280.4, 1280.6 and 1280.8 
[Redesignated as §§ 1280.6, 1280.8 and 
1280.4] 

� 4. In Subpart A, redesignate §§ 1280.4, 
1280.6 and 1280.8 as §§ 1280.6, 1280.8 
and 1280.4, respectively. 
� 5. Revise newly designated § 1280.4 to 
read as follows: 

§ 1280.4 What items are subject to 
inspection by NARA? 

NARA may, at its discretion, inspect 
the personal property in the possession 
of any NARA contractor, employee, 
student intern, visitor, volunteer, or 
other person arriving on, working at, 
visiting, or departing from NARA 
property. 

Dated: December 13, 2006. 
Allen Weinstein, 
Archivist of the United States. 
[FR Doc. E6–21682 Filed 12–19–06; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7515–01–P 

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION 
AGENCY 

40 CFR Part 180 

[EPA–HQ–OPP–2006–0282; FRL–8105–1] 

Myclobutanil; Pesticide Tolerance 

AGENCY: Environmental Protection 
Agency (EPA). 
ACTION: Final rule. 

SUMMARY: This regulation establishes 
tolerances for combined residues of 
myclobutanil in or on hops, soybean 
seed, soybean forage, soybean hay, 
aspirated grain fractions, and soybean 
refined oil. Interregional Research 
Project #4 (IR–4) requested the tolerance 
for hops and Dow AgroSciences 
requested the tolerances for the soybean 
commodities under the Federal Food, 
Drug, and Cosmetic Act (FFDCA), as 
amended by the Food Quality Protection 
Act of 1996 (FQPA). 

DATES: This regulation is effective 
December 20, 2006. Objections and 
requests for hearings must be received 
on or before February 20, 2007, and 
must be filed in accordance with the 
instructions provided in 40 CFR part 
178 (see also Unit I.C. of the 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION). 
ADDRESSES: EPA has established a 
docket for this action under docket 
identification (ID) number EPA–HQ– 
OPP–2006–0282. All documents in the 
docket are listed in the index for the 
docket. Although listed in the index, 
some information is not publicly 
available, e.g., Confidential Business 
Information (CBI) or other information 
whose disclosure is restricted by statute. 
Certain other material, such as 
copyrighted material, is not placed on 
the Internet and will be publicly 
available only in hard copy form. 
Publicly available docket materials are 
available in the electronic docket at 
http://www.regulations.gov, or, if only 
available in hard copy, at the OPP 
Regulatory Public Docket in Rm. S– 
4400, One Potomac Yard (South 
Building), 2777 S. Crystal Drive, 
Arlington, VA. The Docket Facility is 
open from 8:30 a.m. to 4 p.m., Monday 
through Friday, excluding legal 
holidays. The Docket telephone number 
is (703) 305–5805. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Barbara Madden, Registration Division 
(7505P), Office of Pesticide Programs, 
Environmental Protection Agency, 1200 
Pennsylvania Ave., NW., Washington, 
DC 20460–0001; telephone number: 
(703) 305–6463; e-mail address: 
madden.barbara@epa.gov. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. General Information 

A. Does this Action Apply to Me? 
You may be potentially affected by 

this action if you are an agricultural 
producer, food manufacturer, or 
pesticide manufacturer. Potentially 
affected entities may include, but are 
not limited to: 

• Crop production (NAICS 111), e.g., 
agricultural workers; greenhouse, 
nursery, and floriculture workers; 
farmers. 

• Animal production (NAICS 112), 
e.g., cattle ranchers and farmers, dairy 
cattle farmers, livestock farmers. 

• Food manufacturing (NAICS 311), 
e.g., agricultural workers; farmers; 
greenhouse, nursery, and floriculture 
workers; ranchers; pesticide applicators. 

• Pesticide manufacturing (NAICS 
32532), e.g., agricultural workers; 
commercial applicators; farmers; 
greenhouse, nursery, and floriculture 
workers; residential users. 

This listing is not intended to be 
exhaustive, but rather provides a guide 
for readers regarding entities likely to be 
affected by this action. Other types of 
entities not listed in this unit could also 
be affected. The North American 
Industrial Classification System 
(NAICS) codes have been provided to 
assist you and others in determining 
whether this action might apply to 
certain entities. If you have any 
questions regarding the applicability of 
this action to a particular entity, consult 
the person listed under FOR FURTHER 
INFORMATION CONTACT. 

B. How Can I Access Electronic Copies 
of this Document? 

In addition to accessing an electronic 
copy of this Federal Register document 
through the electronic docket at http:// 
www.regulations.gov, you may access 
this Federal Register document 
electronically through the EPA Internet 
under the ‘‘Federal Register’’ listings at 
http://www.epa.gov/fedrgstr. You may 
also access a frequently updated 
electronic version of 40 CFR part 180 
through the Government Printing 
Office’s pilot e-CFR site at http:// 
www.gpoaccess.gov/ecfr. 

C. Can I File an Objection or Hearing 
Request? 

Under section 408(g) of the FFDCA, as 
amended by the FQPA, any person may 
file an objection to any aspect of this 
regulation and may also request a 
hearing on those objections. The EPA 
procedural regulations which govern the 
submission of objections and requests 
for hearings appear in 40 CFR part 178. 
You must file your objection or request 
a hearing on this regulation in 
accordance with the instructions 
provided in 40 CFR part 178. To ensure 
proper receipt by EPA, you must 
identify docket ID number EPA–HQ– 
OPP–2006–0282 in the subject line on 
the first page of your submission. All 
requests must be in writing, and must be 
mailed or delivered to the Hearing Clerk 
on or before February 20, 2007. 

In addition to filing an objection or 
hearing request with the Hearing Clerk 
as described in 40 CFR part 178, please 
submit a copy of the filing that does not 
contain any CBI for inclusion in the 
public docket that is described in 
ADDRESSES. Information not marked 
confidential pursuant to 40 CFR part 2 
may be disclosed publicly by EPA 
without prior notice. Submit your 
copies, identified by docket ID number 
EPA–HQ–OPP–2006–0282, by one of 
the following methods: 

• Federal eRulemaking Portal: http:// 
www.regulations.gov. Follow the on-line 
instructions for submitting comments. 
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