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Exchange Commission, 100 F Street NE, 
Washington, DC 20549, (202) 551–5400. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Correction 

In the Federal Register of May 22, 
2025, in FR Doc. 2025–09178, on page 
21975, in the third column, in the 
heading, correct the agency docket 
number to read ‘‘[Release No. 34– 
103052; File No. SR–NYSETEX–2025– 
09]’’. 

Dated: June 9, 2025. 
Sherry R. Haywood, 
Assistant Secretary. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10925 Filed 6–13–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8011–01–P 

SMALL BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION 

Data Collection Available for Public 
Comments 

ACTION: 60-day notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Small Business 
Administration (SBA) intends to request 
approval from the Office of Management 
and Budget (OMB) for the collection of 
information described below. The 
Paperwork Reduction Act (PRA) 
requires Federal agencies to publish a 
notice in the Federal Register 
concerning each proposed collection of 
information before submission to OMB 
and to allow 60 days for public 
comment in response to the notice. This 
notice complies with that requirement. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before 
August 15, 2025 
ADDRESSES: Send all comments to 
Donna Peebles, Chief of Policy, Analysis 
and Evaluations, Office of 
Entrepreneurial Development, Small 
Business Administration, at OED@
SBA.gov. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Donna Peebles, Office of 
Entrepreneurial Development, Small 
Business Administration, at 
Donna.Peebles@sba.gov, 202–401–1580, 
and Shauniece Carter, Agency Clearance 
Officer, Shauniece.carter@sba.gov, (202) 
935–6942. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
recipients of SBA counseling and 
training grant awards are required by 
the terms of their Notice of Award and 
as outlined in each Program 
Announcement, to collect the 
information on SBA Form 641 
(Counseling Information Form) from 
each small business or prospective 
small business that receives one-on-one 
counseling or advising, and to collect 

the information on SBA Form 888 
(Management Training Report) for each 
group training session. SBA’s Resource 
Partners submit this information to SBA 
via the Nexus system. The information 
is pertinent to management’s analysis of 
each OED program or activity funded by 
SBA and assists SBA in evaluating the 
impact of each program or activity. The 
information is also used to support 
SBA’s budget requests, performance 
plans, evaluations, and other 
submissions made to the Office of 
Management and Budget, the President, 
and the Congress. 

Solicitation of Public Comments 

SBA is requesting comments on (a) 
whether the collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to properly 
perform its functions; (b) whether the 
burden estimates are accurate; (c) 
whether there are ways to minimize the 
burden, including through the use of 
automated techniques or other forms of 
information technology; and (d) whether 
there are ways to enhance the quality, 
utility, and clarity of the information. 

Summary of Information Collection 

PRA Number: 3245–0324. 
(1) Title: Entrepreneurial 

Development Nexus information system 
Counseling Information Form & 
Management Training Report. 

Description of Respondents: SBA’s 
Resource Partners, small businesses, 
and prospective small businesses. 

Form Numbers: 641 and 888. 
Total Estimated Annual Responses: 

1,633,000. 
Total Estimated Annual Hour Burden: 

484,666. 

Shauniece Carter, 
Agency Clearance Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10928 Filed 6–13–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 8026–09–P 

SURFACE TRANSPORTATION BOARD 

Release of Waybill Data 

The Surface Transportation Board has 
received a request from Thompson Hine 
and Escalation Consultants, on behalf of 
the American Chemistry Council (ACC), 
(WB25–33—06/09/25) for permission to 
use select data from the Board’s 2023 
unmasked Carload Waybill Samples. A 
copy of this request may be obtained 
from the Board’s website under docket 
no. WB25–33. 

The waybill sample contains 
confidential railroad and shipper data; 
therefore, if any parties object to these 
requests, they should file their 
objections with the Director of the 

Board’s Office of Economics within 14 
calendar days of the date of this notice. 
The rules for release of waybill data are 
codified at 49 CFR 1244.9. 

Any inquiries on this request should 
be directed to waybill@stb.gov. 

Brendetta Jones, 
Clearance Clerk. 
[FR Doc. 2025–11054 Filed 6–13–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4915–01–P 

OFFICE OF THE UNITED STATES 
TRADE REPRESENTATIVE 

[Docket Number USTR–2025–0014] 

Request for Comments Concerning the 
Biennial Review of Country Eligibility 
for Benefits Under the Caribbean Basin 
Initiative for Calendar Year 2025 

AGENCY: Office of the United States 
Trade Representative. 
ACTION: Notice and request for 
comments. 

SUMMARY: The Office of the United 
States Trade Representative (USTR) has 
to submit a report to Congress regarding 
the operation of the Caribbean Basin 
Initiative (CBI) on or before December 
31, 2025. The Trade Policy Staff 
Committee (TPSC) invites comments 
concerning the operation of the CBI, 
including the performance of each 
beneficiary country and whether they 
are meeting the criteria pursuant to the 
CBI, to assist in preparing the report to 
Congress on the operation of the CBI 
program. 

DATES: The deadline for the submission 
of written comments is 11:59 p.m. EDT 
on July 16, 2025. 
ADDRESSES: You should submit written 
comments through the Federal 
eRulemaking Portal: https:// 
www.regulations.gov (Regulations.gov), 
using docket number USTR–2025–0014. 
Follow the instructions for submissions 
in parts III and IV below. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: For 
procedural questions concerning written 
comments and for alternatives to online 
submissions, please contact Darrian 
Frazier, Office of the Western 
Hemisphere, at Darrian.B.Frazier@
ustr.eop.gov or 202.881.9469 in advance 
of the deadline and before transmitting 
a comment. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Background 

Together, the Caribbean Basin 
Economic Recovery Act (CBERA), and 
the Caribbean Basin Trade Partnership 
Act (CBTPA) (19 U.S.C. 2701 et seq.) 
commonly are referred to as the 
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Caribbean Basin Initiative (CBI). Section 
212(f)(1) of the CBERA, as amended (19 
U.S.C. 2702(f)(1)) requires the U.S. 
Trade Representative to report on the 
performance of each CBERA or CBTPA 
beneficiary country. Barbados, Belize, 
Curacao, Guyana, Haiti, Jamaica, Saint 
Lucia, and Trinidad and Tobago receive 
benefits under both CBERA and CBTPA. 
Antigua and Barbuda, Aruba, The 
Bahamas, British Virgin Islands, 
Dominica, Grenada, Montserrat, Saint 
Kitts and Nevis, and Saint Vincent and 
the Grenadines currently receive 
benefits only under CBERA. For the 
purposes of this report, the term 
‘beneficiary country’ includes both the 
independent countries and dependent 
territories receiving benefits under 
CBTPA or CBERA. 

As described in more detail below, 
the TPSC seeks comments on any aspect 
of the CBI’s operation, including the 
performance of CBERA, and CBTPA 
beneficiary countries under the criteria 
described in sections 212(b), 212(c), and 
213(b)(5)(B) of the CBERA, as amended. 
You can access the criteria at https:// 
www.gpo.gov/fdsys/pkg/USCODE-2011- 
title19/html/USCODE-2011-title19- 
chap15.htm. The report also will 
examine the CBI’s effect on the volume 
and composition of trade and 
investment between the United States 
and the CBI beneficiary countries and 
on advancing U.S. trade policy goals. 
You can access the most recent CBI 
report at https://ustr.gov/sites/default/ 
files/IssueAreas/Preference%
20Programs/ 
2023%20Caribbean%20Basin%
20Economic%
20Recovery%20Act%20Report%
20FINAL.pdf. 

II. Reporting Requirements on the 
Eligibility Criteria for All CBI 
Beneficiary Countries 

The TPSC seeks comments on any 
aspect of the CBI’s operation, including 
the performance of CBERA and CBTPA 
beneficiary countries using the 
following criteria: 

A. CBERA ‘‘Mandatory’’ Criteria 

Under section 212(b) (19 U.S.C. 
2702(b)), the President may not 
designate a country as a CBI beneficiary 
country that: 

1. Is a Communist country. 
2. Has nationalized, expropriated, or 

otherwise seized property, enforces 
taxes or other measures for said 
outcome, or is canceling any existing 
contract, agreement, patent, trademark, 
or other intellectual property of a U.S. 
citizen or corporation, partnership, or 
association unless the President 

determines that the country is taking 
steps to resolve the citizen’s claim. 

3. Fails to act in good faith in 
recognizing as binding or in enforcing 
arbitral awards in favor of U.S. citizens 
or corporations owned by U.S. citizens. 

4. Affords preferential treatment to 
the products of a developed country 
other than the United States that has, or 
is likely to have, a significant adverse 
effect on U.S. commerce, unless the 
President has received satisfactory 
assurances that the country will 
eliminate the preferential treatment or 
acts to assure that there will be no 
significant adverse effect. 

5. Engages in the broadcast of 
copyrighted material, including films or 
television material belonging to United 
States copyright owners without their 
express consent. 

6. Is not a signatory to a treaty, 
convention, protocol, or other 
agreement regarding the extradition of 
U.S. citizens. 

7. Has not or is not taking steps to 
afford internationally recognized worker 
rights as defined in section 507(4) of the 
Trade Act of 1974, as amended (19 
U.S.C. 2467(4)) to workers in the 
country (including any designated zone 
in that country). 

The criteria listed in items 1, 2, 3, 5, 
and 7 above do not prevent a country’s 
designation as a beneficiary country if 
the President determines that 
designation is in the national economic 
or security interest. 

B. CBERA ‘‘Discretionary’’ Factors 

Under section 212(c) (19 U.S.C. 
2702(c)), the President must take into 
account the following factors in 
determining whether to designate any 
country as a CBI beneficiary country: 

1. An expression of a country’s desire 
to be so designated. 

2. The economic conditions and 
living standards in a country, and other 
economic factors the President deems 
appropriate. 

3. The extent to which a country has 
assured the United States that it will 
provide equitable and reasonable access 
to the markets and basic commodity 
resources of the country. 

4. The degree to which a country 
follows the international trade rules of 
the World Trade Organization and 
multilateral trade agreements. 

5. The degree to which a country uses 
export subsidies or imposes export 
performance requirements or local 
content requirements that distort 
international trade. 

6. The degree to which the trade 
policies of a country as they relate to 
other beneficiary countries are 

contributing to the revitalization of the 
region. 

7. The degree to which a country is 
undertaking self-help measures to 
promote its own economic 
development. 

8. Whether or not a country has taken 
or is taking steps to afford to workers in 
that country (including any designated 
zone in that country) internationally 
recognized worker rights. 

9. The extent to which a country 
provides under its law adequate and 
effective means for foreign nationals to 
secure, exercise, and enforce exclusive 
intellectual property rights, including 
patent, trademark, and copyright rights. 

10. The extent to which a country 
prohibits its nationals from engaging in 
the broadcasting copyrighted materials, 
including film and television material, 
belonging to U.S. copyright owners 
without their express consent. 

11. The extent to which a country is 
prepared to cooperate with the United 
States in the administration of CBI 
preferences. 

C. CBTPA Eligibility Criteria 

Under section 213(b)(5)(B) (19 U.S.C. 
2703(b)(5)(B)), in considering the 
eligibility of the CBI countries and 
dependent territories that have 
expressed an interest in receiving the 
enhanced preferences of the CBTPA, the 
President must take into account the 
existing eligibility criteria of the 
CBERA, as well as several additional 
revised criteria elaborated in the 
CBTPA. These additional criteria are: 

1. Whether the beneficiary country 
has demonstrated a commitment to 
undertake its obligations under the 
World Trade Organization on or ahead 
of schedule and participate in 
negotiations toward the completion of 
the Free Trade Area of the Americas 
(FTAA) or another free trade agreement. 

2. The extent to which the country 
provides protection of intellectual 
property rights consistent with or 
greater than the protection afforded 
under the Agreement on Trade-Related 
Aspects of Intellectual Property Rights. 

3. The extent to which the country 
provides internationally recognized 
worker rights, including: the right of 
association; the right to organize and 
bargain collectively; a prohibition on 
the use of any form of forced or 
compulsory labor; a minimum age for 
the employment of children; and 
acceptable conditions of work with 
respect to minimum wages, hours of 
work, and occupational safety and 
health. 

4. Whether the country has 
implemented its commitments to 
eliminate the worst forms of child labor, 
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as defined in section 507(6) of the Trade 
Act of 1974, as amended (19 U.S.C. 
2467(6)). 

5. The extent to which the country 
has met U.S. counter-narcotics 
certification criteria under the Foreign 
Assistance Act of 1961. 

6. The extent to which the country 
has taken steps to become a party to and 
implement the Inter-American 
Convention Against Corruption. 

7. The extent to which the country 
applies transparent, nondiscriminatory, 
and competitive procedures in 
government procurement, and 
contributes to efforts in international 
fora to develop and implement rules on 
transparency in government 
procurement. 

III. Requirements for Submissions 
To be assured of consideration, 

submit your written comments by the 
July 16, 2025 11:59 p.m. EDT deadline. 
All submissions must be in English. The 
TPSC strongly encourages submissions 
via Regulations.gov, using Docket 
Number USTR–2025–0014. The TPSC 
will not accept hand-delivered 
submissions. 

To make a submission via 
Regulations.gov, enter Docket Number 
USTR–2025–0014 in the ‘search for’ 
field on the home page and click 
‘search.’ The site will provide a search 
results page listing all documents 
associated with this docket. Find a 
reference to this notice by selecting 
‘notice’ under ‘document type’ in the 
‘refine documents results’ section on the 
left side of the screen and click the 
‘comment’ link. 

Regulations.gov allows users to make 
submissions by filling in a ‘type 
comment’ field or by attaching a 
document using the ‘upload file’ field. 
The TPSC prefers that you provide 
submissions in an attached document 
and note ‘see attached’ in the ‘comment’ 
field on the online submission form. 
The TPSC prefers submissions in 
Microsoft Word (.docx) or Adobe 
Acrobat (.pdf). If you use an application 
other than those two, please indicate the 
name of the application in the ‘type 
comment’ field. 

You must identify on the first page of 
the submission the subject matter of the 
comment as the ‘‘CBI Report to 
Congress.’’ File names should reflect the 
name of the person or entity submitting 
the comments. Please do not attach 
separate cover letters, exhibits, annexes, 
or other attachments to electronic 
submissions. Instead, to the extent 
possible, please include these in the 
same file as the comment itself, rather 
than submitting them as separate files. 
Submissions should not exceed 30 

single-spaced, standard letter-size pages 
in 12-point type, including attachments. 

You will receive a tracking number 
upon completion of the submission 
procedure at Regulations.gov. The 
tracking number is confirmation that 
Regulations.gov received your 
submission. Keep the confirmation for 
your records. 

The TPSC is not able to provide 
technical assistance for Regulations.gov. 
For further information on using 
Regulations.gov, please consult the 
resources provided on the website by 
clicking on ‘How to Use 
Regulations.gov’ on the bottom of the 
home page. The TPSC may not consider 
submissions that you do not make in 
accordance with these instructions. 

If you are unable to provide 
submissions as requested, please contact 
Darrian Frazier, Office of the Western 
Hemisphere, at Darrian.B.Frazier@
ustr.eop.gov or 202.881.9469, to arrange 
for an alternative method of 
transmission. General information about 
USTR is available at www.ustr.gov. 

IV. Business Confidential Information 
(BCI) 

If you ask the TPSC to treat 
information you submit as BCI, you 
must certify that the information is 
business confidential and you would 
not customarily release it to the public. 
For any comments submitted 
electronically that contain BCI, the file 
name of the business confidential 
version should begin with the characters 
‘BCI.’ You must clearly mark any page 
containing BCI with ‘BUSINESS 
CONFIDENTIAL’ at the top of that page. 
Additionally, you must include 
‘Business Confidential’ in the ‘type 
comment’ field. Filers of submissions 
containing BCI also must submit a 
public version of their submission that 
will be placed in the docket for public 
inspection. The file name of the public 
version should begin with the character 
‘P.’ The TPSC will post the non- 
confidential version in the docket and it 
will be open to public inspection. 

V. Public Viewing of Review 
Submissions 

USTR will post written submissions 
in the docket for public inspection, 
except properly designated BCI. You 
can view submissions at 
Regulations.gov by entering Docket 

Number USTR–2025–0014 in the search 
field on the home page. 

Edward Marcus, 
Chair of the Trade Policy Staff Committee, 
Office of the United States Trade 
Representative. 
[FR Doc. 2025–10953 Filed 6–13–25; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3390–F4–P 

DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 

Federal Aviation Administration 

Noise Compatibility Program for 
Laredo International Airport, Webb 
County, Texas; Correction 

AGENCY: Federal Aviation 
Administration, DOT. 
ACTION: Notice of acceptance of a noise 
exposure map. 

SUMMARY: The Federal Aviation 
Administration published a document 
in the Federal Register of April 3, 2025, 
notifying the public of the approval of 
the noise compatibility program at 
Laredo International Airport (LRD). The 
document contained references to an 
incorrect date for City of Laredo noise 
exposure maps (NEM) submittal. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: John 
MacFarlane, Regional Environmental 
Program Manager, Airports Division, 
Federal Aviation Administration, 10101 
Hillwood Parkway, Fort Worth, TX 
76177. Phone Number: 817–222–5681. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Correction 

In the Federal Register of April 3, 
2025, in Vol. 90 No. 63, on page 14681, 
correct the first column second 
paragraph of SUPPLEMENTARY 
INFORMATION to read: 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On June 
30, 2022, City of Laredo submitted noise 
exposure maps (NEMs), descriptions 
and other supporting documentation for 
Laredo International Airport, for FAA’s 
review and acceptance. An NEM must 
include a description of estimated 
aircraft operations during a forecast 
period that is at least five years in the 
future and how those operations will 
affect the map and other information. 
The FAA completed its review of the 
NEMs and supporting documentation 
and determined the NEMs comply with 
the applicable statutory and regulatory 
requirements. That determination was 
effective on August 25, 2022. FAA’s 
determinations for the NEMs submitted 
by City of Laredo is limited to a finding 
that the maps were developed in 
accordance with 49 U.S.C. 47503 and 
the procedures in Appendix A of 14 
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