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FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Heidi Yoo, The Office of Docket 
Services, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, telephone (202) 205–1802. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Scope of Investigation: Having 
considered the complaint, the U.S. 
International Trade Commission, on 
July 15, 2024, ordered that— 

(1) Pursuant to subsection (b) of 
section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended, an investigation be instituted 
to determine whether there is a 
violation of subsection (a)(1)(B) of 
section 337 in the importation into the 
United States, the sale for importation, 
or the sale within the United States after 
importation of certain products 
identified in paragraph (2) by reason of 
infringement of one or more of claims 
1–5 and 7–11 of the ’026 patent; claims 
1–23 of the ’952 patent; and claims 1– 
9, 11, and 13–16 of the ’167 patent, and 
whether an industry in the United 
States exists as required by subsection 
(a)(2) of section 337; 

(2) Pursuant to section 210.10(b)(1) of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 19 C FR 210.10(b)(1), the 
plain language description of the 
accused products or category of accused 
products, which defines the scope of the 
investigation, is ‘‘interlockable storage 
containers and toolboxes, organizers, 
component boxes, and coolers’’; 

(3) For the purpose of the 
investigation so instituted, the following 
are hereby named as parties upon which 
this notice of investigation shall be 
served: 

(a) The complainants are: 
Milwaukee Electric Tool Corporation, 

13135 West Lisbon Road, Brookfield, 
WI 53005–2550 

Keter Home and Garden Products Ltd., 
2 Sapir Street, Industrial Zone, 
Herzliya, Israel 4685206 
(b) The respondent is the following 

entity alleged to be in violation of 
section 337, and is the party upon 
which the complaint is to be served: 
Klein Tools, Inc., 450 Bond Street, 

Lincolnshire, IL 60069 
(4) For the investigation so instituted, 

the Chief Administrative Law Judge, 
U.S. International Trade Commission, 
shall designate the presiding 
Administrative Law Judge. 

The Office of Unfair Import 
Investigations will not participate as a 
party in this investigation. 

Responses to the complaint and the 
notice of investigation must be 
submitted by the named respondent in 
accordance with section 210.13 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 19 CFR 210.13. Pursuant to 
19 CFR 201.16(e) and 210.13(a), as 

amended in 85 FR 15798 (March 19, 
2020), such responses will be 
considered by the Commission if 
received not later than 20 days after the 
date of service by the complainants of 
the complaint and the notice of 
investigation. Extensions of time for 
submitting responses to the complaint 
and the notice of investigation will not 
be granted unless good cause therefor is 
shown. 

Failure of the respondent to file a 
timely response to each allegation in the 
complaint and in this notice may be 
deemed to constitute a waiver of the 
right to appear and contest the 
allegations of the complaint and this 
notice, and to authorize the 
administrative law judge and the 
Commission, without further notice to 
the respondent, to find the facts to be as 
alleged in the complaint and this notice 
and to enter an initial determination 
and a final determination containing 
such findings, and may result in the 
issuance of an exclusion order or a cease 
and desist order or both directed against 
the respondent. 

Authority: The authority for 
institution of this investigation is 
contained in section 337 of the Tariff 
Act of 1930, as amended, 19 U.S.C. 
1337, and in section 210.10 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure, 19 CFR 210.10 (2024). 

By order of the Commission. 
Issued: July 15, 2024. 

Lisa Barton, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. 2024–15890 Filed 7–18–24; 8:45 am] 
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SUMMARY: The Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, Department of Justice (DOJ) 
will be submitting the following 
information collection request to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 

DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
September 17, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have comments especially on the 
estimated public burden or associated 
response time, suggestions, or need a 
copy of the proposed information 
collection instrument with instructions 
or additional information, please 
contact Sean E. Goodison (email: 
Sean.Goodison@usdoj.gov; telephone: 
202–307–0765), Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, 810 Seventh Street NW, 
Washington, DC 20531. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 
Abstract: The LEMAS core survey, 

conducted every 3 to 4 years since 1987, 
is currently based on a nationally 
representative sample of approximately 
3,500 general-purpose law enforcement 
agencies (LEAs). The 2024 LEMAS has 
been revised to remove questions to 
help reduce burden and increase clarity. 
The LEMAS survey has been used to 
produce national estimates for a wide 
range of topics, including LEA 
responsibilities, operating expenditures, 
job functions of sworn and civilian 
employees, officer salaries and special 
pay, demographic characteristics of 
officers, weapons policies, education 
and training requirements, special units, 
and community policing activities. BJS 
plans to publish this information in 
reports and reference it when 
responding to queries from the U.S. 
Congress, Executive Office of the 
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President, the U.S. Supreme Court, state 
officials, international organizations, 
researchers, students, the media, and 
others interested in criminal justice 
statistics. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

1. Type of Information Collection: 
Reinstatement, with change, of a 
previously approved collection. 

2. Title of the Form/Collection: 2024 
Law Enforcement Management and 
Administrative Statistics (LEMAS) 
survey. 

3. Agency form number, if any, and 
the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
The form number for the questionnaire 

is CJ–44. The applicable component 
within the Department of Justice is the 
Bureau of Justice Statistics (BJS), in the 
Office of Justice Programs. 

4. Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as the 
obligation to respond: State and local 
government. Respondents will be 
general purpose state, county, and local 
law enforcement agencies (LEAs), 
including local and county police 
departments, sheriff’s offices, and 
primary state law enforcement agencies. 
The 2024 LEMAS is revised from the 
2020 LEMAS. The obligation to respond 
is voluntary. 

5. An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 

respond: An agency-level survey will be 
sent to approximately 3,500 LEAs. We 
estimate responses from 81% (2,835) of 
LEAs sampled for the 2024 LEMAS. The 
expected burden placed on these 
respondents is 110 minutes spent on 
completing the survey. Additionally, an 
estimated 50% of respondents (1,417) 
will be contacted for data quality 
follow-up at 10 minutes per respondent. 

6. An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: There are an estimated 5,435 
total burden hours associated with this 
information collection. 

7. An estimate of the total annual cost 
burden associated with the collection, if 
applicable: $360,500. 

TOTAL ESTIMATED BURDEN HOURS 

Activity Number of 
respondents Frequency Total annual 

responses 

Participation 
time 

(minutes) 

Total annual 
burden 
(hours) 

Data collection ..................................................................... 2,835 1 2,835 110 5,198 
Data quality follow-up .......................................................... 1,417 1 1,417 10 237 

Total .............................................................................. 2,835 ........................ 2,835 ........................ 5,435 

If additional information is required, 
contact: Darwin Arceo, Department 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Two Constitution 
Square, 145 N Street NE, 4W–218, 
Washington, DC. 

Dated: July 16, 2024. 
Darwin Arceo, 
Department Clearance Officer for PRA, U.S. 
Department of Justice. 
[FR Doc. 2024–15932 Filed 7–18–24; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–18–P 

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

[OMB Number 1117–0043] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Proposed eCollection 
eComments Requested; Extension of a 
Previously Approved Collection; Drug 
Use Statement 

AGENCY: Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Department of Justice. 
ACTION: 60-Day notice. 

SUMMARY: The Drug Enforcement 
Administration, Department of Justice 
(DOJ), will be submitting the following 
information collection request to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. 

DATES: Comments are encouraged and 
will be accepted for 60 days until 
September 17, 2024. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: If 
you have additional comments 
especially on the estimated public 
burden or associated response time, 
suggestions, or need a copy of the 
proposed information collection 
instrument with instructions or 
additional information, please contact 
Kannessia Jordan, Section Chief, Office 
of Compliance, Policy Administration 
Section, 700 Army Navy Drive, 
Arlington VA 22202, telephone: 571– 
776–2262, email: Kannessia.S.Jordan@
DEA.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Written 
comments and suggestions from the 
public and affected agencies concerning 
the proposed collection of information 
are encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points: 
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the Bureau of Justice 
Statistics, including whether the 
information will have practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agency’s 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Evaluate whether and if so how the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 

information to be collected can be 
enhanced; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Abstract: The Drug Enforcement 
Administration (DEA) is a federal law 
enforcement agency charged with 
enforcing the controlled substances laws 
and regulations of the United States. Its 
principal responsibilities include 
investigation and prosecution of major 
violators of controlled substances laws. 

Because of the nature of DEA’s 
mission, and its status as a law 
enforcement agency, past use of illegal 
drugs by potential employees presents 
special concerns, and therefore the 
agency evaluates a job applicant’s illegal 
drug use and abuse during the 
application process. Executive Order 
12564 is supported in the DEA Pre- 
Employment Drug Policy that a history 
of illegal drug use or abuse may be a 
disqualification for employment with 
DEA. 

This new form notifies job applicants 
of the DEA Pre-Employment Drug Policy 
and asks them to acknowledge their 
understanding of those requirements to 
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