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Inglis Community Center, 137 Highway 
40 West, Inglis, FL 34449. The purpose 
of that public meeting was to provide 
the public the opportunity to comment, 
either orally or in writing, on the Draft 
EIS. Notification of the meeting was 
announced following same format as the 
Scoping Meetings announcements. 
Comments received in response to the 
Draft EIS have been evaluated and 
incorporated into this Final EIS. 
ADDRESSES: The Final EIS can be viewed 
online at http://kingroadeis.com. Copies 
of the Final EIS are also available for 
review at the following libraries: 

Bronson Public Library—612 E 
Hathaway Ave., Bronson, Florida 32621. 

Cedar Key Public Library—460 
Second Street, Cedar Key, Florida 
32625. 

Luther Callaway Public Library—104 
NE Third Street, Chiefland, Florida 
32626. 

Williston Public Library—10 SE First 
Street, Williston, Florida 32696. 

A.F. Knotts Public Library—11 56th 
Street, Yankeetown, Florida 32698. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr. 
Ed Sarfert, Senior Project Manager, U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers, Jacksonville 
District, 41 N. Jefferson Street, Suite 
301, Pensacola, Florida 32502, 
Telephone: 850–439–9533, Fax: 850– 
433–8160. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Tarmac 
America L.L.C. (Tarmac) proposes to 
construct a limestone mine in Levy 
County, Florida to produce FDOT- and 
commercial-grade limestone aggregate 
for markets within west-central Florida. 
As proposed, direct impacts of up to 
2,069 acres of wetlands and 1,818 acres 
of uplands would occur directly from 
limestone extraction, material 
stockpiling, roads, and other 
infrastructure over a period of 
approximately 100 years. At present, the 
majority of the property is an actively 
managed timber operation, with most of 
the site in varying developmental stages 
of pine plantation and mixed 
hardwood/pine forest. Much of the 
surrounding land is in silviculture use, 
with scattered residential parcels. The 
information compiled in this EIS will be 
used by the USACE to determine 
whether the proposed activities should 
be authorized and permitted by the 
USACE. Tarmac would need to obtain a 
Department of the Army permit 
pursuant to Section 404 of the Clean 
Water Act. This Final EIS evaluates the 
potential environmental impacts 
associated with a no action alternative, 
and seven onsite action alternatives, 
including Tarmac’s preferred alternative 
above. Under the seven other 
alternatives analyzed in the Final EIS, 

mining activities involving discharges of 
fill material in wetlands could be 
authorized for varying acreages and 
lengths of time upon issuance of a 
Record of Decision. 

Dated: August 12, 2013. 
Tori K. White, 
Deputy Chief, Regulatory Division. 
[FR Doc. 2013–19965 Filed 8–15–13; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice of open meeting. 

SUMMARY: In accordance with the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act of 
1972 (5 U.S.C., Appendix, as amended), 
the Government in the Sunshine Act of 
1976 (5 U.S.C. 552b, as amended), and 
41 CFR 102–3, announcement is made 
of the forthcoming meeting. 

Name of Committee: Chief of 
Engineers Environmental Advisory 
Board (EAB). 

Date: September 11, 2013. 
Time: 9:00 a.m. through 12:00 p.m. 
Location: Room 3K10, Headquarters, 

U.S. Army Corps of Engineers, in the 
Government Accountability Office 
(GAO) Building, 441 G Street NW., 
Washington, DC 20548–0002, Phone: 
(202) 512–6000. 

Purpose of the Meeting and Agenda: 
The Board will advise the Chief of 
Engineers on environmental policy, 
identification and resolution of 
environmental issues and missions, and 
addressing challenges, problems and 
opportunities in an environmentally 
sustainable manner. Discussions and 
presentations during this meeting will 
include flow management for 
sustainable river ecosystems; Corps’ 
outreach opportunities in science, 
technology, engineering, and 
mathematics (STEM) education; and 
introduction of a multi-year work plan 
for the Board. The Board will also 
briefly discuss recent site visits and 
completed letter reports. Following 
Board discussions and presentations 
there will be a public comment period. 

Public’s Accessibility to the Meeting: 
This meeting will be open to the public. 
Anyone attending the meeting must 
enter and exit at the G Street visitors 
entrance of the GAO Building, present 
a valid form of government issued photo 
identification (e.g., drivers license, state- 

issued photo ID, or passport), and pass 
through the security screening station. 
All visitors must be escorted while in 
the building. The GAO Building is 
accessible to persons with disabilities. 
Attendees need to arrive in time to 
complete the security screening and 
arrive at the meeting room before 9:00 
a.m. Seating will be limited and on a 
first-come basis. 

The Committee’s Designated Federal 
Officer (DFO) and Point of Contact: Mr. 
John C. Furry, Phone: (202) 761–5875, 
or email john.c.furry@usace.army.mil 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
primary purpose of this meeting is for 
the Chief of Engineers to receive the 
views of his Environmental Advisory 
Board. However, any member of the 
public, including interested 
organizations, may submit written 
comments to the EAB concerning the 
Board’s mission and functions, or in 
response to the stated agenda of the 
meeting. Written statements should be 
sent to the DFO at: Mr. John C. Furry 
(3I23), DFO Chief of Engineers 
Environmental Advisory Board, U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers, 441 G Street 
NW., Washington, DC 20314–1000; or 
emailed to john.c.furry@usace.army.mil. 
Written and emailed statements must be 
received by the DFO no later than five 
working days prior to the meeting in 
order to allow time for Board 
consideration. By rule, no member of 
the public will be allowed to present 
questions from the floor or speak to any 
issue under consideration during the 
deliberative portion of the meeting. 
However, up to thirty minutes will be 
set aside in the agenda for public 
comment. Each statement will be 
limited to 3 minutes. Anyone who 
wishes to speak must register prior to 
the start of the meeting. Registration 
will be near the meeting room entrance 
from 8:30 until 8:55 a.m. The EAB 
operates under the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act, as 
amended, so all submitted comments 
and public presentations will be treated 
as public documents and may be made 
available for public inspection, 
including, but not limited to, being 
posted on the Board’s Web site. 

Brenda S. Bowen, 
Army Federal Register Liaison Officer. 
[FR Doc. 2013–19814 Filed 8–15–13; 8:45 am] 
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