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Dated: August 11, 2022. 
Angela Somma, 
Chief, Endangered Species Division, Office 
of Protected Resources, National Marine 
Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2022–17580 Filed 8–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

National Oceanic and Atmospheric 
Administration 

[RIN 0648–BI58] 

Extension of Public Comment on a 
Supplemental Draft Environmental 
Impact Statement Regarding the 
Makah Tribe’s Request To Hunt 
Eastern North Pacific Gray Whales 

AGENCY: National Marine Fisheries 
Service (NMFS), National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration (NOAA), 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice; extension of public 
comment period. 

SUMMARY: NMFS announces the 
extension of the public comment period 
on the Supplemental Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement on the 
Makah Tribe Request to Hunt Gray 
Whales. We announced a 45-day 
comment period to end on August 15, 
2022. Today, we extend the public 
comment period on the recommended 
decision by 60 days to October 14, 2022. 
Comments previously submitted need 
not be resubmitted. 
DATES: The deadline for the receipt of 
comments is extended from August 15, 
2022 until October 14, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: You may submit comments, 
identified by NOAA–NMFS–2012– 
0104–0454, by any of the following 
methods: 

Electronic Submissions: Submit all 
electronic public comments via the 
Federal eRulemaking Portal http://
www.regulations.gov. 

Email: Submit electronic public 
comments via the following NMFS 
email address: makah2022sdeis.wcr@
noaa.gov. 

Mail: Submit written comments to: 
Grace Ferrara, NMFS West Coast 
Region, 7600 Sand Point Way NE, 
Seattle, WA 98115. 

Instructions: All comments received 
are a part of the public record and will 
generally be posted to http://
www.regulations.gov without change. 
All Personal Identifying Information (for 
example, name, address, etc.) 
voluntarily submitted by the commenter 
may be publicly accessible. Do not 
submit Confidential Business 

Information or otherwise sensitive or 
protected information. 

NMFS will accept anonymous 
comments (enter N/A in the required 
fields, if you wish to remain 
anonymous). You may submit 
attachments to electronic comments in 
Microsoft Word, Excel, WordPerfect, or 
Adobe PDF file formats only. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Grace Ferrara, NMFS Northwest Region, 
(206) 526–6172, makah2022sdeis.wcr@
noaa.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: On July 1, 
2022, NMFS issued a Supplemental 
Draft Environmental Impact Statement 
(SDEIS) regarding the Makah Tribe’s 
request to resume ceremonial and 
subsistence harvest of eastern North 
Pacific gray whales, and announced a 
45-day comment period on the SDEIS. 
During the comment period, we 
received a request to extend the public 
comment period. We considered the 
request and agree to extend the public 
comment period by 60 days. We are 
therefore extending the close of the 
public comment period from August 15, 
2022, to October 14, 2022. 

The SDEIS is available in electronic 
form on the internet at the following 
address: https://www.fisheries.noaa.gov/ 
west-coast/marine-mammal-protection/ 
makah-tribal-whale-hunt. In addition, 
copies of the SDEIS are available on CD 
by contacting Grace Ferrara (see FOR 
FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT). 

Dated: August 11, 2022. 
Kimberly Damon-Randall, 
Director, Office of Protected Resources, 
National Marine Fisheries Service. 
[FR Doc. 2022–17620 Filed 8–15–22; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 3510–22–P 

DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE 

Patent and Trademark Office 

[OMB Control No. 0651–NEW; Docket No. 
PTO–C–2022–0018] 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities; Submission to the Office of 
Management and Budget (OMB) for 
Review and Approval; Comment 
Request; Improving Customer 
Experience (OMB Circular A–11, 
Section 280 Implementation) 

AGENCY: United States Patent and 
Trademark Office, Department of 
Commerce. 
ACTION: Notice; request for comment. 

SUMMARY: The United States Patent and 
Trademark Office (USPTO) will submit 
the following information collection 
request to the Office of Management and 

Budget (OMB) for review and clearance 
in accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, on or after the 
date of publication of this notice. The 
USPTO invites comment on this 
information collection. Public 
comments were previously requested 
via the Federal Register on May 24, 
2022 during a 60-day comment period. 
This notice allows for an additional 30 
days for public comments. 
DATES: Submit comments on or before: 
September 15, 2022. 
ADDRESSES: Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent 
within 30 days of publication of this 
notice to www.reginfo.gov/public/do/ 
PRAMain. Find this particular 
information collection by selecting 
‘‘Currently under 30-day Review—Open 
for Public Comments’’ or by using the 
search function.’’ 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information 
should be directed to: 

• InformationCollection@uspto.gov. 
Include ‘‘0651–New information 
request’’ in the subject line of the 
message. 

• Justin Isaac, Office of the Chief 
Administrative Officer, United States 
Patent and Trademark Office, P.O. Box 
1450, Alexandria, VA 22313–1450; 
phone number: (571) 272–7392. 
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: Improving Customer Experience 
(OMB Circular A–11, Section 280 
Implementation). 

Abstract: A modern, streamlined and 
responsive customer experience means: 
raising government-wide customer 
experience to the average of the private 
sector service industry; developing 
indicators for high-impact Federal 
programs to monitor progress towards 
excellent customer experience and 
mature digital services; and providing 
the structure (including increasing 
transparency) and resources to ensure 
customer experience is a focal point for 
agency leadership. 

This proposed information collection 
activity provides a means to garner 
customer and stakeholder feedback in 
an efficient, timely manner in 
accordance with the Administration’s 
commitment to improving customer 
service delivery as discussed in Section 
280 of OMB Circular A–11 at https://
www.performance.gov/cx/a11-280.pdf. 

As discussed in OMB guidance, 
agencies should identify their highest- 
impact customer journeys (using 
customer volume, annual program cost, 
and/or knowledge of customer priority 
as weighting factors) and select 
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